

EXHIBIT B

Bell & Howell Lodestar Thru 5/21/20

ATTY	HOURS	RATE	TOTAL
SAB	730.9	\$ 1,000.00	\$730,900.00
LTF	32.9	\$ 1,000.00	\$32,900.00
JIM	38.2	\$ 850.00	\$32,470.00
JDA	226.0	\$ 750.00	\$169,500.00
NJD	12.3	\$ 600.00	\$7,380.00
YZK	2,108.2	\$ 575.00	\$1,212,215.00
FJK	14.8	\$ 550.00	\$8,140.00
JAL	3.4	\$ 550.00	\$1,870.00
YOK	1.1	\$ 550.00	\$605.00
PLF	3.0	\$ 525.00	\$1,575.00
AML	187.8	\$ 450.00	\$84,510.00
TAR	31.1	\$ 450.00	\$13,995.00
AFS	552.4	\$ 350.00	\$193,340.00
MSR	11.1	\$ 325.00	\$3,607.50
CBS	7.0	\$ 315.00	\$2,205.00
JCD	6.5	\$ 315.00	\$2,047.50
MAG	12.2	\$ 315.00	\$3,843.00
PPA	9.8	\$ 315.00	\$3,087.00
DLS	11.0	\$ 300.00	\$3,300.00
EMW	135.3	\$ 300.00	\$40,590.00
RSR	193.8	\$ 300.00	\$58,140.00
JLH	0.3	\$ 275.00	\$82.50
MCS	1.4	\$ 275.00	\$385.00
AEL	1.1	\$ 250.00	\$275.00
CRP	3.5	\$ 250.00	\$875.00
SER	114.4	\$ 250.00	\$28,600.00
	4,449.5		\$2,636,437.50

Expenses: \$698,526.06

Total: \$3,334,963.56

Division of Billed Time by Professional Level	
Partners	1,661.6
Associates	2,291.6
Paralegal	496.3

DATE	MATTER	ATTY	DESCRIPTION	TIME	RATE	AMOUNT
2015.05.07	Bell & Howell	YZK	Pre-suit investigation - research product, efficacy reports, and litigation history	3.4	\$575.00	\$1,955.00
2015.05.13	Bell & Howell	YZK	Conf. w/ client & research case	3.2	\$575.00	\$1,840.00
2015.05.14	Bell & Howell	LTF	Discussed demand letter with Yitz Kopel and reviewed letter.	0.2	\$1,000.00	\$200.00
2015.05.14	Bell & Howell	SAB	Revised draft demand letter	0.3	\$1,000.00	\$300.00
2015.05.14	Bell & Howell	YZK	Conf. w/ client re sending me packaging and hard copy of retainer	0.4	\$575.00	\$230.00
2015.05.14	Bell & Howell	YZK	Conduct research re claims and draft CLRA letter	2.6	\$575.00	\$1,495.00
2015.05.14	Bell & Howell	DLS	Prepared CLRA Letter for certified return receipt and mailed	0.7	\$300.00	\$210.00
2015.05.14	Bell & Howell	CRP	Mailed box to client for materials (.5)	0.5	\$250.00	\$125.00
2015.05.20	Bell & Howell	YZK	Order products	0.2	\$575.00	\$115.00
2015.05.22	Bell & Howell	YZK	Conf. w/ new client re case	1.2	\$575.00	\$690.00
2015.05.27	Bell & Howell	YZK	Look into CLRA letter receipts & calendar dates accordingly	0.2	\$575.00	\$115.00
2015.05.27	Bell & Howell	YZK	Respond to client inquiry	0.4	\$575.00	\$230.00
2015.05.28	Bell & Howell	YZK	Research available claims under TX law	0.9	\$575.00	\$517.50
2015.06.01	Bell & Howell	AML	Conduct legal research for complaint	1.0	\$450.00	\$450.00
2015.06.02	Bell & Howell	YZK	Pre-suit investigation and conf. w/ AML re preliminary research and drafting complaint	2.3	\$575.00	\$1,322.50
2015.06.02	Bell & Howell	AML	Compiled research re claims to assert and litigation history of other cases	3.5	\$450.00	\$1,575.00
2015.06.03	Bell & Howell	PLF	Discussed complaint with AML and YZK (0.5)	0.5	\$525.00	\$262.50
2015.06.03	Bell & Howell	AML	Review scholarly literature re ultrasonic technology	5.3	\$450.00	\$2,385.00
2015.06.04	Bell & Howell	YZK	Conf. w/ Debbie re CLRA receipt	0.3	\$575.00	\$172.50
2015.06.04	Bell & Howell	PLF	Discussed complaint with AML (0.5)	0.5	\$525.00	\$262.50
2015.06.04	Bell & Howell	AML	Review history of FTC actions and look up dockets for those cases & review similar legal action against ultrasonic manufacturers (7); Research re: Privity req's for Implied Warranty of Merchantability in TX and CA (0.6); TX DTPA research (0.6)	8.2	\$450.00	\$3,690.00
2015.06.05	Bell & Howell	YZK	Review and comment on draft complaint	2.6	\$575.00	\$1,495.00
2015.06.05	Bell & Howell	AML	Compile additional scientific support and continue fixing complaint	5.9	\$450.00	\$2,655.00
2015.06.08	Bell & Howell	AML	Compiled photographs for complaint (1); Made edits to draft (2.2)	3.2	\$450.00	\$1,440.00
2015.06.10	Bell & Howell	YZK	Review draft complaint, conf. w/ AML re same	1.5	\$575.00	\$862.50
2015.06.10	Bell & Howell	AML	Spoke with Y. Kopel re: complaint corrections	0.3	\$450.00	\$135.00
2015.06.12	Bell & Howell	YZK	Respond to prospective client inquiry	0.9	\$575.00	\$517.50
2015.06.15	Bell & Howell	SAB	Revised draft complaint	2.0	\$1,000.00	\$2,000.00
2015.06.16	Bell & Howell	YZK	Conf w/ clients	0.5	\$575.00	\$287.50
2015.06.16	Bell & Howell	YZK	Revise complaint	1.1	\$575.00	\$632.50
2015.06.16	Bell & Howell	AML	Corrected/added DTPA section to complaint (3.5)	3.5	\$450.00	\$1,575.00
2015.06.17	Bell & Howell	LTF	Discussed demand letter with Yitz Kopel and reviewed letter.	0.2	\$1,000.00	\$200.00

DATE	MATTER	ATTY	DESCRIPTION	TIME	RATE	AMOUNT
2015.06.17	Bell & Howell	SAB	Revised draft complaint	1.7	\$1,000.00	\$1,700.00
2015.06.17	Bell & Howell	YZK	Research on claims; revise complaint; draft new demand letter	3.8	\$575.00	\$2,185.00
2015.06.17	Bell & Howell	YZK	Call w/ A Parke	0.5	\$575.00	\$287.50
2015.06.17	Bell & Howell	AML	Phone call w. Plaintiff Parke/Meeting w/ Yitz re: complaint (0.7); Edited complaint/added new Def. and Plaintiff info (4.5)	5.2	\$450.00	\$2,340.00
2015.06.17	Bell & Howell	DLS	Prepared CLRA letters for certified return receipt and mailed	1.0	\$300.00	\$300.00
2015.06.18	Bell & Howell	AML	Phone call w. Plaintiff Hart (0.2); Edited/Finalized complaint (2)	2.2	\$450.00	\$990.00
2015.06.19	Bell & Howell	NJD	Reviewed civil cover sheet with YK. Identified several problems to correct. Answered questions about CLRA venue declaration, and reviewed and redlined. Answered questions about filing and summonses.	1.3	\$600.00	\$780.00
2015.06.19	Bell & Howell	YZK	Get complaint into shape and file	7.5	\$575.00	\$4,312.50
2015.06.23	Bell & Howell	YZK	Research issues related to defendant entities and service of process	1.9	\$575.00	\$1,092.50
2015.06.23	Bell & Howell	CRP	Prepared packets for service (.5); saved Judge Pauley's individual rules to box (.2)	0.7	\$250.00	\$175.00
2015.06.24	Bell & Howell	YZK	Research service of process issues	1.1	\$575.00	\$632.50
2015.06.24	Bell & Howell	CRP	Arranged for service of complaint via First Legal (.5)	0.5	\$250.00	\$125.00
2015.06.29	Bell & Howell	YZK	Review new order; conf w/ CRP to save to box, calendar, serve copies on defendants, etc	0.3	\$575.00	\$172.50
2015.06.29	Bell & Howell	CRP	Saved proofs of service to box (.2); sent status conference order to defs via certified mail (.5); researched rules re service on secretary of state (.5)	1.2	\$250.00	\$300.00
2015.07.01	Bell & Howell	YZK	Read response letter and analyze attached test result	0.8	\$575.00	\$460.00
2015.07.01	Bell & Howell	YZK	Calendar new dates & draft proofs of svc	0.6	\$575.00	\$345.00
2015.07.02	Bell & Howell	YZK	File proof of service	0.2	\$575.00	\$115.00
2015.07.02	Bell & Howell	CRP	Sent status conf. order re certified mail to Def's counsel (.3)	0.3	\$250.00	\$75.00
2015.07.06	Bell & Howell	JIM	Confer with Y. Kopel about litigation strategy and defendant's response letter	0.3	\$850.00	\$255.00
2015.07.06	Bell & Howell	AML	Review and analyze efficacy study	2.1	\$450.00	\$945.00
2015.07.06	Bell & Howell	CRP	Print and circulate efficacy test report per YZK request (.3)	0.3	\$250.00	\$75.00
2015.07.13	Bell & Howell	RSR	Scanned Van Hauser certified receipt and saved it to Box (.1)	0.1	\$300.00	\$30.00
2015.07.14	Bell & Howell	YZK	Call w/ opposing counsel re briefing schedule	0.3	\$575.00	\$172.50
2015.07.14	Bell & Howell	RSR	Scanned BBH certified receipt and saved it to Box (.1)	0.1	\$300.00	\$30.00
2015.07.15	Bell & Howell	JIM	Confer with Y. Kopel about letter motion to the court regarding pleading schedule	0.2	\$850.00	\$170.00
2015.07.15	Bell & Howell	YZK	Communications w/ opposing counsel re filing stip and their pro hac issues	0.6	\$575.00	\$345.00
2015.07.17	Bell & Howell	RSR	Scanned certified receipt and saved to Box (.2)	0.2	\$300.00	\$60.00
2015.08.10	Bell & Howell	FJK	Conf w/ P. Fraietta re response to premotion letter (.2); analyzed premotion letter & research re same (1.2)	1.4	\$550.00	\$770.00
2015.08.11	Bell & Howell	FJK	Drafted Plaintiff's response to Defs' premotion letter (2);	2.1	\$550.00	\$1,155.00

DATE	MATTER	ATTY	DESCRIPTION	TIME	RATE	AMOUNT
2015.08.13	Bell & Howell	SAB	Revised draft response to premotion letter	1.6	\$1,000.00	\$1,600.00
2015.08.13	Bell & Howell	YZK	Finalize and file response letter	4.1	\$575.00	\$2,357.50
2015.08.13	Bell & Howell	YZK	Arrange for courtesy copy of response letter	0.3	\$575.00	\$172.50
2015.08.13	Bell & Howell	FJK	Conduct implied warranty research & conf w/ Y. Kopel re same (.3);	0.3	\$550.00	\$165.00
2015.08.17	Bell & Howell	YZK	Emails w/ counsel re 26(f) conf deadline	0.3	\$575.00	\$172.50
2015.08.18	Bell & Howell	YZK	Draft proposed 26(f) report	1.5	\$575.00	\$862.50
2015.08.19	Bell & Howell	SAB	Reviewed draft initial discovery requests and revised	1.3	\$1,000.00	\$1,300.00
2015.08.19	Bell & Howell	JIM	Review and comment on proposed 26f report and confer with Y. Kopel about proposed case schedule	0.1	\$850.00	\$85.00
2015.08.19	Bell & Howell	YZK	Finalize and circulate draft 26(f) report to counsel	0.9	\$575.00	\$517.50
2015.08.19	Bell & Howell	YZK	Draft requests for production & interrogatories	4.2	\$575.00	\$2,415.00
2015.08.21	Bell & Howell	JIM	Confer with J. Arisohn about attending initial pretrial conference	0.1	\$850.00	\$85.00
2015.08.21	Bell & Howell	JDA	Review proposed schedule	0.3	\$750.00	\$225.00
2015.08.21	Bell & Howell	JDA	Attend 26(f) conference	0.3	\$750.00	\$225.00
2015.08.21	Bell & Howell	JDA	Review requests for production of documents and interrogatories	0.4	\$750.00	\$300.00
2015.08.21	Bell & Howell	YZK	Prep for and attend 26(f) conf	0.9	\$575.00	\$517.50
2015.08.24	Bell & Howell	YZK	Respond to client/class member inquiries	0.9	\$575.00	\$517.50
2015.08.24	Bell & Howell	DLS	Mailed discovery requests	0.6	\$300.00	\$180.00
2015.08.25	Bell & Howell	YZK	Calculate and calendar discovery response date	0.1	\$575.00	\$80.50
2015.08.31	Bell & Howell	YZK	Analyze opposing counsel's redlines to 26(f) report and conf w/ them re same	0.8	\$575.00	\$460.00
2015.09.01	Bell & Howell	SAB	Revised draft 26f report	1.3	\$1,000.00	\$1,300.00
2015.09.01	Bell & Howell	JIM	Review and revise proposed 26f report	0.2	\$850.00	\$170.00
2015.09.01	Bell & Howell	YZK	Finalize and file 26(f) report, send courtesy copies to chambers	1.9	\$575.00	\$1,092.50
2015.09.04	Bell & Howell	YZK	Finalize and serve initial disclosures	0.5	\$575.00	\$287.50
2015.09.09	Bell & Howell	YZK	Email clients with case updates	0.4	\$575.00	\$230.00
2015.09.09	Bell & Howell	YZK	Collaborate w/ RSR to make books for hearing	0.4	\$575.00	\$230.00
2015.09.09	Bell & Howell	RSR	Made status conference books (.6)	0.6	\$300.00	\$180.00
2015.09.10	Bell & Howell	YZK	Prep for tomorrow's hearing	1.7	\$575.00	\$977.50
2015.09.11	Bell & Howell	SAB	Debriefed team after initial pretrial conference	0.7	\$1,000.00	\$700.00
2015.09.11	Bell & Howell	JIM	Prepare for (1.3) and attend initial pretrial conference and pre-motion hearing with Y. Kopel and J. Arisohn (3.5)	4.8	\$850.00	\$4,080.00
2015.09.11	Bell & Howell	JDA	Attend Rule 16 and pre-motion conference	3.5	\$750.00	\$2,625.00
2015.09.11	Bell & Howell	YZK	Travel to court conf., attend conf., travel from conf.	3.5	\$575.00	\$2,012.50
2015.09.11	Bell & Howell	YZK	Compose email re protective order and ESI	0.2	\$575.00	\$115.00
2015.09.14	Bell & Howell	JIM	Review and save scheduling order to file and email Y. Kopel about same	0.2	\$850.00	\$170.00
2015.09.16	Bell & Howell	YZK	Calendar new dates from scheduling order	0.2	\$575.00	\$115.00

DATE	MATTER	ATTY	DESCRIPTION	TIME	RATE	AMOUNT
2015.09.18	Bell & Howell	YZK	Save discovery requests and calendar deadline for responses	0.1	\$575.00	\$57.50
2015.10.05	Bell & Howell	YZK	Compose email re missing discovery	0.2	\$575.00	\$115.00
2015.10.06	Bell & Howell	YZK	Draft discovery responses	0.6	\$575.00	\$345.00
2015.10.07	Bell & Howell	SAB	Revised draft discovery responses and conf. w/ Y. Kopel re same	1.3	\$1,000.00	\$1,300.00
2015.10.07	Bell & Howell	YZK	Draft discovery responses	0.8	\$575.00	\$460.00
2015.10.08	Bell & Howell	JIM	Review e-mail from Y. Kopel to defense counsel about defendant's tardy discovery responses and confer with Y. Kopel about next steps for litigation and about settlement strategy	0.3	\$850.00	\$255.00
2015.10.08	Bell & Howell	YZK	Draft email to defense counsel re lack of discovery responses	0.3	\$575.00	\$172.50
2015.10.08	Bell & Howell	RSR	Prepared fedex to Amanda Parke (.1)	0.1	\$300.00	\$30.00
2015.10.09	Bell & Howell	YZK	Send email to client	0.2	\$575.00	\$115.00
2015.10.12	Bell & Howell	JIM	Confer with Y. Kopel about Ohio class action and how to coordinate with plaintiffs' counsel in that matter	0.3	\$850.00	\$255.00
2015.10.12	Bell & Howell	YZK	Read Steigerwald docket and reach out to counsel	1.5	\$575.00	\$862.50
2015.10.12	Bell & Howell	YZK	Conf w/ Joanne Hart re discovery (.6), finalize interrogatory responses and mail to her (1.7)	2.3	\$575.00	\$1,322.50
2015.10.13	Bell & Howell	YZK	Review and analyze Black & Decker docket and decisions (1.4); conf. w/ team re same (.3); call Steigerwald counsel re consolidation (.9)	2.6	\$575.00	\$1,495.00
2015.10.14	Bell & Howell	YZK	Follow-up phone call w./ Steigerwald counsel	0.2	\$575.00	\$115.00
2015.10.15	Bell & Howell	YZK	Review and analyze MTD	1.1	\$575.00	\$632.50
2015.10.19	Bell & Howell	YZK	Conf w/ A Parke by phone	1.0	\$575.00	\$575.00
2015.10.19	Bell & Howell	YZK	Revise discovery responses	0.5	\$575.00	\$287.50
2015.10.19	Bell & Howell	YZK	Send follow up email to Steigerwald counsel	0.1	\$575.00	\$57.50
2015.10.20	Bell & Howell	YZK	Conf w/ clients re discovery responses	1.1	\$575.00	\$632.50
2015.10.20	Bell & Howell	YZK	Revise discovery responses	0.2	\$575.00	\$115.00
2015.10.20	Bell & Howell	YZK	Begin legal research for MTD Opp'n	3.4	\$575.00	\$1,955.00
2015.10.21	Bell & Howell	JIM	Confer with Y. Kopel about litigation strategy regarding defendant's failure to respond to discovery requests and regarding class certification (.5); review and comment on pre-motion letter to compel discovery responses (.3); confer with Y. Kopel about litigation and settlement strategy (.4)	1.2	\$850.00	\$1,020.00
2015.10.21	Bell & Howell	YZK	Conf w/. JIM re discovery deficiencies, class cert plan, and recap of call w/ A. Parke	0.5	\$575.00	\$287.50
2015.10.21	Bell & Howell	YZK	Draft discovery dispute letter	0.6	\$575.00	\$345.00
2015.10.21	Bell & Howell	YZK	Draft MTD Opp'n	2.9	\$575.00	\$1,667.50
2015.10.21	Bell & Howell	YZK	Finalize and serve discovery responses	1.5	\$575.00	\$862.50
2015.10.22	Bell & Howell	YZK	Research for and drafting MTD Opp'n	5.9	\$575.00	\$3,392.50
2015.10.22	Bell & Howell	FJK	Conf. w/ Y. Kopel re MMWA requirements (.3);	0.3	\$550.00	\$165.00

DATE	MATTER	ATTY	DESCRIPTION	TIME	RATE	AMOUNT
2015.10.22	Bell & Howell	RSR	Prepared mailing of plaintiffs' response to RFPs and interrogatories to opposing counsel (.3)	0.3	\$300.00	\$90.00
2015.10.26	Bell & Howell	YZK	Draft MTD Opp'n	3.5	\$575.00	\$2,012.50
2015.10.27	Bell & Howell	JIM	Confer about litigation strategy with Y. Kopel	0.3	\$850.00	\$255.00
2015.10.29	Bell & Howell	YZK	Compose email to defense counsel re discovery	0.1	\$575.00	\$57.50
2015.10.30	Bell & Howell	JIM	Confer with Y. Kopel about litigation strategy regarding defendant's failure to respond to discover requests and to produce documents on the agreed date, and review and comment on draft joint letter to the court	0.6	\$850.00	\$510.00
2015.10.30	Bell & Howell	YZK	Draft new discovery dispute letter and circulate to defense counsel	1.1	\$575.00	\$632.50
2015.11.02	Bell & Howell	JIM	Review email from defense counsel about belated discovery responses and document production	0.1	\$850.00	\$85.00
2015.11.03	Bell & Howell	SAB	Revised draft MTD oppn	2.3	\$1,000.00	\$2,300.00
2015.11.03	Bell & Howell	JIM	Telephone call with H. Randle and Y. Kopel about defendant's document production tardiness	0.1	\$850.00	\$85.00
2015.11.03	Bell & Howell	YZK	Attend telephone call w/ opposing counsel re status of doc production	0.1	\$575.00	\$57.50
2015.11.03	Bell & Howell	YZK	Draft MTD Opp'n	2.3	\$575.00	\$1,322.50
2015.11.05	Bell & Howell	YZK	Review and analyze doc production	2.5	\$575.00	\$1,437.50
2015.11.09	Bell & Howell	YZK	Review discovery responses & doc production	2.4	\$575.00	\$1,380.00
2015.11.10	Bell & Howell	YZK	Complete doc review (1.1), make list of deficiencies (.3) email counsel re same (.1)	1.5	\$575.00	\$862.50
2015.11.11	Bell & Howell	YZK	Draft MTD Opp'n	6.9	\$575.00	\$3,967.50
2015.11.11	Bell & Howell	YZK	Call w/ J Hart re case status	0.4	\$575.00	\$230.00
2015.11.11	Bell & Howell	FJK	Conf w/ Y. Kopel re choice of law issue (.2);	0.2	\$550.00	\$110.00
2015.11.12	Bell & Howell	JIM	Confer with Y. Kopel about motion to dismiss opposition (.5); review email exchange with defense counsel to schedule discovery meet and confer (.1)	0.6	\$850.00	\$510.00
2015.11.12	Bell & Howell	YZK	Exchange emails w/ opposing counsel re scheduling meet and confer	0.1	\$575.00	\$57.50
2015.11.12	Bell & Howell	YZK	Draft MTD opposition	5.8	\$575.00	\$3,335.00
2015.11.13	Bell & Howell	YZK	Prep for and attend call w/ opposing counsel regarding discovery deficiencies	1.0	\$575.00	\$575.00
2015.11.13	Bell & Howell	YZK	Draft MTD opposition	1.1	\$575.00	\$632.50
2015.11.16	Bell & Howell	SAB	Revised draft MTD oppn & conf. w/ Y. Kopel re same	1.9	\$1,000.00	\$1,900.00
2015.11.16	Bell & Howell	YZK	Finalize and file MTD Opp'n	6.2	\$575.00	\$3,565.00
2015.11.16	Bell & Howell	YZK	Finalize and file Parke notice of dismissal	0.4	\$575.00	\$230.00
2015.11.16	Bell & Howell	FJK	Conf w/ Y. Kopel re FRCP 9(b) argument (.2); revised intro & conf w/ Y. Kopel re same (.2);	0.4	\$550.00	\$220.00
2015.11.16	Bell & Howell	DLS	Prepared TOA and fixed TOC for MTD opposition	1.9	\$300.00	\$570.00
2015.11.16	Bell & Howell	EMW	Prepared and sent FedEx to judge (.5)	0.5	\$300.00	\$150.00
2015.11.16	Bell & Howell	RSR	Worked with DLS on TOA for MTD opposition	1.0	\$300.00	\$300.00

DATE	MATTER	ATTY	DESCRIPTION	TIME	RATE	AMOUNT
2015.11.17	Bell & Howell	YZK	Circulate courtesy copy of cover letter (.1); collect, review and serve first doc production (2.1); create necessary doc production logs etc. (.4)	2.6	\$575.00	\$1,495.00
2015.11.18	Bell & Howell	YZK	Draft notice of 30(b)(6) depo	0.3	\$575.00	\$172.50
2015.11.25	Bell & Howell	SAB	Revised draft 30b6 depo notice (.8); analyzed MTD reply (1.5)	2.3	\$1,000.00	\$2,300.00
2015.11.25	Bell & Howell	YZK	Read and analyze MTD reply	0.7	\$575.00	\$402.50
2015.11.25	Bell & Howell	YZK	Finalize and serve 30(b)(6) depo	0.5	\$575.00	\$287.50
2015.12.08	Bell & Howell	YZK	Call w/ opposing counsel re discovery and scheduling	0.2	\$575.00	\$115.00
2015.12.09	Bell & Howell	EMW	Made MTD Hearing book (1)	1.0	\$300.00	\$300.00
2015.12.10	Bell & Howell	SAB	Multiple confs. w/ team members to prep for MTD hearing	1.4	\$1,000.00	\$1,400.00
2015.12.10	Bell & Howell	YZK	Prep for tomorrow's hearing	2.5	\$575.00	\$1,437.50
2015.12.11	Bell & Howell	YZK	Prep for, travel to and attend MTD hearing	3.1	\$575.00	\$1,782.50
2015.12.11	Bell & Howell	JAL	Attended hearing on MTD	3.0	\$550.00	\$1,650.00
2015.12.15	Bell & Howell	YZK	Email opposing counsel re missing docs and depo dates	0.1	\$575.00	\$57.50
2015.12.21	Bell & Howell	YZK	Email counsel re discovery and depo date	0.1	\$575.00	\$57.50
2015.12.24	Bell & Howell	YZK	Review notes etc in prep for discovery dispute	0.8	\$575.00	\$460.00
2015.12.29	Bell & Howell	JIM	Confer with Y. Kopel about case strategy	0.2	\$850.00	\$170.00
2015.12.29	Bell & Howell	YZK	Draft and send new notice of deposition	0.3	\$575.00	\$172.50
2016.01.07	Bell & Howell	YZK	Conf w/ opposing counsel re deposition scheduling	0.2	\$575.00	\$115.00
2016.01.12	Bell & Howell	YZK	Conf w/ team re deposition scheduling	0.3	\$575.00	\$172.50
2016.01.15	Bell & Howell	YZK	Email counsel re deposition scheduling	0.2	\$575.00	\$115.00
2016.01.22	Bell & Howell	RSR	Booked court reporter for 2/3 30b6 depo	0.2	\$300.00	\$60.00
2016.02.02	Bell & Howell	SAB	Multiple confs. w/ Y. Kopel re depo strategy and preparation for tomorrow's 30b6 deposition	2.5	\$1,000.00	\$2,500.00
2016.02.02	Bell & Howell	YZK	Prepare to take Mishan deposition	9.8	\$575.00	\$5,635.00
2016.02.02	Bell & Howell	EMW	Printed and organized docs for depo (2.5)	2.5	\$300.00	\$750.00
2016.02.03	Bell & Howell	LTF	Call with Yitz Kopel and Julia Luster regarding plaintiff's deposition.	0.1	\$1,000.00	\$100.00
2016.02.03	Bell & Howell	SAB	Debrief w/ Y. Kopel and team re today's 30b6 deposition and discussed strategy re next steps	1.7	\$1,000.00	\$1,700.00
2016.02.03	Bell & Howell	YZK	Call w/ LTF and JAL re Hart deposition	0.1	\$575.00	\$57.50
2016.02.03	Bell & Howell	YZK	Prep for and take 30b6 depo	7.2	\$575.00	\$4,140.00
2016.02.03	Bell & Howell	YZK	Conf w/ team re depo and next steps	1.7	\$575.00	\$977.50
2016.02.03	Bell & Howell	JAL	Call with YZK and LTF regarding Plaintiff Hart's deposition; follow up email	0.2	\$550.00	\$110.00
2016.02.03	Bell & Howell	EMW	Set up conference room for deposition (.5)	0.5	\$300.00	\$150.00
2016.02.03	Bell & Howell	RSR	Set up and clean up for 30b6 depo (.7)	0.7	\$300.00	\$210.00
2016.02.05	Bell & Howell	JIM	Confer with Y. Kopel about existing discovery disputes and outstanding document production from defendant	0.1	\$850.00	\$85.00

DATE	MATTER	ATTY	DESCRIPTION	TIME	RATE	AMOUNT
2016.02.08	Bell & Howell	YZK	Exchange emails w/ opposing counsel re Hart depo scheduling	0.2	\$575.00	\$115.00
2016.02.09	Bell & Howell	EMW	Contacted Veritext re transcript (.3)	0.3	\$300.00	\$90.00
2016.02.10	Bell & Howell	SAB	Read transcript of 30b6 deposition	2.1	\$1,000.00	\$2,100.00
2016.02.10	Bell & Howell	YZK	Compose email to opposing counsel re discovery deficiency	0.4	\$575.00	\$230.00
2016.02.10	Bell & Howell	RSR	Downloaded and saved depo exhibits and transcript (.2)	0.2	\$300.00	\$60.00
2016.02.24	Bell & Howell	JAL	Send email re depo scheduling	0.2	\$550.00	\$110.00
2016.02.25	Bell & Howell	YZK	Finalize motion to compel letter to court after reading Defendants' email	0.7	\$575.00	\$402.50
2016.02.25	Bell & Howell	YZK	Review Steigerwald class cert order	0.5	\$575.00	\$287.50
2016.02.26	Bell & Howell	YZK	Finalize and file letter motion to compel	0.7	\$575.00	\$402.50
2016.02.26	Bell & Howell	EMW	Prepared and sent Fedex to judge (.3)	0.3	\$300.00	\$90.00
2016.03.02	Bell & Howell	YZK	Read Ds' letter to Court and conf. w/ team re same	0.9	\$575.00	\$517.50
2016.03.08	Bell & Howell	SAB	Revised draft premotion response letter	0.9	\$1,000.00	\$900.00
2016.03.08	Bell & Howell	YZK	Research and write pre-motion response letter	8.9	\$575.00	\$5,117.50
2016.03.08	Bell & Howell	PLF	Reviewed oppn to premotion letter and discussed with YZK (1.0)	1.0	\$525.00	\$525.00
2016.03.09	Bell & Howell	YZK	Finalize and file pre-motion response letter	1.8	\$575.00	\$1,035.00
2016.03.09	Bell & Howell	EMW	Prepared and sent courtesy copy via FedEx to judge (.3)	0.3	\$300.00	\$90.00
2016.05.10	Bell & Howell	YZK	Draft joint letter to court re moot issues	0.5	\$575.00	\$287.50
2016.05.18	Bell & Howell	YZK	Exchange emails w/ opposing counsel	0.3	\$575.00	\$172.50
2016.05.19	Bell & Howell	YZK	Finalize and file joint letter to court	0.2	\$575.00	\$115.00
2016.05.19	Bell & Howell	EMW	Sent out courtesy copy of letter to Judge (.1)	0.1	\$300.00	\$30.00
2016.05.24	Bell & Howell	JDA	Discuss case with Y. Kopel	0.7	\$750.00	\$525.00
2016.05.27	Bell & Howell	RSR	Prepared Notice of Appearance for JDA (0.6)	0.6	\$300.00	\$180.00
2016.05.31	Bell & Howell	SAB	Read defendant's answer	0.8	\$1,000.00	\$800.00
2016.05.31	Bell & Howell	YZK	Review answer and save to box	0.5	\$575.00	\$287.50
2016.06.01	Bell & Howell	SAB	Multiple confs. w/ Y. Kopel and team re prep for tomorrow's status conference	1.2	\$1,000.00	\$1,200.00
2016.06.01	Bell & Howell	YZK	Prep for tomorrow's hearing	1.8	\$575.00	\$1,035.00
2016.06.01	Bell & Howell	EMW	Made Status Conference books for YZK and JDA (.6)	0.6	\$300.00	\$180.00
2016.06.01	Bell & Howell	RSR	Editted and filed notice of appearance (1)	1.0	\$300.00	\$300.00
2016.06.02	Bell & Howell	SAB	Debrief w/ Y. Kopel and team re today's status conference and next steps	1.3	\$1,000.00	\$1,300.00
2016.06.02	Bell & Howell	YZK	Prep for, attend, and travel for status conference	3.3	\$575.00	\$1,897.50
2016.06.02	Bell & Howell	YZK	Conf w/ SAB re status conf. and next steps	1.3	\$575.00	\$747.50
2016.06.06	Bell & Howell	YZK	Email counsel re new proposed scheduling date and review letter to be filed with court	0.3	\$575.00	\$172.50
2016.06.08	Bell & Howell	LTF	Email exchange with Yitz Kopel regarding deposition scheduling.	0.1	\$1,000.00	\$100.00
2016.06.09	Bell & Howell	LTF	Made travel arrangements for Hart deposition and exchanged emails with Yitz Kopel regarding same.	0.3	\$1,000.00	\$300.00

DATE	MATTER	ATTY	DESCRIPTION	TIME	RATE	AMOUNT
2016.06.09	Bell & Howell	YZK	Calls w/ team (.3) and client (.2) re depo scheduling	0.5	\$575.00	\$287.50
2016.06.10	Bell & Howell	EMW	Calendared new dates from order (.2)	0.2	\$300.00	\$60.00
2016.06.21	Bell & Howell	EMW	Saved and made book of Expert Report from N.D. OH BHH case (.4)	0.4	\$300.00	\$120.00
2016.06.23	Bell & Howell	YZK	Conduct document review	0.5	\$575.00	\$287.50
2016.06.27	Bell & Howell	LTF	Call with Yitz Kopel to discuss Plaintiff Hart's deposition and began preparing for deposition.	0.3	\$1,000.00	\$300.00
2016.06.27	Bell & Howell	YZK	Assist with Hart depo prep	0.6	\$575.00	\$345.00
2016.06.28	Bell & Howell	LTF	Prepared for Hart deposition and discussed it with Yitz Kopel and Joanne Hart.	2.0	\$1,000.00	\$2,000.00
2016.06.29	Bell & Howell	LTF	Traveled to Palm Desert for Joanne Hart deposition and prepared Joanne Hart for deposition.	7.2	\$1,000.00	\$7,200.00
2016.06.30	Bell & Howell	LTF	Traveled to Hart deposition, attended deposition and discussed deposition with Yitz Kopel after it was completed.	5.3	\$1,000.00	\$5,300.00
2016.06.30	Bell & Howell	YZK	Conf w/ LTF re Hart deposition	0.3	\$575.00	\$172.50
2016.07.01	Bell & Howell	LTF	Returned to Walnut Creek following Hart deposition.	5.3	\$1,000.00	\$5,300.00
2016.07.06	Bell & Howell	YZK	Draft discovery dispute letter and circulate same to opposing counsel	1.5	\$575.00	\$862.50
2016.07.08	Bell & Howell	YZK	Conf w/ team re sales figures	0.3	\$575.00	\$172.50
2016.07.08	Bell & Howell	RSR	Analyzed sales figures from doc production to check entries and get final figure	2.8	\$300.00	\$840.00
2016.07.11	Bell & Howell	SAB	Conf. w/ Y. Kopel re class cert strategy	0.2	\$1,000.00	\$200.00
2016.07.11	Bell & Howell	YZK	Conf w/ C Weir re damages	0.4	\$575.00	\$230.00
2016.07.11	Bell & Howell	YZK	Conduct doc review	3.7	\$575.00	\$2,127.50
2016.07.11	Bell & Howell	YZK	Conf w/ SAB re damages and class cert	0.2	\$575.00	\$115.00
2016.07.12	Bell & Howell	YZK	Conduct doc review	6.8	\$575.00	\$3,910.00
2016.07.12	Bell & Howell	EMW	Made book of Steigerwald expert reports for YZK (.4)	0.4	\$300.00	\$120.00
2016.07.12	Bell & Howell	RSR	Continued analyzing sales data (2)	2.0	\$300.00	\$600.00
2016.07.14	Bell & Howell	EMW	Made charts of tests from doc production and Steigerwald Def. expert report (1)	1.0	\$300.00	\$300.00
2016.07.18	Bell & Howell	YZK	Conduct doc review	5.3	\$575.00	\$3,047.50
2016.07.20	Bell & Howell	YZK	Review and analyze Hart depo transcript	0.9	\$575.00	\$517.50
2016.07.20	Bell & Howell	YZK	Conduct doc review	6.7	\$575.00	\$3,852.50
2016.07.21	Bell & Howell	YZK	Conduct doc review	4.5	\$575.00	\$2,587.50
2016.07.25	Bell & Howell	LTF	Discussed plaintiff's deposition and intervention strategy with Yitz Kopel.	0.6	\$1,000.00	\$600.00
2016.07.25	Bell & Howell	SAB	Multiple teleconfs. w/ Y. Kopel and T. Fisher re litigation strategy for dealing with Pat Perrotti's competing case	0.7	\$1,000.00	\$700.00
2016.07.25	Bell & Howell	YZK	Conduct doc review	5.7	\$575.00	\$3,277.50
2016.07.25	Bell & Howell	YZK	Conf. w/ LTF re plaintiff's depo and intervention	0.6	\$575.00	\$345.00

DATE	MATTER	ATTY	DESCRIPTION	TIME	RATE	AMOUNT
2016.07.25	Bell & Howell	YZK	Conf w/ SAB re intervention	0.1	\$575.00	\$57.50
2016.07.26	Bell & Howell	SAB	Teleconf. w/ P. Perotti re possibility of working together	0.3	\$1,000.00	\$300.00
2016.07.26	Bell & Howell	YZK	Confer w/ team re litigation strategy	0.7	\$575.00	\$402.50
2016.07.26	Bell & Howell	YZK	Call w/ Steigerwald counsel	0.3	\$575.00	\$172.50
2016.07.26	Bell & Howell	YZK	Draft intervention motion	3.7	\$575.00	\$2,127.50
2016.07.28	Bell & Howell	YZK	Draft motion to intervene	3.1	\$575.00	\$1,782.50
2016.08.05	Bell & Howell	YZK	Continue drafting intervention papers	1.6	\$575.00	\$920.00
2016.08.09	Bell & Howell	YZK	Draft intervention papers	4.1	\$575.00	\$2,357.50
2016.08.09	Bell & Howell	YZK	Review ND Ohio local rules re pro hac, conduct research re same as to whether local counsel needed	0.9	\$575.00	\$517.50
2016.08.09	Bell & Howell	DLS	Reviewed northern district of Ohio local rules re pleadings	0.4	\$300.00	\$120.00
2016.08.09	Bell & Howell	DLS	Worked on pleading template	1.0	\$300.00	\$300.00
2016.08.10	Bell & Howell	SAB	Multiple teleconfs. w/ Y. Kopel and team members re potential intervention strategy (1.7); revised draft motion to intervene (1.8)	3.5	\$1,000.00	\$3,500.00
2016.08.10	Bell & Howell	JIM	Confer with Y. Kopel about litigation strategy and call counsel in Ohio (1.0); review and comment on intervention motion (.6)	1.6	\$850.00	\$1,360.00
2016.08.10	Bell & Howell	YZK	Draft intervention papers	3.8	\$575.00	\$2,185.00
2016.08.10	Bell & Howell	YZK	Call w/ potential local counsel	0.3	\$575.00	\$172.50
2016.08.10	Bell & Howell	YZK	Conf. w/ team re strategy for intervention	1.3	\$575.00	\$747.50
2016.08.10	Bell & Howell	PLF	Reviewed draft motion to intervene and discussed with YZK (1.0)	1.0	\$525.00	\$525.00
2016.08.10	Bell & Howell	DLS	Prepared pleading template	1.0	\$300.00	\$300.00
2016.08.10	Bell & Howell	DLS	Fixed formatting of draft motion to intervene	0.4	\$300.00	\$120.00
2016.08.10	Bell & Howell	DLS	Fixed formatting of complaint in intervention	0.3	\$300.00	\$90.00
2016.08.10	Bell & Howell	RSR	Analyzed sales production and conf. w/ YZK (1.7)	1.7	\$300.00	\$510.00
2016.08.11	Bell & Howell	JIM	Confer with Y. Kopel about my comments to the draft intervention motion	0.4	\$850.00	\$340.00
2016.08.11	Bell & Howell	YZK	Research for and draft intervention papers	6.4	\$575.00	\$3,680.00
2016.08.12	Bell & Howell	YZK	Draft intervention papers	6.9	\$575.00	\$3,967.50
2016.08.12	Bell & Howell	DLS	Fixed formatting of declaration	0.4	\$300.00	\$120.00
2016.08.15	Bell & Howell	SAB	Revised draft intervention brief and complaint	3.5	\$1,000.00	\$3,500.00
2016.08.15	Bell & Howell	YZK	Draft intervention papers	3.6	\$575.00	\$2,070.00
2016.08.15	Bell & Howell	RSR	Drafted YZK PHV motion w/ DLS (1.7), prepared exh. to Kopel decl. (.4), prepared tables for motion to intervene (1.5)	3.6	\$300.00	\$1,080.00
2016.08.16	Bell & Howell	YZK	Finalize and file intervention papers	2.3	\$575.00	\$1,322.50
2016.08.18	Bell & Howell	YZK	Review existing discovery, begin drafting new dispute letter and depo notices	2.6	\$575.00	\$1,495.00
2016.08.19	Bell & Howell	YZK	Finalize and send letter re discovery demands and depo notices/subpoenas	2.2	\$575.00	\$1,265.00
2016.08.19	Bell & Howell	RSR	Analyzed retailer data and created spreadsheet (4), served Feuerstein subpoena (.2)	4.2	\$300.00	\$1,260.00

DATE	MATTER	ATTY	DESCRIPTION	TIME	RATE	AMOUNT
2016.08.24	Bell & Howell	RSR	Followed up with First Legal re Feuerstein service (.2)	0.2	\$300.00	\$60.00
2016.08.29	Bell & Howell	SAB	Developed strategy for retailer subpoenas and conf. w/ Y. Kopel re same	1.4	\$1,000.00	\$1,400.00
2016.08.29	Bell & Howell	YZK	Draft and circulate joint discovery dispute letter	1.7	\$575.00	\$977.50
2016.08.29	Bell & Howell	YZK	Conf w/ RSR re retailer subpoenas	0.3	\$575.00	\$172.50
2016.08.29	Bell & Howell	RSR	Researched retailers and prepared subpoenas (1.6), researched Feuerstein address and updated First Legal for service (.7)	2.3	\$300.00	\$690.00
2016.08.30	Bell & Howell	YZK	Work w/ RSR on retailer subpoenas	0.6	\$575.00	\$345.00
2016.08.30	Bell & Howell	YZK	Briefly review intervention opp	0.2	\$575.00	\$115.00
2016.08.30	Bell & Howell	RSR	Worked with YZK on retailer subpoenas (.6)	0.6	\$300.00	\$180.00
2016.08.31	Bell & Howell	YZK	Research for and drafting intervention reply	4.6	\$575.00	\$2,645.00
2016.08.31	Bell & Howell	YZK	Communications w/ S Wing re intervention	0.2	\$575.00	\$115.00
2016.08.31	Bell & Howell	RSR	Followed up with First Legal re Feuerstein service (.2), worked on retailer subpoenas with YZK (.5)	0.7	\$300.00	\$210.00
2016.09.01	Bell & Howell	YZK	Draft intervention reply	4.6	\$575.00	\$2,645.00
2016.09.02	Bell & Howell	SAB	Revised draft intervention reply brief	2.5	\$1,000.00	\$2,500.00
2016.09.02	Bell & Howell	YZK	Draft intervention reply (1.8), research re dismissal of BOE claim (.9) , draft amended complaint and notice of dismissal (1.4), and call w/ S Wing re same (.3)	4.4	\$575.00	\$2,530.00
2016.09.06	Bell & Howell	YZK	Revise intervention reply	1.2	\$575.00	\$690.00
2016.09.06	Bell & Howell	RSR	Made revisions to retailer subpoenas (.5)	0.5	\$300.00	\$150.00
2016.09.07	Bell & Howell	SAB	Revised draft intervention reply brief	3.3	\$1,000.00	\$3,300.00
2016.09.07	Bell & Howell	YZK	Draft intervention reply	2.1	\$575.00	\$1,207.50
2016.09.07	Bell & Howell	DLS	Prepared TOA and fixed formatting of TOC	1.5	\$300.00	\$450.00
2016.09.08	Bell & Howell	YZK	Finalize reply and send to local counsel counsel	0.7	\$575.00	\$402.50
2016.09.12	Bell & Howell	YZK	Conf w/ co counsel re untimely filed brief and call from Perrotti	0.2	\$575.00	\$115.00
2016.09.12	Bell & Howell	YZK	Left message for S Feuerstein re subpoenas	0.1	\$575.00	\$57.50
2016.09.12	Bell & Howell	YZK	Call w/ P Perotti and F Bartela re working together in Steigerwald action	0.3	\$575.00	\$172.50
2016.09.13	Bell & Howell	YZK	Call to P Perotti	0.1	\$575.00	\$57.50
2016.09.13	Bell & Howell	YZK	Follow up re 3d party subpoenas	0.2	\$575.00	\$115.00
2016.09.13	Bell & Howell	YZK	Review Steigerwald MSJ and save to box	0.5	\$575.00	\$287.50
2016.09.14	Bell & Howell	YZK	Leave voicemail for P Perotti	0.1	\$575.00	\$57.50
2016.09.14	Bell & Howell	YZK	Finalize and serve retailer subpoenas	0.5	\$575.00	\$287.50
2016.09.14	Bell & Howell	YZK	Follow up w/ Feuerstein re subpoena	0.2	\$575.00	\$115.00
2016.09.14	Bell & Howell	RSR	Attempted service for Wal-Mart Stores (.7), updated retailer subpoenas and prepared notices (1.7)	2.4	\$300.00	\$720.00
2016.09.15	Bell & Howell	YZK	Begin drafting second intervention reply	1.9	\$575.00	\$1,092.50
2016.09.15	Bell & Howell	RSR	Served Wal-Mart Stores, Inc. (.7)	0.7	\$300.00	\$210.00

DATE	MATTER	ATTY	DESCRIPTION	TIME	RATE	AMOUNT
2016.09.16	Bell & Howell	RSR	Prepared proof of service for retailer subpoena (.2)	0.2	\$300.00	\$60.00
2016.09.19	Bell & Howell	YZK	Draft second intervention reply	2.9	\$575.00	\$1,667.50
2016.09.19	Bell & Howell	RSR	Assisted with 2nd Intervention Reply (.4)	0.4	\$300.00	\$120.00
2016.09.20	Bell & Howell	YZK	Call w/ S Feuerstein re subpoena	0.3	\$575.00	\$172.50
2016.09.20	Bell & Howell	YZK	Exchange emails w/ defense counsel re doc production	0.2	\$575.00	\$115.00
2016.09.20	Bell & Howell	YZK	Conf w/ RSR re HSN subpoena	0.2	\$575.00	\$115.00
2016.09.20	Bell & Howell	RSR	Updated HSN retailer subpoena and notice and sent out for service	0.2	\$300.00	\$60.00
2016.09.21	Bell & Howell	YZK	Take call re HSN subpoena	0.2	\$575.00	\$115.00
2016.09.21	Bell & Howell	YZK	Call w/ S Feuerstein	0.3	\$575.00	\$172.50
2016.09.22	Bell & Howell	YZK	Conduct doc review	3.1	\$575.00	\$1,782.50
2016.09.22	Bell & Howell	YZK	Call to S Feurstein	0.5	\$575.00	\$287.50
2016.09.22	Bell & Howell	EMW	Saved and combined Ds' doc production (.4)	0.4	\$300.00	\$120.00
2016.09.23	Bell & Howell	YZK	Draft motion to compel Feuerstein	1.2	\$575.00	\$690.00
2016.09.23	Bell & Howell	YZK	Multiple calls w/ S Wing re discovery extension	0.3	\$575.00	\$172.50
2016.09.23	Bell & Howell	YZK	Draft and file discovery extension request ltr	0.5	\$575.00	\$287.50
2016.09.23	Bell & Howell	RSR	Calendared depo dates (.3)	0.3	\$300.00	\$90.00
2016.10.03	Bell & Howell	EMW	Contacted retailer attorneys regarding YZK availability to discuss subpoenas (.3)	0.3	\$300.00	\$90.00
2016.10.05	Bell & Howell	YZK	Calls w/ retailer counsel re subpoenas	1.3	\$575.00	\$747.50
2016.10.05	Bell & Howell	RSR	Booked retailer depositions with Veritext (.6)	0.6	\$300.00	\$180.00
2016.10.06	Bell & Howell	YZK	Communications w/ retailer counsel re subpoenas	0.5	\$575.00	\$287.50
2016.10.06	Bell & Howell	YZK	Look for product UPC info and email to walmart counsel	0.2	\$575.00	\$115.00
2016.10.06	Bell & Howell	YZK	Determine course of action for tomorrow's noticed depo	0.3	\$575.00	\$172.50
2016.10.06	Bell & Howell	YZK	Review feuerstein doc production	1.7	\$575.00	\$977.50
2016.10.06	Bell & Howell	EMW	Logged doc production in Chron Doc (.5)	0.5	\$300.00	\$150.00
2016.10.07	Bell & Howell	YZK	Arrangements re depo (no show)	0.6	\$575.00	\$345.00
2016.10.11	Bell & Howell	RSR	Contacted Veritext re Harriet Carter depo invoices (.2)	0.2	\$300.00	\$60.00
2016.10.13	Bell & Howell	YZK	Read literature and search for expert entomologist	2.9	\$575.00	\$1,667.50
2016.10.14	Bell & Howell	YZK	Communications w/ HSN re 3d party discovery	0.4	\$575.00	\$230.00
2016.10.19	Bell & Howell	YZK	Calls w/ expert witness prospects	1.5	\$575.00	\$862.50
2016.10.19	Bell & Howell	YZK	Calls w/ 3d party retailers re subpoenas	0.7	\$575.00	\$402.50
2016.10.20	Bell & Howell	YZK	Calls to 3d party retailers re subpoenas	0.8	\$575.00	\$460.00
2016.10.21	Bell & Howell	YZK	Contact Walmart's counsel re 3d party subpoena	0.2	\$575.00	\$115.00
2016.10.21	Bell & Howell	YZK	Conf w/ C Weir re retention for case	0.3	\$575.00	\$172.50
2016.10.26	Bell & Howell	YZK	Conf w/ JIM re expert search	0.1	\$575.00	\$57.50
2016.10.27	Bell & Howell	SAB	Multiple confs. w/ Y. Kopel re potential experts	1.1	\$1,000.00	\$1,100.00

DATE	MATTER	ATTY	DESCRIPTION	TIME	RATE	AMOUNT
2016.10.27	Bell & Howell	YZK	Extensive research and calls re efficacy expert	4.6	\$575.00	\$2,645.00
2016.10.27	Bell & Howell	YZK	Call w/ Bruce Gorman re Dr. Leonard's production	0.2	\$575.00	\$115.00
2016.10.27	Bell & Howell	YZK	Review and revise draft protective order	0.9	\$575.00	\$517.50
2016.10.28	Bell & Howell	SAB	Multiple confs. w/ Y. Kopel re potential experts	1.3	\$1,000.00	\$1,300.00
2016.10.28	Bell & Howell	YZK	Call w/ Dr. Nyrop re expert witness retention	0.6	\$575.00	\$345.00
2016.10.28	Bell & Howell	YZK	Email S Wing re depo scheduling	0.1	\$575.00	\$57.50
2016.10.28	Bell & Howell	YZK	Redline and circulate confidentiality agreement	0.7	\$575.00	\$402.50
2016.10.28	Bell & Howell	YZK	Calls w/ 3d party retailers re doc production	0.8	\$575.00	\$460.00
2016.10.28	Bell & Howell	YZK	Review and sign retention agreement for C Weir	0.3	\$575.00	\$172.50
2016.10.28	Bell & Howell	YZK	Email Dr. Ali re expert witness retention	0.1	\$575.00	\$57.50
2016.10.31	Bell & Howell	YZK	Calls w/ several potential expert witnesses	3.5	\$575.00	\$2,012.50
2016.11.01	Bell & Howell	YZK	Call w/ S Wing re confidentiality order and depo dates	0.2	\$575.00	\$115.00
2016.11.02	Bell & Howell	YZK	Phone calls and research for prospective expert witnesses	2.7	\$575.00	\$1,552.50
2016.11.03	Bell & Howell	SAB	Teleconf. w/ Y. Kopel re class cert strategy	0.6	\$1,000.00	\$600.00
2016.11.03	Bell & Howell	JIM	Confer with Y. Kopel about discovery and class certification strategy	0.5	\$850.00	\$425.00
2016.11.07	Bell & Howell	YZK	Assemble docs to send to C Weir	0.4	\$575.00	\$230.00
2016.11.07	Bell & Howell	YZK	Left message for B Garbose re subpoena	0.1	\$575.00	\$57.50
2016.11.07	Bell & Howell	YZK	Called S Wing re confidentiality agreement and depositions	0.2	\$575.00	\$115.00
2016.11.07	Bell & Howell	YZK	Continue making calls for expert search	2.9	\$575.00	\$1,667.50
2016.11.08	Bell & Howell	JIM	Confer with Y. Kopel about denial of motion to intervene and next steps for litigation strategy	0.3	\$850.00	\$255.00
2016.11.08	Bell & Howell	YZK	Read intervention order and plan next steps	2.5	\$575.00	\$1,437.50
2016.11.08	Bell & Howell	YZK	Call w/ P Perotti re intervention order and next steps	0.2	\$575.00	\$115.00
2016.11.08	Bell & Howell	YZK	Call w/ prospective expert	0.5	\$575.00	\$287.50
2016.11.08	Bell & Howell	YZK	Call S wing	0.1	\$575.00	\$57.50
2016.11.08	Bell & Howell	YZK	Call w/ Cindy Murray re subpoena	0.2	\$575.00	\$115.00
2016.11.08	Bell & Howell	YZK	Call w/ C Weir	0.2	\$575.00	\$115.00
2016.11.09	Bell & Howell	JIM	Confer with Y. Kopel about litigation strategy	0.5	\$850.00	\$425.00
2016.11.09	Bell & Howell	YZK	Determine next steps and multiple calls w/ Perrotti	3.5	\$575.00	\$2,012.50
2016.11.09	Bell & Howell	EMW	Saved and organized tests to send to expert (1.2)	1.2	\$300.00	\$360.00
2016.11.10	Bell & Howell	YZK	Correspondence with experts	1.0	\$575.00	\$575.00
2016.11.10	Bell & Howell	RSR	Dr. Leonard's doc review and sent hot docs to C. Weir (1.5)	1.5	\$300.00	\$450.00
2016.11.11	Bell & Howell	YZK	Compile docs and send to experts	1.5	\$575.00	\$862.50
2016.11.11	Bell & Howell	YZK	Get confidentiality agreement signed and sent to all retailers, get docs from retailers	2.6	\$575.00	\$1,495.00
2016.11.14	Bell & Howell	YZK	Coordinate w/ M Potter on expert report and getting him docs	0.9	\$575.00	\$517.50

DATE	MATTER	ATTY	DESCRIPTION	TIME	RATE	AMOUNT
2016.11.14	Bell & Howell	EMW	Organized and sent docs to expert (1.4)	1.4	\$300.00	\$420.00
2016.11.15	Bell & Howell	YZK	Prep for and attend call w/ C Weir	0.5	\$575.00	\$287.50
2016.11.15	Bell & Howell	YZK	Schedule depositions (.2); compile and fedex doc production (.9)	1.1	\$575.00	\$632.50
2016.11.16	Bell & Howell	YZK	Draft class certification pre-motion letter	5.3	\$575.00	\$3,047.50
2016.11.16	Bell & Howell	YZK	Call w/ A Kearns re expert docs	0.5	\$575.00	\$287.50
2016.11.17	Bell & Howell	YZK	Draft CC pre-motion letter	3.1	\$575.00	\$1,782.50
2016.11.18	Bell & Howell	YZK	Revise class certification pre-motion letter	2.1	\$575.00	\$1,207.50
2016.11.21	Bell & Howell	YZK	Draft and circulate retailer declarations	1.3	\$575.00	\$747.50
2016.11.21	Bell & Howell	YZK	Prep for and attend call w/ M Potter	1.5	\$575.00	\$862.50
2016.11.21	Bell & Howell	YZK	Revise class certification pre-motion letter	1.9	\$575.00	\$1,092.50
2016.11.21	Bell & Howell	RSR	Conf. w/ YZK and scheduled depositions with Veritext for 11/28 and 11/29 (.4)	0.4	\$300.00	\$120.00
2016.11.22	Bell & Howell	YZK	Prep for and attend call w/ M Potter	1.4	\$575.00	\$805.00
2016.11.22	Bell & Howell	YZK	Draft and file letter motion for excess pages to court	0.8	\$575.00	\$460.00
2016.11.22	Bell & Howell	RSR	Reviewed Dr. Leonards sales data and isolated CA purchasers	1.5	\$300.00	\$450.00
2016.11.23	Bell & Howell	YZK	Prepare for Feuerstein deposition	6.4	\$575.00	\$3,680.00
2016.11.23	Bell & Howell	AML	Depo prep - Feuerstein depo	8.8	\$450.00	\$3,960.00
2016.11.23	Bell & Howell	EMW	Depo Prep (3.5) - print documents for upcoming depositions	3.5	\$300.00	\$1,050.00
2016.11.27	Bell & Howell	YZK	Deposition prep and strategy for Feuerstein and Mishan depositions	6.2	\$575.00	\$3,565.00
2016.11.27	Bell & Howell	AML	Assist with Feuerstein preparation	5.6	\$450.00	\$2,520.00
2016.11.28	Bell & Howell	SAB	Multiple confs. w/ Y. Kopel re strategy and prep for Mishan and Feuerstein depositions	1.9	\$1,000.00	\$1,900.00
2016.11.28	Bell & Howell	YZK	Revise and circulate HSN decl	0.2	\$575.00	\$115.00
2016.11.28	Bell & Howell	YZK	Prep for Mishan and Feuerstein depositions	10.1	\$575.00	\$5,807.50
2016.11.28	Bell & Howell	AML	Depo prep; drafted HSN declaration	7.2	\$450.00	\$3,240.00
2016.11.28	Bell & Howell	EMW	Depo prep (1.3)	1.3	\$300.00	\$390.00
2016.11.29	Bell & Howell	SAB	Read Steigerwald v. BHH order granting summary judgment in the Ohio case (.4); debrief w/ Y. Kopel and team re Feuerstein deposition (.8)	1.2	\$1,000.00	\$1,200.00
2016.11.29	Bell & Howell	JIM	Assist Y. Kopel with deposition preparation	0.2	\$850.00	\$170.00
2016.11.29	Bell & Howell	YZK	Prep for mishan depo	2.1	\$575.00	\$1,207.50
2016.11.29	Bell & Howell	YZK	Prep for and take Feuerstein depo	7.9	\$575.00	\$4,542.50
2016.11.29	Bell & Howell	AML	Depo prep; deposition of M. Feuerstein	9.7	\$450.00	\$4,365.00
2016.11.29	Bell & Howell	EMW	Depo Prep and clean up (2.3)	2.3	\$300.00	\$690.00
2016.11.30	Bell & Howell	SAB	Multiple teleconfs. w/ Y. Kopel re Mishan deposition (.7); debrief with Y. Kopel and team after deposition to discuss next steps (.6)	1.3	\$1,000.00	\$1,300.00
2016.11.30	Bell & Howell	YZK	Review invoice from M Potter	0.2	\$575.00	\$115.00

DATE	MATTER	ATTY	DESCRIPTION	TIME	RATE	AMOUNT
2016.11.30	Bell & Howell	YZK	Listen to VM from C Holt @ HSN	0.1	\$575.00	\$57.50
2016.11.30	Bell & Howell	YZK	Prep for and take Mishan dep	4.5	\$575.00	\$2,587.50
2016.11.30	Bell & Howell	YZK	Research for and revisions to pre-motion class certification letter	2.5	\$575.00	\$1,437.50
2016.11.30	Bell & Howell	YZK	Team meet re next steps in litigation	0.6	\$575.00	\$345.00
2016.11.30	Bell & Howell	AML	Research re: shrinkwrap arbitration; depo prep; Mishan deposition	4.9	\$450.00	\$2,205.00
2016.11.30	Bell & Howell	EMW	Depo prep (.6)	0.6	\$300.00	\$180.00
2016.12.01	Bell & Howell	NJD	Review and redlined YZK's draft class cert pre-motion letter	1.1	\$600.00	\$660.00
2016.12.01	Bell & Howell	YZK	Revise and finalize pre-motion letter	3.5	\$575.00	\$2,012.50
2016.12.02	Bell & Howell	SAB	Revised draft premotion letter	0.5	\$1,000.00	\$500.00
2016.12.02	Bell & Howell	JIM	Review and comment on draft class certification pre-motion conference letter and discuss comments with Y. Kopel	1.8	\$850.00	\$1,530.00
2016.12.02	Bell & Howell	YZK	Finalize and file pre-motion letter and motion to seal	6.5	\$575.00	\$3,737.50
2016.12.02	Bell & Howell	AML	Assist with finalizing letter to Judge Pauley; assembled docs for messenger; served co-counsel; e-filed on ECF	4.4	\$450.00	\$1,980.00
2016.12.02	Bell & Howell	EMW	Assisted w. Request to File Seal and Pre Motion Letter filing (1.3)	1.3	\$300.00	\$390.00
2016.12.02	Bell & Howell	RSR	Assisted with letter to Judge and scheduled courier to court (.3)	0.3	\$300.00	\$90.00
2016.12.05	Bell & Howell	YZK	Calls w/ putative class members (.4); email D Seemann (.1)	0.5	\$575.00	\$287.50
2016.12.06	Bell & Howell	YZK	Email Cindy Murray re Family Dollar declaration	0.1	\$575.00	\$57.50
2016.12.06	Bell & Howell	YZK	Organize retailer declarations and circulate same to opposing counsel	0.2	\$575.00	\$115.00
2016.12.06	Bell & Howell	YZK	Review sealing order and save to box	0.1	\$575.00	\$57.50
2016.12.09	Bell & Howell	YZK	Read and analyze letter response filed today	0.3	\$575.00	\$172.50
2016.12.13	Bell & Howell	YZK	Participate in calls w/ putative class members	0.5	\$575.00	\$287.50
2016.12.14	Bell & Howell	YZK	Email to retailer counsel	0.1	\$575.00	\$57.50
2016.12.14	Bell & Howell	YZK	Send docs to experts	0.2	\$575.00	\$115.00
2016.12.19	Bell & Howell	YZK	Calls w/ class members	2.5	\$575.00	\$1,437.50
2016.12.20	Bell & Howell	YZK	Calls w/ class members	0.9	\$575.00	\$517.50
2016.12.21	Bell & Howell	YZK	Calls w/ new client	0.6	\$575.00	\$345.00
2016.12.23	Bell & Howell	YZK	Calls w/ class members	0.6	\$575.00	\$345.00
2016.12.27	Bell & Howell	YZK	Draft new demand letter	0.4	\$575.00	\$230.00
2016.12.28	Bell & Howell	YZK	Calls w/ prospective clients	0.8	\$575.00	\$460.00
2017.01.03	Bell & Howell	YZK	Look into status of new demand letter	0.2	\$575.00	\$115.00
2017.01.03	Bell & Howell	YZK	Calls w/ interested consumers	0.6	\$575.00	\$345.00
2017.01.05	Bell & Howell	YZK	Prep for and attend call w/ C. Weir	0.5	\$575.00	\$287.50
2017.01.09	Bell & Howell	SAB	Conf. w/ Y. Kopel re class cert motion and litigation strategy	0.4	\$1,000.00	\$400.00
2017.01.09	Bell & Howell	JIM	Confer with Y. Kopel about upcoming oral argument on class certification motion and about filing of related complaint	0.4	\$850.00	\$340.00

DATE	MATTER	ATTY	DESCRIPTION	TIME	RATE	AMOUNT
2017.01.09	Bell & Howell	YZK	Work w/ M Potter on testing	0.5	\$575.00	\$287.50
2017.01.09	Bell & Howell	YZK	Draft and circulate new complaint to client	0.8	\$575.00	\$460.00
2017.01.09	Bell & Howell	YZK	Strategy meeting w/ SAB	0.4	\$575.00	\$230.00
2017.01.10	Bell & Howell	YZK	Prepare new pleadings	1.7	\$575.00	\$977.50
2017.01.10	Bell & Howell	YZK	Call w/ S Bueno	0.3	\$575.00	\$172.50
2017.01.11	Bell & Howell	YZK	Research for new complaint and calls w/ S Bueno	1.5	\$575.00	\$862.50
2017.01.12	Bell & Howell	YZK	Call w/ S Bueno	0.2	\$575.00	\$115.00
2017.01.16	Bell & Howell	YZK	Call w/ plaintiff Hart re case status	0.4	\$575.00	\$230.00
2017.01.16	Bell & Howell	YZK	Research finding Harriet Carter catalog page	0.8	\$575.00	\$460.00
2017.01.16	Bell & Howell	YZK	Call w/ M Potter	0.3	\$575.00	\$172.50
2017.01.16	Bell & Howell	YZK	Review Feuerstein depo transcript	0.8	\$575.00	\$460.00
2017.01.17	Bell & Howell	JIM	Confer with internal team to prepare for class certification pre-motion hearing	0.4	\$850.00	\$340.00
2017.01.17	Bell & Howell	NJD	Discussion of class cert hearing with YK and JIM. Reviewed case file.	1.0	\$600.00	\$600.00
2017.01.17	Bell & Howell	YZK	Prep for and attend call w/ opposing counsel	0.5	\$575.00	\$287.50
2017.01.17	Bell & Howell	FJK	Conf w/ team re class cert hearing (.5);	0.5	\$550.00	\$275.00
2017.01.18	Bell & Howell	SAB	Multiple confs. w/ Y. Kopel re prep for class cert hearing	1.5	\$1,000.00	\$1,500.00
2017.01.18	Bell & Howell	JIM	Assist Y. Kopel and F. Klorczyk to prepare for class certification pre-motion hearing	2.7	\$850.00	\$2,295.00
2017.01.18	Bell & Howell	YZK	Multiple emails w/ S Bueno re new pleadings	0.3	\$575.00	\$172.50
2017.01.18	Bell & Howell	YZK	Email to opposing counsel re add'l model numbers	0.1	\$575.00	\$57.50
2017.01.18	Bell & Howell	YZK	Call w/ J Hart	0.5	\$575.00	\$287.50
2017.01.18	Bell & Howell	YZK	Review NOAs for colleagues	0.2	\$575.00	\$115.00
2017.01.18	Bell & Howell	YZK	Prep for tomorrow's hearing	7.3	\$575.00	\$4,197.50
2017.01.18	Bell & Howell	FJK	Class cert hearing prep w/ J. Marchese & Y. Kopel (1.5);	1.5	\$550.00	\$825.00
2017.01.18	Bell & Howell	EMW	Prepped for 1/18 hearing (.6)	0.6	\$300.00	\$180.00
2017.01.18	Bell & Howell	RSR	Drafted and filed notices of appearances for NJD and FJK (.8)	0.8	\$300.00	\$240.00
2017.01.18	Bell & Howell	JLH	Scanned receipt onto box	0.3	\$275.00	\$82.50
2017.01.19	Bell & Howell	SAB	Debrief w/ Y. Kopel and team re today's class cert hearing	0.8	\$1,000.00	\$800.00
2017.01.19	Bell & Howell	JIM	Confer with Y. Kopel about pre-motion conference and amending complaint	0.3	\$850.00	\$255.00
2017.01.19	Bell & Howell	NJD	Prep for hearing with YK, attend hearing	4.4	\$600.00	\$2,640.00
2017.01.19	Bell & Howell	YZK	Review efficacy studies, etc.	2.6	\$575.00	\$1,495.00
2017.01.19	Bell & Howell	YZK	Prep for and attend class cert pre-motion hearing	4.5	\$575.00	\$2,587.50
2017.01.19	Bell & Howell	FJK	Attended pre-motion conference w/ Y. Kopel & N. Deckant (2.5);	2.5	\$550.00	\$1,375.00
2017.01.20	Bell & Howell	YZK	Email opposing counsel re new discovery	0.2	\$575.00	\$115.00
2017.01.20	Bell & Howell	YZK	Respond to inquiry from consumer	0.2	\$575.00	\$115.00
2017.01.20	Bell & Howell	YZK	Conf w/ FJK re amended complaint	0.4	\$575.00	\$230.00

DATE	MATTER	ATTY	DESCRIPTION	TIME	RATE	AMOUNT
2017.01.20	Bell & Howell	FJK	Conf w/ Y. Kopel re allegations for amended complaint (.4);	0.4	\$550.00	\$220.00
2017.01.23	Bell & Howell	JIM	Confer with Y. Kopel about draft of amended complaint	0.4	\$850.00	\$340.00
2017.01.23	Bell & Howell	YZK	Research for class cert (4.4) and finalize & file FAC (2.7)	7.1	\$575.00	\$4,082.50
2017.01.23	Bell & Howell	AML	Privity research assignment (2.7); proofread new complaint (1.8)	5.5	\$450.00	\$2,475.00
2017.01.24	Bell & Howell	YZK	Prep for and attend call w/ C Weir	0.6	\$575.00	\$345.00
2017.01.25	Bell & Howell	YZK	Scheduling call w/ defense counsel	0.2	\$575.00	\$115.00
2017.01.25	Bell & Howell	YZK	Review and analyze docs from Potter	1.1	\$575.00	\$632.50
2017.01.25	Bell & Howell	YZK	Review and analyze Weir report, conduct discovery re damages	0.9	\$575.00	\$517.50
2017.01.26	Bell & Howell	YZK	Draft Bueno discovery responses	0.6	\$575.00	\$345.00
2017.01.26	Bell & Howell	RSR	Drafted RFP responses for S. Bueno (1)	1.0	\$300.00	\$300.00
2017.02.02	Bell & Howell	YZK	Call w/ S Bueno re doc production and deposition scheduling	0.7	\$575.00	\$402.50
2017.02.03	Bell & Howell	YZK	Finalize discovery responses and initial disclosures and serve same	0.6	\$575.00	\$345.00
2017.02.03	Bell & Howell	YZK	Call w/ opposing counsel re depo scheduling	0.3	\$575.00	\$172.50
2017.02.27	Bell & Howell	YZK	Research for class cert	3.4	\$575.00	\$1,955.00
2017.02.28	Bell & Howell	YZK	Call w/ Weir re class cert	0.4	\$575.00	\$230.00
2017.03.01	Bell & Howell	SAB	Multiple confs/ w/ Y. Kopel re class cert strategy and drafting class cert motion	1.6	\$1,000.00	\$1,600.00
2017.03.01	Bell & Howell	YZK	Draft class cert motion	9.1	\$575.00	\$5,232.50
2017.03.02	Bell & Howell	SAB	Multiple confs/ w/ Y. Kopel re class cert strategy and drafting class cert motion	2.2	\$1,000.00	\$2,200.00
2017.03.02	Bell & Howell	YZK	Book travel plans for Bueno dep	0.3	\$575.00	\$172.50
2017.03.02	Bell & Howell	YZK	Conf w/ opposing counsel re scheduling and doc production	0.4	\$575.00	\$230.00
2017.03.02	Bell & Howell	YZK	Draft class cert motion	7.3	\$575.00	\$4,197.50
2017.03.02	Bell & Howell	EMW	Began printing for transcript book for YZK (.2)	0.2	\$300.00	\$60.00
2017.03.03	Bell & Howell	YZK	Draft class cert motion	7.5	\$575.00	\$4,312.50
2017.03.03	Bell & Howell	EMW	Finished making transcript book for YZK (.3)	0.3	\$300.00	\$90.00
2017.03.06	Bell & Howell	YZK	Research and drafting class cert and ancillary docs	8.5	\$575.00	\$4,887.50
2017.03.06	Bell & Howell	EMW	Found and saved exhibits to box (.3)	0.3	\$300.00	\$90.00
2017.03.07	Bell & Howell	SAB	Multiple teleconfs w/ Y. Kopel re prep for class rep deposition	0.8	\$1,000.00	\$800.00
2017.03.07	Bell & Howell	YZK	Research for class cert	2.0	\$575.00	\$1,150.00
2017.03.07	Bell & Howell	YZK	Assemble, review, and serve Bueno production	1.3	\$575.00	\$747.50
2017.03.07	Bell & Howell	YZK	Collaborate on Weir declaration	0.5	\$575.00	\$287.50
2017.03.07	Bell & Howell	YZK	Finalize travel plans	0.6	\$575.00	\$322.00
2017.03.07	Bell & Howell	YZK	Bueno depo prep	2.7	\$575.00	\$1,552.50
2017.03.07	Bell & Howell	EMW	Bates stamped plf's doc production	0.3	\$300.00	\$90.00
2017.03.08	Bell & Howell	SAB	Multiple teleconfs w/ Y. Kopel re prep for class rep deposition	1.3	\$1,000.00	\$1,300.00

DATE	MATTER	ATTY	DESCRIPTION	TIME	RATE	AMOUNT
2017.03.08	Bell & Howell	YZK	Travel from from client's house back to hotel	0.4	\$575.00	\$230.00
2017.03.08	Bell & Howell	YZK	Prep w/ client for dep	3.5	\$575.00	\$2,012.50
2017.03.08	Bell & Howell	YZK	Travel from hotel to client's house	0.6	\$575.00	\$345.00
2017.03.08	Bell & Howell	YZK	Travel from NJ to hotel	10.1	\$575.00	\$5,807.50
2017.03.09	Bell & Howell	SAB	Debrief w/ Y. Kopel after class rep deposition	0.5	\$1,000.00	\$500.00
2017.03.09	Bell & Howell	JIM	Confer with Y. Kopel in preparation for today's deposition	0.2	\$850.00	\$170.00
2017.03.09	Bell & Howell	YZK	Travel back to NJ	8.0	\$575.00	\$4,600.00
2017.03.09	Bell & Howell	YZK	Prep for dep	1.5	\$575.00	\$862.50
2017.03.09	Bell & Howell	YZK	Conf w/ client about case following deposition	1.7	\$575.00	\$977.50
2017.03.09	Bell & Howell	YZK	Defend dep	2.7	\$575.00	\$1,552.50
2017.03.10	Bell & Howell	YZK	Draft class cert papers	2.1	\$575.00	\$1,207.50
2017.03.13	Bell & Howell	SAB	Multiple teleconfs. w/ Y. Kopel re drafting class cert motion	1.8	\$1,000.00	\$1,800.00
2017.03.13	Bell & Howell	YZK	Draft class cert papers	8.9	\$575.00	\$5,117.50
2017.03.13	Bell & Howell	AML	Research and assemble privity chart project for class certification motion	1.0	\$450.00	\$450.00
2017.03.13	Bell & Howell	EMW	Redacted and bates stamped P's production (.4), Conf. w. YZK and RSR re. Class Cert motion (.4), Began assisting w. Class Cert motion (.5)	1.3	\$300.00	\$390.00
2017.03.13	Bell & Howell	RSR	Team meeting with YZK and EMW re class cert brief due Thursday (.5), called to clerk re motion to seal procedures and conf. w/ YZK re same (.3), began drafting Kopel decl (1), began drafting Notice of Motion (1), conf. w/ EMW re Kopel Decl. Exhibit organization (.4)	3.2	\$300.00	\$960.00
2017.03.14	Bell & Howell	SAB	Revised draft class cert brief and related documents	4.3	\$1,000.00	\$4,300.00
2017.03.14	Bell & Howell	JIM	Review and comment on draft class certification brief	1.5	\$850.00	\$1,275.00
2017.03.14	Bell & Howell	NJD	Review and revision of class cert motion with YZK and JIM	3.2	\$600.00	\$1,920.00
2017.03.14	Bell & Howell	YZK	Revise class cert brief	2.1	\$575.00	\$1,207.50
2017.03.14	Bell & Howell	YZK	Work w/ C Weir on report	0.5	\$575.00	\$287.50
2017.03.14	Bell & Howell	AML	Continue privity chart project for class certification	5.5	\$450.00	\$2,475.00
2017.03.15	Bell & Howell	SAB	Revised draft class cert briefs	3.8	\$1,000.00	\$3,800.00
2017.03.15	Bell & Howell	JIM	Comment on draft class certification brief and discuss changes with Y. Kopel	1.0	\$850.00	\$850.00
2017.03.15	Bell & Howell	YZK	Draft and prepare class cert papers	9.9	\$575.00	\$5,692.50
2017.03.15	Bell & Howell	AML	Privity chart project for YZK; reliance chart	3.6	\$450.00	\$1,620.00
2017.03.15	Bell & Howell	EMW	Work on formatting documents for class certification	3.6	\$300.00	\$1,080.00
2017.03.15	Bell & Howell	RSR	Assisted with class cert motion and ancillary docs (4.4)	4.4	\$300.00	\$1,320.00
2017.03.16	Bell & Howell	JIM	Review and revise draft class certification brief and ancillary documents	1.2	\$850.00	\$1,020.00
2017.03.16	Bell & Howell	YZK	Finalize and file class cert papers	10.1	\$575.00	\$5,807.50
2017.03.16	Bell & Howell	EMW	Assisted with Class Cert filing (5.2)	5.2	\$300.00	\$1,560.00

DATE	MATTER	ATTY	DESCRIPTION	TIME	RATE	AMOUNT
2017.03.16	Bell & Howell	RSR	Assisted with class cert motion due today (4.2)	4.2	\$300.00	\$1,260.00
2017.03.17	Bell & Howell	YZK	Review MTD	0.5	\$575.00	\$287.50
2017.03.17	Bell & Howell	YZK	Assemble courtesy copies for all filings	1.3	\$575.00	\$747.50
2017.03.17	Bell & Howell	EMW	Assisted with preparing and sending courtesy copies (3) Saved Class Cert Filings to box (.3)	3.3	\$300.00	\$990.00
2017.03.17	Bell & Howell	RSR	Prepared courtesy copies of class cert filings and sealed docs (2.9)	2.9	\$300.00	\$870.00
2017.03.21	Bell & Howell	YZK	Finalize and circulate new doc production	0.5	\$575.00	\$287.50
2017.03.21	Bell & Howell	EMW	Bates stamped p's production (.3)	0.3	\$300.00	\$90.00
2017.03.27	Bell & Howell	YZK	Review new NY class cert opinion for relevance	0.4	\$575.00	\$230.00
2017.03.29	Bell & Howell	YZK	Research for MTD Opp	1.5	\$575.00	\$862.50
2017.03.30	Bell & Howell	YZK	Research on economic loss rule	2.5	\$575.00	\$1,437.50
2017.03.30	Bell & Howell	YOK	Call with Mr. Kopel re MTD opposition and 26(f) report, research re same	0.5	\$550.00	\$275.00
2017.04.03	Bell & Howell	YZK	Conduct research for MTD Opp	5.4	\$575.00	\$3,105.00
2017.04.03	Bell & Howell	YOK	Call and email exchanges with Yitz Kopel re scienter and 9(b), reviewed cases re same and emailed decisions to Mr. Kopel	0.5	\$550.00	\$275.00
2017.04.04	Bell & Howell	YZK	Draft MTD Opposition	7.9	\$575.00	\$4,542.50
2017.04.04	Bell & Howell	FJK	Conf w/ Y. Kopel re choice of law questions & MTD briefing questions (.3);	0.3	\$550.00	\$165.00
2017.04.04	Bell & Howell	YOK	Emailed Yitz Kopel re Rule 9(b)	0.1	\$550.00	\$55.00
2017.04.05	Bell & Howell	YZK	Draft MTD Opposition	9.4	\$575.00	\$5,405.00
2017.04.06	Bell & Howell	SAB	Revised draft mtd oppn (3.3); teleconf. w/ Y. Kopel re same (.4)	3.7	\$1,000.00	\$3,700.00
2017.04.06	Bell & Howell	YZK	Draft MTD Opposition	8.5	\$575.00	\$4,887.50
2017.04.07	Bell & Howell	SAB	Revised draft mtd oppn (4.4); teleconf. w/ Y. Kopel re same (.4)	4.8	\$1,000.00	\$4,800.00
2017.04.07	Bell & Howell	YZK	Continue work on MTD Opposition	6.2	\$575.00	\$3,565.00
2017.04.09	Bell & Howell	YZK	Begin draft discovery dispute letter	1.5	\$575.00	\$862.50
2017.04.10	Bell & Howell	YZK	Complete discovery dispute letter	1.3	\$575.00	\$747.50
2017.04.13	Bell & Howell	YZK	Revise MTD Opp	1.3	\$575.00	\$747.50
2017.04.19	Bell & Howell	YZK	Continue work on MTD Opposition	2.4	\$575.00	\$1,380.00
2017.04.20	Bell & Howell	SAB	Revised draft mtd oppn (1.8); conf. w/ Y. Kopel re same (.5)	2.3	\$1,000.00	\$2,300.00
2017.04.20	Bell & Howell	YZK	Email opposing counsel re discovery dispute	0.1	\$575.00	\$57.50
2017.04.20	Bell & Howell	YZK	Revisions to MTD Opp	4.2	\$575.00	\$2,415.00
2017.04.20	Bell & Howell	FJK	Analyzed & redlined MTD opp'n & conf w/ Y. Kopel re same (1.9);	1.9	\$550.00	\$1,045.00
2017.04.21	Bell & Howell	YZK	Key in FJK revisions to MTD Opp	0.3	\$575.00	\$172.50
2017.04.23	Bell & Howell	YZK	Review and mark up MTD Opp	0.2	\$575.00	\$115.00
2017.04.24	Bell & Howell	YZK	Finalize and file MTC Letter	1.3	\$575.00	\$747.50
2017.04.24	Bell & Howell	DLS	Put filed letter on box and prepared for mailing	0.2	\$300.00	\$60.00
2017.04.24	Bell & Howell	RSR	Assisted with B&H brief due Thursday (1)	1.0	\$300.00	\$300.00

DATE	MATTER	ATTY	DESCRIPTION	TIME	RATE	AMOUNT
2017.04.25	Bell & Howell	YZK	Finalize MTD Opp	3.1	\$575.00	\$1,782.50
2017.04.25	Bell & Howell	YZK	Read memo endorsement	0.1	\$575.00	\$57.50
2017.04.25	Bell & Howell	RSR	Prepared tables for MTD Oppn (1.2)	1.2	\$300.00	\$360.00
2017.04.26	Bell & Howell	SAB	Read letters to Judge Pauley re defendant's failure to produce sales figures and multiple confs. w/ Y. Kopel re same (.4)	0.4	\$1,000.00	\$400.00
2017.04.26	Bell & Howell	YZK	Draft and revise discovery letter	2.8	\$575.00	\$1,610.00
2017.04.26	Bell & Howell	YZK	Review new letter and filing from Ds, and conf w/ team re same	1.0	\$575.00	\$575.00
2017.04.27	Bell & Howell	YZK	Finalize and file MTD Opp'n	1.8	\$575.00	\$1,035.00
2017.04.27	Bell & Howell	RSR	Prepared courtesy copies of MTD oppn (.6)	0.6	\$300.00	\$180.00
2017.04.29	Bell & Howell	YZK	Review class cert opp and conduct research re same	2.7	\$575.00	\$1,552.50
2017.05.02	Bell & Howell	YZK	Research re nationwide fraud class decisions	2.8	\$575.00	\$1,610.00
2017.05.03	Bell & Howell	YZK	Research and compile Economic loss rule chart	10.8	\$575.00	\$6,210.00
2017.05.03	Bell & Howell	FJK	Conf w/ Y. Kopel re conflict of laws issues (.3); research re conflict of laws & conf w/ Y. Kopel re same (.5);	0.8	\$550.00	\$440.00
2017.05.03	Bell & Howell	AML	Research re: ELR and chart draft	4.1	\$450.00	\$1,845.00
2017.05.04	Bell & Howell	YZK	Draft class cert reply	7.6	\$575.00	\$4,370.00
2017.05.04	Bell & Howell	FJK	Conf w/ J. Marchese & Y. Kopel re conflict of laws issues (.3);	0.3	\$550.00	\$165.00
2017.05.05	Bell & Howell	LTF	Discussed class cert reply brief with Yitz Kopel.	0.2	\$1,000.00	\$200.00
2017.05.05	Bell & Howell	SAB	Read class cert oppn and conf. w/ Y. Kopel re strategy for reply brief	2.7	\$1,000.00	\$2,700.00
2017.05.05	Bell & Howell	YZK	Work on class cert reply	7.1	\$575.00	\$4,082.50
2017.05.05	Bell & Howell	FJK	Conf w/ Y. Kopel re conflict of laws issues (.3);	0.3	\$550.00	\$165.00
2017.05.05	Bell & Howell	TAR	Discuss class cert reply w/ YZK and start work on charts	1.2	\$450.00	\$540.00
2017.05.06	Bell & Howell	YZK	Work class cert reply	3.7	\$575.00	\$2,127.50
2017.05.07	Bell & Howell	YZK	Draft class cert reply	3.5	\$575.00	\$2,012.50
2017.05.07	Bell & Howell	TAR	Research and draft table re economic loss rule in the absence of a contract	2.5	\$450.00	\$1,125.00
2017.05.08	Bell & Howell	LTF	Discussed class cert reply with Yitz Kopel.	0.2	\$1,000.00	\$200.00
2017.05.08	Bell & Howell	SAB	Revised draft class cert reply (3.8); conf. w/ Y. Kopel re same (.3)	4.1	\$1,000.00	\$4,100.00
2017.05.08	Bell & Howell	YZK	Draft class cert reply	9.5	\$575.00	\$5,462.50
2017.05.08	Bell & Howell	FJK	Conf w/ Y. Kopel re warranty charts (.2);	0.2	\$550.00	\$110.00
2017.05.08	Bell & Howell	AML	Updated reliance chart for YZK brief	0.6	\$450.00	\$270.00
2017.05.08	Bell & Howell	TAR	Research and draft table re economic loss rule in the absence of a contract	5.8	\$450.00	\$2,610.00
2017.05.08	Bell & Howell	TAR	Research and draft table re Fraud and the Economic Loss Rule	6.5	\$450.00	\$2,925.00
2017.05.08	Bell & Howell	RSR	Prepared chart for class cert reply (1)	1.0	\$300.00	\$300.00
2017.05.09	Bell & Howell	SAB	Revised draft class cert reply (2.1); conf. w Y. Kopel re same (.3)	2.4	\$1,000.00	\$2,400.00
2017.05.09	Bell & Howell	JIM	Review and comment on class certification reply brief and discuss revisions with Y. Kopel	2.1	\$850.00	\$1,785.00

DATE	MATTER	ATTY	DESCRIPTION	TIME	RATE	AMOUNT
2017.05.09	Bell & Howell	YZK	Exchange emails w/ clients	0.4	\$575.00	\$230.00
2017.05.09	Bell & Howell	YZK	Draft class cert reply	10.3	\$575.00	\$5,922.50
2017.05.09	Bell & Howell	TAR	Edit Class cert reply	1.2	\$450.00	\$540.00
2017.05.09	Bell & Howell	TAR	Research and draft table re economic loss rule in the absence of a contract	11.8	\$450.00	\$5,310.00
2017.05.10	Bell & Howell	LTF	Discussed reply brief with Thomas Reyda and Yitz Kopel.	0.1	\$1,000.00	\$100.00
2017.05.10	Bell & Howell	YZK	Work on class cert reply	11.5	\$575.00	\$6,612.50
2017.05.10	Bell & Howell	FJK	Assist Y. Kopel w/ class cert reply brief (.2)	0.2	\$550.00	\$110.00
2017.05.10	Bell & Howell	TAR	Finalize tables for Class Cert Reply	2.1	\$450.00	\$945.00
2017.05.10	Bell & Howell	EMW	Assisted w. reply filing (.3)	0.3	\$300.00	\$90.00
2017.05.10	Bell & Howell	RSR	Assisted with Class Cert reply due today (3.3)	3.3	\$300.00	\$990.00
2017.05.11	Bell & Howell	YZK	Review and analyze MTD reply	0.4	\$575.00	\$230.00
2017.05.11	Bell & Howell	YZK	Oversee courtesy copies	0.4	\$575.00	\$230.00
2017.05.11	Bell & Howell	EMW	Assisted w. courtesy copies (.3)	0.3	\$300.00	\$90.00
2017.05.11	Bell & Howell	RSR	Prepared courtesy copies (.5)	0.5	\$300.00	\$150.00
2017.05.12	Bell & Howell	EMW	Class cert. hearing prep (2.5)	2.5	\$300.00	\$750.00
2017.05.15	Bell & Howell	EMW	Class cert hearing prep (2)	2.0	\$300.00	\$600.00
2017.05.16	Bell & Howell	AFS	Review documents in advance of hearing.	1.3	\$350.00	\$455.00
2017.05.17	Bell & Howell	YZK	Hearing prep in advance of CC/MTD hearing	1.9	\$575.00	\$1,092.50
2017.05.17	Bell & Howell	AFS	Review documents in advance of hearing.	3.9	\$350.00	\$1,365.00
2017.05.18	Bell & Howell	SAB	Multiple confs. w/ Y. Kopel re prep for class cert hearing	1.3	\$1,000.00	\$1,300.00
2017.05.18	Bell & Howell	YZK	Prep for hearing	3.5	\$575.00	\$2,012.50
2017.05.18	Bell & Howell	AFS	Review documents in advance of hearing.	0.3	\$350.00	\$105.00
2017.05.19	Bell & Howell	SAB	Teleconf. w/ Y. Kopel re debrief after today's class cert hearing	0.5	\$1,000.00	\$500.00
2017.05.19	Bell & Howell	JIM	Prepare for and attend oral argument for motion to dismiss and class certification motion	3.0	\$850.00	\$2,550.00
2017.05.19	Bell & Howell	YZK	Prep for, travel to, and attend hearing	5.3	\$575.00	\$3,047.50
2017.05.19	Bell & Howell	AFS	Prepare for hearing (.5) and attend same (2).	2.5	\$350.00	\$875.00
2017.05.22	Bell & Howell	YZK	Confer w/ AFS re research on Judge Pauley class cert decisions	0.2	\$575.00	\$115.00
2017.05.22	Bell & Howell	AFS	Research J. Pauley's average time to decision for class action cert.	2.5	\$350.00	\$875.00
2017.05.22	Bell & Howell	RSR	Ordered transcript from oral argument (.2)	0.2	\$300.00	\$60.00
2017.05.23	Bell & Howell	AFS	Research J. Pauley's time to decision for class action cert - follow up.	0.8	\$350.00	\$280.00
2017.05.24	Bell & Howell	YZK	Draft 2d interrogatories	0.6	\$575.00	\$345.00
2017.05.25	Bell & Howell	YZK	Work with experts on new interrogatories	0.6	\$575.00	\$345.00
2017.05.25	Bell & Howell	AFS	Attend Y. Kopel teleconference with C. Weir.	0.3	\$350.00	\$105.00
2017.05.30	Bell & Howell	YZK	Review hearing transcript	0.3	\$575.00	\$172.50
2017.05.31	Bell & Howell	SAB	Read transcript of class cert hearing	1.1	\$1,000.00	\$1,100.00

DATE	MATTER	ATTY	DESCRIPTION	TIME	RATE	AMOUNT
2017.07.07	Bell & Howell	SAB	Read class cert opinion (.4); conf. call w/ Y. Kopel re next steps (.2)	0.6	\$1,000.00	\$600.00
2017.07.07	Bell & Howell	JIM	Review and analyze the court's opinion on the motion to dismiss and motion for class certification	0.8	\$850.00	\$680.00
2017.07.07	Bell & Howell	YZK	Call w/ M Potter re product testing	1.4	\$575.00	\$805.00
2017.07.07	Bell & Howell	YZK	Review and analyze class cert decision	0.7	\$575.00	\$402.50
2017.07.10	Bell & Howell	JIM	Confer with Y. Kopel about plan for notice of pendency of class action	0.5	\$850.00	\$425.00
2017.07.10	Bell & Howell	YZK	Review and analyze Ds' supplemental interrogatory responses	0.6	\$575.00	\$345.00
2017.07.11	Bell & Howell	YZK	Update clients re class certification	0.6	\$575.00	\$345.00
2017.07.11	Bell & Howell	AFS	Research research and draft final objections to defendants' proposed jury instructions and confer with Y. Kopel re objection to same (4.2); prepare Plaintiffs' amended witness and exhibit lists and pull related exhibit files (.8); prepare J. Guindi deposition designations (1.2).	6.2	\$350.00	\$2,170.00
2017.07.12	Bell & Howell	YZK	Call w/ M. Potter re testing	0.5	\$575.00	\$287.50
2017.07.12	Bell & Howell	YZK	Conf w/ S Bueno re next steps	0.4	\$575.00	\$230.00
2017.07.12	Bell & Howell	YZK	Research and drafting notice plan and acillary docs	2.9	\$575.00	\$1,667.50
2017.07.13	Bell & Howell	YZK	Research re notice and calls w/ admin	2.8	\$575.00	\$1,610.00
2017.07.17	Bell & Howell	YZK	Get in touch w/ class admins	1.6	\$575.00	\$920.00
2017.07.18	Bell & Howell	YZK	Calls w/ notice admins	2.5	\$575.00	\$1,437.50
2017.07.19	Bell & Howell	LTF	Discussed notice with Yitz Kopel.	0.4	\$1,000.00	\$400.00
2017.07.19	Bell & Howell	YZK	Class notice prep	2.7	\$575.00	\$1,552.50
2017.07.20	Bell & Howell	LTF	Discussed notice with Yitz Kopel.	0.2	\$1,000.00	\$200.00
2017.07.20	Bell & Howell	YZK	Call w/ B Gorman re Dr. Leonard production	0.6	\$575.00	\$345.00
2017.07.20	Bell & Howell	YZK	Calls and emails w/ claims admins taking bids etc	3.8	\$575.00	\$2,185.00
2017.07.25	Bell & Howell	LTF	Discussed notice plan with Yitz Kopel.	0.2	\$1,000.00	\$200.00
2017.07.25	Bell & Howell	YZK	Emails w/ expert	0.2	\$575.00	\$115.00
2017.07.28	Bell & Howell	YZK	Calls w/ 2 notice admins	1.2	\$575.00	\$690.00
2017.07.28	Bell & Howell	YZK	Draft and circulate scheduling letter	1.3	\$575.00	\$747.50
2017.07.28`	Bell & Howell	YZK	Call w/ M. Potter re testing	0.7	\$575.00	\$402.50
2017.07.31	Bell & Howell	YZK	Call w/ M Potter re protocol	0.8	\$575.00	\$460.00
2017.07.31	Bell & Howell	YZK	Review M Potter's draft protocol	0.6	\$575.00	\$345.00
2017.07.31	Bell & Howell	YZK	Calls w/ B Wickersham and Epiq re Notice	0.6	\$575.00	\$345.00
2017.08.02	Bell & Howell	YZK	Follow up w/ opposing counsel re scheduling letter	0.1	\$575.00	\$57.50
2017.08.02	Bell & Howell	YZK	Review D's scheduling proposals and respond to same	0.2	\$575.00	\$115.00
2017.08.03	Bell & Howell	YZK	Work w/ opposing counsel to finalize and file scheduling letter	0.9	\$575.00	\$517.50
2017.08.07	Bell & Howell	YZK	Work on notice plan drafts	2.6	\$575.00	\$1,495.00
2017.08.10	Bell & Howell	SAB	Revised draft notice plan	0.3	\$1,000.00	\$300.00

DATE	MATTER	ATTY	DESCRIPTION	TIME	RATE	AMOUNT
2017.08.11	Bell & Howell	YZK	Prep for and attend court conference	1.4	\$575.00	\$805.00
2017.08.14	Bell & Howell	YZK	Work on expert reports	2.1	\$575.00	\$1,207.50
2017.08.15	Bell & Howell	SAB	Conf. w/ Y. Kopel re next steps for class notice	0.3	\$1,000.00	\$300.00
2017.08.15	Bell & Howell	NJD	Worked with YZK on registration of notice websites	0.2	\$600.00	\$120.00
2017.08.16	Bell & Howell	SAB	Analyzed proposed testing protocols (2.5); multiple confs. w/ Y. Kopel re same (.8)	3.3	\$1,000.00	\$3,300.00
2017.08.16	Bell & Howell	YZK	Call w/ Christie Holt from HSN	0.3	\$575.00	\$172.50
2017.08.16	Bell & Howell	YZK	Coordinate on testing protocol	2.4	\$575.00	\$1,380.00
2017.08.17	Bell & Howell	JIM	Review and comment on draft notice plan and confer with Y. Kopel about same (.5); confer with Y. Kopel about expert discovery issues (.2)	0.7	\$850.00	\$595.00
2017.08.17	Bell & Howell	YZK	Coordinate w/ Epiq re formulation of publication plan	2.1	\$575.00	\$1,207.50
2017.08.17	Bell & Howell	YZK	Conf w/ JIM re notice plan and expert discovery	0.4	\$575.00	\$230.00
2017.08.17	Bell & Howell	YZK	Coordinate testing w/ labs	1.7	\$575.00	\$977.50
2017.08.18	Bell & Howell	YZK	Complete and circulate notice plan	1.8	\$575.00	\$1,035.00
2017.08.28	Bell & Howell	YZK	Email B Wickersham re notice	0.1	\$575.00	\$57.50
2017.08.29	Bell & Howell	LTF	Discussed testing issues with Yitz Kopel.	0.2	\$1,000.00	\$200.00
2017.08.29	Bell & Howell	YZK	Discuss notice status with team and email opposing counsel re same	0.2	\$575.00	\$115.00
2017.08.29	Bell & Howell	YZK	Call w/ M Potter	0.6	\$575.00	\$345.00
2017.08.30	Bell & Howell	YZK	Prep for and attend call w/ M Potter re status of efficacy studies and report	1.2	\$575.00	\$690.00
2017.09.01	Bell & Howell	YZK	Call w/ M Potter re testing	1.3	\$575.00	\$747.50
2017.09.06	Bell & Howell	JIM	Confer with Y. Kopel about notice proposal and about expert discovery issues	0.5	\$850.00	\$425.00
2017.09.06	Bell & Howell	YZK	Return call to B Wickersham	0.4	\$575.00	\$230.00
2017.09.06	Bell & Howell	YZK	Prep for and attend call re testing	0.7	\$575.00	\$402.50
2017.09.07	Bell & Howell	SAB	Analyzed draft notice plan (1.1); multiple confs. w/ Y. Kopel re same (.6)	1.7	\$1,000.00	\$1,700.00
2017.09.07	Bell & Howell	YZK	Calls w/ M Potter re expert testing	1.0	\$575.00	\$575.00
2017.09.08	Bell & Howell	LTF	Discussed expert testing with Yitz Kopel.	0.3	\$1,000.00	\$300.00
2017.09.08	Bell & Howell	JIM	Confer with Y. Kopel about draft notice documents and about expert discovery issues	0.5	\$850.00	\$425.00
2017.09.08	Bell & Howell	NJD	Bought domain for notice website	0.3	\$600.00	\$180.00
2017.09.08	Bell & Howell	YZK	Conf w/ opposing counsel re motion to delay notice and review premotion letter re same	0.9	\$575.00	\$517.50
2017.09.08	Bell & Howell	YZK	Negotiate, finalize and submit notice plan	4.0	\$575.00	\$2,300.00
2017.09.08	Bell & Howell	YZK	Phone calls re expert testing	2.5	\$575.00	\$1,437.50
2017.09.09	Bell & Howell	YZK	Research re motion to delay certification	1.1	\$575.00	\$632.50
2017.09.11	Bell & Howell	LTF	Calls with Yitz Kopel, Scott Bursor and Mike Potter regarding expert testing.	0.9	\$1,000.00	\$900.00
2017.09.11	Bell & Howell	SAB	Conf w/ Y. Kopel & T. Fisher re expert testing (.3)	0.3	\$1,000.00	\$300.00

DATE	MATTER	ATTY	DESCRIPTION	TIME	RATE	AMOUNT
2017.09.11	Bell & Howell	YZK	Research re determination of tests to run	2.5	\$575.00	\$1,437.50
2017.09.11	Bell & Howell	YZK	Call w/ M Potter	0.2	\$575.00	\$115.00
2017.09.12	Bell & Howell	YZK	Call w/ M potter	0.2	\$575.00	\$115.00
2017.09.12	Bell & Howell	YZK	Review Ds' notice proposal	0.4	\$575.00	\$230.00
2017.09.12	Bell & Howell	YZK	Research for notice letter response	1.5	\$575.00	\$862.50
2017.09.13	Bell & Howell	SAB	Revised draft letter to court re proposed notice plan (1.1); conf. w/ Y. Kopel re same (.3)	1.4	\$1,000.00	\$1,400.00
2017.09.13	Bell & Howell	YZK	Draft notice response letter	6.8	\$575.00	\$3,910.00
2017.09.13	Bell & Howell	YZK	Email case update to client	0.2	\$575.00	\$115.00
2017.09.13	Bell & Howell	RSR	Ordered transcript from 8/11 conf. call (.1)	0.1	\$300.00	\$30.00
2017.09.15	Bell & Howell	LTF	Discussed expert testing with Yitz Kopel, Scott Bursor and expert witness.	0.9	\$1,000.00	\$900.00
2017.09.15	Bell & Howell	YZK	Finalize and file letter with court	0.9	\$575.00	\$517.50
2017.09.15	Bell & Howell	YZK	Prep for and attend conf w/ team to make decision re rodent testing	2.2	\$575.00	\$1,265.00
2017.09.18	Bell & Howell	YZK	Call w/ M Potter re testing	0.5	\$575.00	\$287.50
2017.09.18	Bell & Howell	EMW	Prepared and sent courtesy copy of 09/15 letter to judge (.3)	0.3	\$300.00	\$90.00
2017.09.20	Bell & Howell	YZK	Work on rescheduling teleconference	0.8	\$575.00	\$460.00
2017.09.22	Bell & Howell	LTF	Call with Mike Potter regarding rodent testing.	0.2	\$1,000.00	\$200.00
2017.09.25	Bell & Howell	YZK	Respond to emails from notice admins	0.2	\$575.00	\$115.00
2017.09.25	Bell & Howell	YZK	Call w/ M Potter	0.3	\$575.00	\$172.50
2017.10.02	Bell & Howell	LTF	Discussed expert testing with Yitz Kopel.	0.1	\$1,000.00	\$100.00
2017.10.02	Bell & Howell	YZK	Sign and return protocol to B Donahue	0.2	\$575.00	\$115.00
2017.10.02	Bell & Howell	YZK	Prep for and attend court conference re notice	1.5	\$575.00	\$862.50
2017.10.03	Bell & Howell	YZK	Compose email to admin re class notice	0.1	\$575.00	\$57.50
2017.10.04	Bell & Howell	YZK	Call w/ M Potter	0.1	\$575.00	\$57.50
2017.10.09	Bell & Howell	SAB	Multiple confs. w/ Y. Kopel re expert reports	1.5	\$1,000.00	\$1,500.00
2017.10.09	Bell & Howell	YZK	Calls and emails to opposing counsel re notice plan	0.2	\$575.00	\$115.00
2017.10.09	Bell & Howell	YZK	Call w/ M Potter	0.1	\$575.00	\$57.50
2017.10.09	Bell & Howell	YZK	Conf w/ LTF re lab invoices	0.2	\$575.00	\$115.00
2017.10.09	Bell & Howell	YZK	Work on drafting expert reports	5.8	\$575.00	\$3,335.00
2017.10.11	Bell & Howell	SAB	Conf. w/ Y. Kopel re settlement negotiation strategy	0.3	\$1,000.00	\$300.00
2017.10.11	Bell & Howell	YZK	Work on Potter report	1.0	\$575.00	\$575.00
2017.10.11	Bell & Howell	YZK	Conf w/ team re B+H settlement demand	0.4	\$575.00	\$230.00
2017.10.11	Bell & Howell	YZK	Conf w/ counsel re notice plan (.3); review their notice proposals (.3)	0.6	\$575.00	\$345.00
2017.10.11	Bell & Howell	RSR	Conf. w/ YZK re expert report chart and began making chart (.8)	0.8	\$300.00	\$240.00
2017.10.12	Bell & Howell	RSR	Continued expert report chart (2.2)	2.2	\$300.00	\$660.00

DATE	MATTER	ATTY	DESCRIPTION	TIME	RATE	AMOUNT
2017.10.13	Bell & Howell	EMW	Assisted w. formatting Potter report (.5) Began drafting BHH studies excel sheet (1)	1.5	\$300.00	\$450.00
2017.10.13	Bell & Howell	RSR	Prepared chart of repeller studies for Potter expert report (3)	3.0	\$300.00	\$900.00
2017.10.16	Bell & Howell	YZK	Work w/ opposing counsel to finalize notice plan	0.4	\$575.00	\$230.00
2017.10.17	Bell & Howell	YZK	Deal with class notice negotiations	1.9	\$575.00	\$1,092.50
2017.10.18	Bell & Howell	YZK	Deal more with class notice issues	2.0	\$575.00	\$1,150.00
2017.10.19	Bell & Howell	YZK	Review yesterday's fillings	0.3	\$575.00	\$172.50
2017.10.19	Bell & Howell	EMW	Saved and printed 2017.10.18 Notice letter and attachments (.4)	0.4	\$300.00	\$120.00
2017.10.20	Bell & Howell	YZK	Work on expert reports	4.4	\$575.00	\$2,530.00
2017.10.21	Bell & Howell	SAB	Read and revised draft expert reports	5.3	\$1,000.00	\$5,300.00
2017.10.22	Bell & Howell	SAB	Read and revised draft Potter and Weir reports	4.6	\$1,000.00	\$4,600.00
2017.10.23	Bell & Howell	YZK	Work on expert reports	2.4	\$575.00	\$1,380.00
2017.10.23	Bell & Howell	EMW	Found, organized, and saved discovery docs for Potter review (.5)	0.5	\$300.00	\$150.00
2017.10.24	Bell & Howell	YZK	Work on Weir report	1.3	\$575.00	\$747.50
2017.10.24	Bell & Howell	YZK	Work on Potter report	4.4	\$575.00	\$2,530.00
2017.10.25	Bell & Howell	LTF	Discussed rodent testing results and expert reports with Yitz Kopel and Joel Smith.	0.2	\$1,000.00	\$200.00
2017.10.25	Bell & Howell	YZK	Prepare class notice docs	0.4	\$575.00	\$230.00
2017.10.25	Bell & Howell	YZK	Work on expert reports	3.7	\$575.00	\$2,127.50
2017.10.25	Bell & Howell	RSR	Prepared retailers subpoenas pursuant to notice plan (2), prepared notice of subpoenas (.2), calendared dates from notice plan (.3)	2.5	\$300.00	\$750.00
2017.10.26	Bell & Howell	LTF	Discussed expert report with Yitz Kopel and reviewed dropbox files.	0.2	\$1,000.00	\$200.00
2017.10.26	Bell & Howell	YZK	Work on expert reports	3.3	\$575.00	\$1,897.50
2017.10.26	Bell & Howell	YZK	Oversee subpoenas	0.3	\$575.00	\$172.50
2017.10.26	Bell & Howell	RSR	Updated retailer subpoenas and notice of subpoenas and served with First Legal (1)	1.0	\$300.00	\$300.00
2017.10.27	Bell & Howell	YZK	Work on Potter report	3.2	\$575.00	\$1,840.00
2017.10.28	Bell & Howell	SAB	Read and revised draft Potter and Weir reports	3.5	\$1,000.00	\$3,500.00
2017.10.29	Bell & Howell	SAB	Read and revised draft Potter and Weir reports	3.1	\$1,000.00	\$3,100.00
2017.10.30	Bell & Howell	LTF	Reviewed and edited Potter report and discussed it with Yitz Kopel (1.8); discussed notice issue with Mr. Kopel (.1).	1.9	\$1,000.00	\$1,900.00
2017.10.30	Bell & Howell	SAB	Revised draft expert reports	2.9	\$1,000.00	\$2,900.00
2017.10.30	Bell & Howell	YZK	Work on expert reports	12.1	\$575.00	\$6,957.50
2017.10.30	Bell & Howell	EMW	Assisted w. Initial report filing due 10/31 (1)	1.0	\$300.00	\$300.00
2017.10.30	Bell & Howell	RSR	Formatted Potter expert report (.6)	0.6	\$300.00	\$180.00
2017.10.31	Bell & Howell	LTF	Exchanged messages with Yitz Kopel regarding expert reports.	0.1	\$1,000.00	\$100.00
2017.10.31	Bell & Howell	SAB	Revised draft expert reports	1.9	\$1,000.00	\$1,900.00

DATE	MATTER	ATTY	DESCRIPTION	TIME	RATE	AMOUNT
2017.10.31	Bell & Howell	YZK	Finalize and serve expert reports	12.1	\$575.00	\$6,957.50
2017.10.31	Bell & Howell	YZK	Calls w/ retailer re notice subpoena	0.4	\$575.00	\$230.00
2017.10.31	Bell & Howell	YZK	Call w/ C Weir	0.3	\$575.00	\$172.50
2017.10.31	Bell & Howell	EMW	Assisted w. Initial Reports that are due today (1)	1.0	\$300.00	\$300.00
2017.10.31	Bell & Howell	RSR	Assisted with expert reports due today (1.7)	1.7	\$300.00	\$510.00
2017.11.01	Bell & Howell	YZK	Review and analyze Ds' expert reports	1.8	\$575.00	\$1,035.00
2017.11.01	Bell & Howell	YZK	Calls w/ retailers re notice	0.5	\$575.00	\$287.50
2017.11.01	Bell & Howell	RSR	Prepared cover letter and sent expert videos to opposing counsel (.2)	0.2	\$300.00	\$60.00
2017.11.07	Bell & Howell	YZK	Draft letter to court re amendment to class notice and file	0.5	\$575.00	\$287.50
2017.11.07	Bell & Howell	YZK	Call w/ opposing counsel	0.2	\$575.00	\$115.00
2017.11.08	Bell & Howell	YZK	Calls w/ retailers re subpoenas	0.7	\$575.00	\$402.50
2017.11.08	Bell & Howell	EMW	Saved to box and Sent courtesy copy of 11/07 letter to judge (.3)	0.3	\$300.00	\$90.00
2017.11.09	Bell & Howell	YZK	Conf w/ RSR re new subpoenas	0.2	\$575.00	\$115.00
2017.11.13	Bell & Howell	LTF	Discussed rebuttal expert reports with Yitz Kopel.	0.2	\$1,000.00	\$200.00
2017.11.13	Bell & Howell	YZK	Conf w/ team and draft response to extension request	1.6	\$575.00	\$920.00
2017.11.13	Bell & Howell	YZK	Calls w/ defense counsel re request for extension of expert discovery	0.4	\$575.00	\$230.00
2017.11.13	Bell & Howell	YZK	Conf w/ C Weir re need for rebuttal report	0.3	\$575.00	\$172.50
2017.11.13	Bell & Howell	YZK	Work on Potter rebuttal report	8.5	\$575.00	\$4,887.50
2017.11.13	Bell & Howell	RSR	Updated retailer subpoenas and sent out for service (.6)	0.6	\$300.00	\$180.00
2017.11.14	Bell & Howell	YZK	Serve notice of subpoenas	0.1	\$575.00	\$57.50
2017.11.14	Bell & Howell	YZK	Research re astroturfing on amazon	0.7	\$575.00	\$402.50
2017.11.14	Bell & Howell	YZK	Work on draft Potter rebuttal	1.1	\$575.00	\$632.50
2017.11.14	Bell & Howell	YZK	Draft letter to counsel re new subpoenas; calls w/ same	0.7	\$575.00	\$402.50
2017.11.14	Bell & Howell	EMW	Sent out courtesy copy of 11/13 letter (.3)	0.3	\$300.00	\$90.00
2017.11.15	Bell & Howell	YZK	Scientific research for Potter rebuttal	4.6	\$575.00	\$2,645.00
2017.11.16	Bell & Howell	LTF	Discussed laboratory subpoena issue with Yitz Kopel and Yeremey Krivoshey.	0.1	\$1,000.00	\$100.00
2017.11.16	Bell & Howell	SAB	Multiple confs. w/ Y. Kopel re rebuttal expert reports	1.3	\$1,000.00	\$1,300.00
2017.11.16	Bell & Howell	YZK	Work on drafting Potter rebuttal report	6.3	\$575.00	\$3,622.50
2017.11.17	Bell & Howell	LTF	Discussed third party subpoenas with Yitz Kopel.	0.2	\$1,000.00	\$200.00
2017.11.17	Bell & Howell	YZK	Calls w/ labs re Ds' subpoenas	1.3	\$575.00	\$747.50
2017.11.17	Bell & Howell	YZK	Review Ds' notice of subpoenas and draft objections	2.5	\$575.00	\$1,437.50
2017.11.20	Bell & Howell	YZK	Communications with retailers re doc production	0.3	\$575.00	\$172.50
2017.11.21	Bell & Howell	YZK	Calls w/ retailers re notice	1.3	\$575.00	\$747.50
2017.11.21	Bell & Howell	YZK	Work with laboratories on collecting docs	1.2	\$575.00	\$690.00
2017.11.21	Bell & Howell	RSR	Processed HSN doc production (.3)	0.3	\$300.00	\$90.00

DATE	MATTER	ATTY	DESCRIPTION	TIME	RATE	AMOUNT
2017.11.22	Bell & Howell	YZK	Calls w/ retailers re notice	0.5	\$575.00	\$287.50
2017.11.22	Bell & Howell	YZK	Work on expert productions	2.3	\$575.00	\$1,322.50
2017.11.27	Bell & Howell	YZK	Work on expert doc productions and scheduling	2.6	\$575.00	\$1,495.00
2017.11.28	Bell & Howell	SAB	Multiple teleconfs. w/ Y. Kopel re expert discovery	0.9	\$1,000.00	\$900.00
2017.11.28	Bell & Howell	YZK	Work on assembling, reviewing, and classifying expert productions	3.3	\$575.00	\$1,897.50
2017.11.28	Bell & Howell	RSR	Gathered expert and lab invoices and saved to box for production (1)	1.0	\$300.00	\$300.00
2017.11.29	Bell & Howell	YZK	Work on assembling and reviewing expert docs	1.5	\$575.00	\$862.50
2017.11.29	Bell & Howell	EMW	Meeting about Weir and Potter subpoena objections prep (.3) Begin Weir and Potter subpoena objections prep (.3)	0.6	\$300.00	\$180.00
2017.11.29	Bell & Howell	RSR	Conf. w/ YZK and prepared subpoena objections for Weir and Potter (1.2)	1.2	\$300.00	\$360.00
2017.11.30	Bell & Howell	YZK	Finalize and serve objections and expert production	2.3	\$575.00	\$1,322.50
2017.11.30	Bell & Howell	YZK	Analysis of retailer submissions to date	0.6	\$575.00	\$345.00
2017.11.30	Bell & Howell	EMW	Continued Weir and Potter subpoena objections prep (.7)	0.7	\$300.00	\$210.00
2017.12.01	Bell & Howell	YZK	Work on retailer notice issues	0.7	\$575.00	\$402.50
2017.12.01	Bell & Howell	YZK	Call w/ opposing counsel re scheduling	0.3	\$575.00	\$172.50
2017.12.01	Bell & Howell	YZK	Call w/ B Gorman re agreement to not disclose customer info to Defendants	0.3	\$575.00	\$172.50
2017.12.01	Bell & Howell	RSR	Began organizing class member data from retailers (.5)	0.5	\$300.00	\$150.00
2017.12.04	Bell & Howell	YZK	Work on coordination of retailer responses	0.2	\$575.00	\$115.00
2017.12.05	Bell & Howell	YZK	Calls to Publishers Clearing House and their attorney	0.3	\$575.00	\$172.50
2017.12.05	Bell & Howell	YZK	Calls w/ opposing counsel (.2) and Weir (.3) re depo scheduling	0.5	\$575.00	\$287.50
2017.12.05	Bell & Howell	RSR	Analyzed class member data from retailer productions (4.3)	4.3	\$300.00	\$1,290.00
2017.12.07	Bell & Howell	YZK	Calls w/ opposing counsel re depo scheduling and discovery	0.4	\$575.00	\$230.00
2017.12.07	Bell & Howell	YZK	Call w/ C Weir re discovery	0.2	\$575.00	\$115.00
2017.12.08	Bell & Howell	YZK	Call w/ opposing counsel re scheduling	0.2	\$575.00	\$115.00
2017.12.08	Bell & Howell	YZK	Work w/ Dr Leonard's on confidentiality order	0.3	\$575.00	\$172.50
2017.12.08	Bell & Howell	YZK	Call w/ Dr Potter re scheduling	0.1	\$575.00	\$57.50
2017.12.11	Bell & Howell	YZK	Communications w/ retailers re production, and process same	2.6	\$575.00	\$1,495.00
2017.12.11	Bell & Howell	EMW	Saved multiple doc productions to webdrive (1)	1.0	\$300.00	\$300.00
2017.12.12	Bell & Howell	YZK	Make expert production	0.4	\$575.00	\$230.00
2017.12.12	Bell & Howell	YZK	Circulate data to C Weir and opposing counsel	0.2	\$575.00	\$115.00
2017.12.12	Bell & Howell	YZK	Class notice admin related work	3.9	\$575.00	\$2,242.50
2017.12.12	Bell & Howell	EMW	Organized discovery docs for service to opposing counsel (.5)	0.5	\$300.00	\$150.00
2017.12.12	Bell & Howell	RSR	Analyzed class member data from retailer productions (3.3)	3.3	\$300.00	\$990.00
2017.12.13	Bell & Howell	LTF	Discussed expert issue with Yitz Kopel.	0.4	\$1,000.00	\$400.00
2017.12.13	Bell & Howell	YZK	Work on Potter report	3.9	\$575.00	\$2,242.50
2017.12.13	Bell & Howell	YZK	Work on class notice related issues	2.1	\$575.00	\$1,207.50

DATE	MATTER	ATTY	DESCRIPTION	TIME	RATE	AMOUNT
2017.12.13	Bell & Howell	EMW	Sent discovery docs to opposing counsel (1)	1.0	\$300.00	\$300.00
2017.12.14	Bell & Howell	YZK	Emails w/ notice admins	0.3	\$575.00	\$172.50
2017.12.14	Bell & Howell	YZK	Assemble production and privilege log	6.1	\$575.00	\$3,507.50
2017.12.14	Bell & Howell	YZK	Call w/ opposing counsel re scheduling	0.3	\$575.00	\$172.50
2017.12.14	Bell & Howell	YZK	Call w/ economics expert re supplemental info	0.4	\$575.00	\$230.00
2017.12.18	Bell & Howell	LTF	Discussed notice issues with Yitz Kopel.	0.2	\$1,000.00	\$200.00
2017.12.18	Bell & Howell	SAB	Multiple confs. w/ Y. Kopel re class notice	0.4	\$1,000.00	\$400.00
2017.12.18	Bell & Howell	YZK	Work on class notice	4.4	\$575.00	\$2,530.00
2017.12.18	Bell & Howell	YZK	Calls w/ opposing counsel re scheduling	0.4	\$575.00	\$230.00
2017.12.18	Bell & Howell	YZK	Email client	0.3	\$575.00	\$172.50
2017.12.19	Bell & Howell	SAB	Conf. w/ Y. Kopel re class notice and draft letter to court	0.5	\$1,000.00	\$500.00
2017.12.19	Bell & Howell	YZK	Work on deposition scheduling	0.4	\$575.00	\$230.00
2017.12.19	Bell & Howell	YZK	Work on Potter rebuttal report	4.3	\$575.00	\$2,472.50
2017.12.19	Bell & Howell	YZK	Review expert discovery	1.6	\$575.00	\$920.00
2017.12.19	Bell & Howell	YZK	Work on class notice and letter to court re results and extension	3.5	\$575.00	\$2,012.50
2017.12.19	Bell & Howell	EMW	Prepared and sent courtesy copy of 12/19 letter to judge (.3)	0.3	\$300.00	\$90.00
2017.12.19	Bell & Howell	RSR	Reviewed retailer sales data and calculated units sold (.9)	0.9	\$300.00	\$270.00
2017.12.20	Bell & Howell	SAB	Conf. w/ Y. Kopel re discovery and trial prep strategy	0.7	\$1,000.00	\$700.00
2017.12.20	Bell & Howell	YZK	Work on Potter report	1.0	\$575.00	\$575.00
2017.12.20	Bell & Howell	YZK	Call w/ C Weir re supplemental report	0.4	\$575.00	\$230.00
2017.12.20	Bell & Howell	YZK	Work w/ opposing counsel on depo scheduling	0.3	\$575.00	\$172.50
2017.12.20	Bell & Howell	YZK	Review expert discovery	1.7	\$575.00	\$977.50
2017.12.20	Bell & Howell	YZK	Call w/ B Wickersham	0.2	\$575.00	\$115.00
2017.12.20	Bell & Howell	YZK	Calendar new dates	0.1	\$575.00	\$57.50
2017.12.20	Bell & Howell	EMW	Updated calendar re class notice (.2)	0.2	\$300.00	\$60.00
2017.12.20	Bell & Howell	RSR	Check in w/ YZK re rebuttal reports (.5)	0.5	\$300.00	\$150.00
2017.12.21	Bell & Howell	SAB	Revised draft rebuttal expert reports	3.3	\$1,000.00	\$3,300.00
2017.12.21	Bell & Howell	YZK	Exchange emails w/ notice admins	0.3	\$575.00	\$172.50
2017.12.21	Bell & Howell	YZK	Work on Potter rebuttal report	3.6	\$575.00	\$2,070.00
2017.12.21	Bell & Howell	RSR	Assisted with expert rebuttal reports due tomorrow (1)	1.0	\$300.00	\$300.00
2017.12.22	Bell & Howell	SAB	Revised draft rebuttal expert reports	2.6	\$1,000.00	\$2,600.00
2017.12.22	Bell & Howell	YZK	Work on expert doc production	1.0	\$575.00	\$575.00
2017.12.22	Bell & Howell	YZK	Finalize and serve Potter report	3.1	\$575.00	\$1,782.50
2017.12.22	Bell & Howell	AML	Review docs in advance of further doc production	0.3	\$450.00	\$135.00
2017.12.22	Bell & Howell	DLS	Served rebuttal report	0.3	\$300.00	\$90.00

DATE	MATTER	ATTY	DESCRIPTION	TIME	RATE	AMOUNT
2017.12.26	Bell & Howell	YZK	Review expert reports and circulate to experts	3.1	\$575.00	\$1,782.50
2017.12.26	Bell & Howell	YZK	Research re expert privileges and finalize cover letter and doc production	2.1	\$575.00	\$1,207.50
2017.12.26	Bell & Howell	YZK	Exchange email correspondence w/ clients	0.4	\$575.00	\$230.00
2017.12.27	Bell & Howell	YZK	Review rebuttal reports and conduct research re same	3.7	\$575.00	\$2,127.50
2017.12.27	Bell & Howell	YZK	Call w/ counsel re depo scheduling	0.2	\$575.00	\$115.00
2017.12.27	Bell & Howell	RSR	Prepared Notice of expert depositions (.5)	0.5	\$300.00	\$150.00
2017.12.28	Bell & Howell	YZK	Prep for expert depositions	5.9	\$575.00	\$3,392.50
2017.12.29	Bell & Howell	YZK	Potter depo prep	2.5	\$575.00	\$1,437.50
2017.12.29	Bell & Howell	RSR	Conf. w/ M. Potter re travel and booked flights and hotel (.6), updated notice of depositions (.2)	0.8	\$300.00	\$240.00
2018.01.02	Bell & Howell	SAB	Read expert rebuttal reports (2.3); Conf. w/ Y. Kopel re expert discovery strategy (.4)	2.7	\$1,000.00	\$2,700.00
2018.01.02	Bell & Howell	YZK	Call w/ opposing counsel re expert discovery	0.5	\$575.00	\$287.50
2018.01.02	Bell & Howell	YZK	Review and sign off on notice website	0.7	\$575.00	\$402.50
2018.01.02	Bell & Howell	YZK	Finalize and serve expert deposition notices	0.3	\$575.00	\$172.50
2018.01.02	Bell & Howell	RSR	Finalized travel for M. Potter (.3)	0.3	\$300.00	\$90.00
2018.01.03	Bell & Howell	LTF	Discussed expert issue with Yitz Kopel.	0.1	\$1,000.00	\$100.00
2018.01.03	Bell & Howell	SAB	Multiple confs. w/ Y. Kopel re Potter depo prep	1.3	\$1,000.00	\$1,300.00
2018.01.03	Bell & Howell	SAB	Conf. w/ J. Marchese and Y. Kopel re expert discovery strategy	0.3	\$1,000.00	\$300.00
2018.01.03	Bell & Howell	JIM	Deposition defense preparation with Y. Kopel and review and comment on expert document production	2.2	\$850.00	\$1,870.00
2018.01.03	Bell & Howell	YZK	Potter depo prep	5.6	\$575.00	\$3,220.00
2018.01.03	Bell & Howell	YZK	Deal with issues related to expert doc production (from laboratories)	3.8	\$575.00	\$2,185.00
2018.01.03	Bell & Howell	YZK	Correspondence w/ KCC re notice	0.5	\$575.00	\$287.50
2018.01.03	Bell & Howell	FJK	Conf w/ J. Marchese & Y. Kopel re Weir dep (.2);	0.2	\$550.00	\$110.00
2018.01.03	Bell & Howell	RSR	Booked M. Potter depo and travel (.3)	0.3	\$300.00	\$90.00
2018.01.04	Bell & Howell	LTF	Discussed expert issue with Yitz Kopel.	0.1	\$1,000.00	\$100.00
2018.01.04	Bell & Howell	YZK	Potter depo prep	6.5	\$575.00	\$3,737.50
2018.01.04	Bell & Howell	YZK	Wake up early and deal with snow-related rescheduling for Potter	0.9	\$575.00	\$517.50
2018.01.04	Bell & Howell	RSR	Conf. w/ M. Potter and YZK re 1/5 depo (.2)	0.2	\$300.00	\$60.00
2018.01.05	Bell & Howell	SAB	Multiple confs. w/ Y. Kopel re Weir depo prep	0.7	\$1,000.00	\$700.00
2018.01.05	Bell & Howell	JDA	Prepare for Weir deposition	2.7	\$750.00	\$2,025.00
2018.01.05	Bell & Howell	YZK	Potter depo prep	3.3	\$575.00	\$1,897.50
2018.01.05	Bell & Howell	YZK	Deal w/ expert doc production	4.9	\$575.00	\$2,817.50
2018.01.05	Bell & Howell	EMW	Redacted expert doc production (.3)	0.3	\$300.00	\$90.00
2018.01.05	Bell & Howell	RSR	Booked new travel for M. Potter for rescheduled depo (.4)	0.4	\$300.00	\$120.00

DATE	MATTER	ATTY	DESCRIPTION	TIME	RATE	AMOUNT
2018.01.08	Bell & Howell	YZK	Borth and Whitford depo prep	8.4	\$575.00	\$4,830.00
2018.01.08	Bell & Howell	AML	Borth Depo prep	4.3	\$450.00	\$1,935.00
2018.01.08	Bell & Howell	EMW	Researched travel for 01/12 and 01/16 depos (1)	1.0	\$300.00	\$300.00
2018.01.08	Bell & Howell	RSR	Confirmed upcoming depos with Veritext (.1)	0.1	\$300.00	\$30.00
2018.01.09	Bell & Howell	SAB	Teleconf. w/ Y. Kopel re expert discovery strategy	0.7	\$1,000.00	\$700.00
2018.01.09	Bell & Howell	JDA	Prepare with C. Weir for deposition	3.5	\$750.00	\$2,625.00
2018.01.09	Bell & Howell	YZK	Assist with Weir depo prep	0.7	\$575.00	\$402.50
2018.01.09	Bell & Howell	YZK	Defend Potter dep (6.4) and begin Whitford prep (1.9)	8.3	\$575.00	\$4,772.50
2018.01.09	Bell & Howell	AML	Research for efficacy depo prep	6.2	\$450.00	\$2,790.00
2018.01.09	Bell & Howell	EMW	Booked travel for 01/16 depo (.6)	0.6	\$300.00	\$180.00
2018.01.09	Bell & Howell	RSR	Set up for Potter depo (.5)	0.5	\$300.00	\$150.00
2018.01.10	Bell & Howell	SAB	Teleconf. w/ Y. Kopel re expert discovery strategy	0.5	\$1,000.00	\$500.00
2018.01.10	Bell & Howell	JDA	Defend depositon of C. Weir	7.5	\$750.00	\$5,625.00
2018.01.10	Bell & Howell	YZK	Whitford depo prep	11.7	\$575.00	\$6,727.50
2018.01.10	Bell & Howell	AML	Assist with Borth deposition prep	9.2	\$450.00	\$4,140.00
2018.01.10	Bell & Howell	EMW	Weir depo prep (2.5)	2.5	\$300.00	\$750.00
2018.01.10	Bell & Howell	RSR	Set up for Weir depo (.5), prepared docs for 1/12 depo (2.3)	2.8	\$300.00	\$840.00
2018.01.11	Bell & Howell	SAB	Teleconf. w/ Y. Kopel re expert depositions	0.4	\$1,000.00	\$400.00
2018.01.11	Bell & Howell	YZK	Prep for whitford dep	5.3	\$575.00	\$3,047.50
2018.01.11	Bell & Howell	YZK	Travel to chicago	6.7	\$575.00	\$3,852.50
2018.01.11	Bell & Howell	AML	Whitford Depo prep	7.8	\$450.00	\$3,510.00
2018.01.11	Bell & Howell	RSR	Assisted with Whitford depo prep (1)	1.0	\$300.00	\$300.00
2018.01.12	Bell & Howell	SAB	Teleconf. w/ Y. Kopel re Whitford deposition	0.5	\$1,000.00	\$500.00
2018.01.12	Bell & Howell	YZK	Travel home from Chicago	6.6	\$575.00	\$3,795.00
2018.01.12	Bell & Howell	YZK	Prep for whitford dep	0.5	\$575.00	\$287.50
2018.01.12	Bell & Howell	YZK	Take whitford dep	8.9	\$575.00	\$5,117.50
2018.01.12	Bell & Howell	AML	Depo prep/Whitford depo	11.0	\$450.00	\$4,950.00
2018.01.14	Bell & Howell	SAB	Teleconf. w/ Y. Kopel & A. Leslie re Borth depo prep	0.5	\$1,000.00	\$500.00
2018.01.14	Bell & Howell	YZK	Borth Depo prep	6.3	\$575.00	\$3,622.50
2018.01.14	Bell & Howell	AML	Depo Prep Borth	3.6	\$450.00	\$1,620.00
2018.01.15	Bell & Howell	SAB	Multiple confs w/ Y. Kopel re trial prep and joint pretrial order	0.5	\$1,000.00	\$500.00
2018.01.15	Bell & Howell	YZK	Prep for Borth Depo	6.1	\$575.00	\$3,507.50
2018.01.15	Bell & Howell	YZK	Travel to chicago	5.0	\$575.00	\$2,875.00
2018.01.15	Bell & Howell	AML	Depo Prep Borth (4.8); asisst with Borth depo prep (5.5)	10.3	\$450.00	\$4,635.00
2018.01.16	Bell & Howell	YZK	Take Borth Dep	9.9	\$575.00	\$5,692.50

DATE	MATTER	ATTY	DESCRIPTION	TIME	RATE	AMOUNT
2018.01.16	Bell & Howell	YZK	Prep for Borth Depo	0.5	\$575.00	\$287.50
2018.01.16	Bell & Howell	EMW	Changed YZK flight for hearing tomorrow (.5)	0.5	\$300.00	\$150.00
2018.01.16	Bell & Howell	AML	Attend Borth depo (9.8); Travel back to NYC (5.1)	14.9	\$450.00	\$6,705.00
2018.01.17	Bell & Howell	JDA	Review jury instructions/form in Capiriti in prep for jury instructions in BHH	1.5	\$750.00	\$1,125.00
2018.01.17	Bell & Howell	JDA	Draft jury verdict form	2.8	\$750.00	\$2,100.00
2018.01.17	Bell & Howell	JDA	Draft jury instructions	6.9	\$750.00	\$5,175.00
2018.01.17	Bell & Howell	YZK	Travel back to NJ	6.9	\$575.00	\$3,967.50
2018.01.17	Bell & Howell	EMW	Requested 01/16 transcript (.4)	0.4	\$300.00	\$120.00
2018.01.17	Bell & Howell	EMW	Assisted w. joint pretrial order (2)	2.0	\$300.00	\$600.00
2018.01.17	Bell & Howell	RSR	Assisted with Jury Instruction formatting (.6), answered emails from class regarding notice (1.2)	1.8	\$300.00	\$540.00
2018.01.18	Bell & Howell	SAB	Teleconf. w/ Y. Kopel re trial prep & litigation strategy	0.4	\$1,000.00	\$400.00
2018.01.18	Bell & Howell	YZK	Call w/ H Randell re upcoming motions and scheduling	0.6	\$575.00	\$345.00
2018.01.18	Bell & Howell	YZK	Call w/ SAB re next steps	0.4	\$575.00	\$230.00
2018.01.18	Bell & Howell	EMW	Assisted w. joint pretrial order (5.4)	5.4	\$300.00	\$1,620.00
2018.01.19	Bell & Howell	SAB	Reviewed draft jury instructions and verdict form, developed trial strategy	3.4	\$1,000.00	\$3,400.00
2018.01.19	Bell & Howell	RSR	Respond to class member questions re notice (1)	1.0	\$300.00	\$300.00
2018.01.20	Bell & Howell	YZK	Email SAB re status of pre-trial work	0.1	\$575.00	\$57.50
2018.01.21	Bell & Howell	YZK	Work on pre-trial designations, etc.	1.9	\$575.00	\$1,092.50
2018.01.21	Bell & Howell	YZK	Deal w/ emails from class members	0.3	\$575.00	\$172.50
2018.01.22	Bell & Howell	SAB	Videoconf. w/ Y. Kopel re preparation of pretrial filings (.3)	0.3	\$1,000.00	\$300.00
2018.01.22	Bell & Howell	JDA	Prepare for Boedeker depo	5.7	\$750.00	\$4,275.00
2018.01.22	Bell & Howell	YZK	Conf w/ SAB re deposition designations	0.3	\$575.00	\$172.50
2018.01.22	Bell & Howell	YZK	Draft depo designations	4.2	\$575.00	\$2,415.00
2018.01.22	Bell & Howell	EMW	Tracked down and called reporter about 01/10 Weir Transcript (.5)	0.5	\$300.00	\$150.00
2018.01.22	Bell & Howell	EMW	Prepared courtesy copies of joint pretrial order to judge (1) Reviewed trial exhibits for SAB (3)	4.0	\$300.00	\$1,200.00
2018.01.22	Bell & Howell	RSR	Prepared draft trial exhibit list (2), conf. w/ YZK re depo videos and emailed veritext re same (.3)	2.3	\$300.00	\$690.00
2018.01.23	Bell & Howell	SAB	Conf. w/ J. Arisohn re prep for Boedeker depo	0.5	\$1,000.00	\$500.00
2018.01.23	Bell & Howell	JDA	Prepare for Boedeker depo	6.7	\$750.00	\$5,025.00
2018.01.23	Bell & Howell	EMW	Take class member calls (.3)	0.3	\$300.00	\$90.00
2018.01.23	Bell & Howell	EMW	Sent courtesy copy of joint pretrial order to judge (.2)	0.2	\$300.00	\$60.00
2018.01.24	Bell & Howell	LTF	Discussed exhibit and witness list issues with Yitz Kopel and Debbie Schroeder (.5); discussed opt-outs with Yitz Kopel (.1).	0.6	\$1,000.00	\$600.00
2018.01.24	Bell & Howell	JDA	Prepare for Boedeker depo	4.9	\$750.00	\$3,675.00

DATE	MATTER	ATTY	DESCRIPTION	TIME	RATE	AMOUNT
2018.01.24	Bell & Howell	JDA	Call with C. Weir to discuss Boedeker depo	0.6	\$750.00	\$450.00
2018.01.24	Bell & Howell	YZK	Work on pre-trial disclosures	7.6	\$575.00	\$4,370.00
2018.01.24	Bell & Howell	YZK	Conf w/ admin re class notice issues	0.3	\$575.00	\$172.50
2018.01.24	Bell & Howell	EMW	Prepared and sent depo prep materials to Chicago (.3)	0.3	\$300.00	\$90.00
2018.01.24	Bell & Howell	RSR	Respond to class questions (.5), updated exhibit list (3.7)	4.2	\$300.00	\$1,260.00
2018.01.25	Bell & Howell	JDA	Prepare for Boedeker depo	5.5	\$750.00	\$4,125.00
2018.01.25	Bell & Howell	YZK	Prepare pre-trial order materials	8.5	\$575.00	\$4,887.50
2018.01.25	Bell & Howell	EMW	Updated trial exhibit list (.5) Printed off depo transcripts for designations (.4) Dealt w. claimants over the phone (.3) Checked on depo prep materials FedEx for JDA (.2)	1.4	\$300.00	\$420.00
2018.01.25	Bell & Howell	RSR	Drafted pretrial order doc (1.5), assisted with exhibit list (.8)	2.3	\$300.00	\$690.00
2018.01.26	Bell & Howell	SAB	Revised witness list, exhibit list, deposition designations, and draft joint pretrial order materials	3.2	\$1,000.00	\$3,200.00
2018.01.26	Bell & Howell	JDA	Prepare for Boedeker depo	2.3	\$750.00	\$1,725.00
2018.01.26	Bell & Howell	JDA	Take Boedeker depo	6.8	\$750.00	\$5,100.00
2018.01.26	Bell & Howell	JDA	Travel back to New York	6.0	\$750.00	\$4,500.00
2018.01.26	Bell & Howell	EMW	Updated trial exhibits on webdrive and on trial exhibit list (.4)	0.4	\$300.00	\$120.00
2018.01.26	Bell & Howell	RSR	Saved trial exhibits to box (2.5), conf. w/ YZK re trial exhibits (.3)	2.8	\$300.00	\$840.00
2018.01.27	Bell & Howell	SAB	Revised draft deposition designation and other joint pretrial order materials	5.3	\$1,000.00	\$5,300.00
2018.01.28	Bell & Howell	SAB	Revised draft deposition designation and other joint pretrial order materials	4.4	\$1,000.00	\$4,400.00
2018.01.29	Bell & Howell	SAB	Multiple confs. w/ Y. Kopel re pretrial exchange and review of videos of testing, designations of exhibits, and preparation for trial (1.8); analyzed class cert and mtd orders (1.5)	3.3	\$1,000.00	\$3,300.00
2018.01.29	Bell & Howell	JDA	Discuss Daubert issues with YZK	0.5	\$750.00	\$375.00
2018.01.29	Bell & Howell	JDA	Draft Boedeker Daubert PML	2.7	\$750.00	\$2,025.00
2018.01.29	Bell & Howell	YZK	Prepare pre-trial materials	7.7	\$575.00	\$4,427.50
2018.01.29	Bell & Howell	YZK	Review Ds' pre-motion letter and calendar response date	0.3	\$575.00	\$172.50
2018.01.29	Bell & Howell	YZK	Begin drafting our Daubert pre-motion letter	2.4	\$575.00	\$1,380.00
2018.01.29	Bell & Howell	EMW	Joint pre-trial order prep (.4)	0.5	\$300.00	\$150.00
2018.01.29	Bell & Howell	RSR	Assisted with pretrial order (3.6)	3.6	\$300.00	\$1,080.00
2018.01.30	Bell & Howell	SAB	Multiple confs. w/ Y. Kopel, J. Arisohn, R. Richter, E. Wald re pretrial exchange of witness lists, exhibit lists, depo designations, etc.	1.8	\$1,000.00	\$1,800.00
2018.01.30	Bell & Howell	JDA	Meet with S. Bursor re trial preparation	0.7	\$750.00	\$525.00
2018.01.30	Bell & Howell	JDA	Work on pre-trial order and designations	5.9	\$750.00	\$4,425.00
2018.01.30	Bell & Howell	YZK	Work on pre-trial materials	5.5	\$575.00	\$3,162.50
2018.01.30	Bell & Howell	YZK	Complete and file our pre-motion daubert letter	3.1	\$575.00	\$1,782.50
2018.01.30	Bell & Howell	YZK	Review and sign off on weir decl	0.4	\$575.00	\$230.00

DATE	MATTER	ATTY	DESCRIPTION	TIME	RATE	AMOUNT
2018.01.30	Bell & Howell	EMW	Meeting re depo designations (.3) Joint pre-trial order prep (.6)	0.9	\$300.00	\$270.00
2018.01.30	Bell & Howell	RSR	Trial team meeting (.1) prepared defendants depo designations for pretrial order (1.5)	1.6	\$300.00	\$480.00
2018.01.31	Bell & Howell	JDA	Review and draft objections to exhibits	4.8	\$750.00	\$3,600.00
2018.01.31	Bell & Howell	JDA	Draft pre-trial order	3.2	\$750.00	\$2,400.00
2018.01.31	Bell & Howell	YZK	Work on pre-trial disclosures	7.4	\$575.00	\$4,255.00
2018.01.31	Bell & Howell	EMW	Joint pre-trial order prep (.8)	0.8	\$300.00	\$240.00
2018.01.31	Bell & Howell	RSR	Highlighted depo designations for pretrial order (2)	2.0	\$300.00	\$600.00
2018.02.01	Bell & Howell	JDA	Draft Hart counter-designations and objections	1.5	\$750.00	\$1,125.00
2018.02.01	Bell & Howell	JDA	Review objections from BHH	2.1	\$750.00	\$1,575.00
2018.02.01	Bell & Howell	YZK	Work on pre-trial order	5.8	\$575.00	\$3,335.00
2018.02.01	Bell & Howell	YZK	Finalize and serve Weir report	0.5	\$575.00	\$287.50
2018.02.01	Bell & Howell	FJK	Conf w/ Y. Kopel re evidence question	0.2	\$550.00	\$110.00
2018.02.01	Bell & Howell	RSR	Assisted with pretrial order (2)	2.0	\$300.00	\$600.00
2018.02.02	Bell & Howell	JDA	Finalize pretrial order	2.9	\$750.00	\$2,175.00
2018.02.02	Bell & Howell	YZK	Work on pre-trial disclosures	3.7	\$575.00	\$2,127.50
2018.02.02	Bell & Howell	YZK	Research for pre-motion opp letter	2.1	\$575.00	\$1,207.50
2018.02.02	Bell & Howell	EMW	Assisted w. pretrial order (1.2) Prepared and sent courtesy copy of 01/30 letter to judge (.2)	1.4	\$300.00	\$420.00
2018.02.02	Bell & Howell	RSR	Assisted with pretrial order (.7)	0.7	\$300.00	\$210.00
2018.02.04	Bell & Howell	YZK	Work on Daubert Opp letter	4.1	\$575.00	\$2,357.50
2018.02.05	Bell & Howell	JDA	Review response to pre-motion letter re summary judgment and Daubert	0.4	\$750.00	\$300.00
2018.02.05	Bell & Howell	YZK	Finalize and file Daubert opp letter	3.1	\$575.00	\$1,782.50
2018.02.05	Bell & Howell	EMW	Saved and sent 02/05 letter to judge (.2)	0.2	\$300.00	\$60.00
2018.02.05	Bell & Howell	AML	Reviewed and conducted research for PML re Daubert/MSJ	1.1	\$450.00	\$495.00
2018.02.07	Bell & Howell	YZK	Assemble books and prep for hearing	1.6	\$575.00	\$920.00
2018.02.08	Bell & Howell	SAB	Multiple confs. w/ Y. Kopel to prepare for tomorrow's hearing (1.0); read premotion letters and related materials (1.0)	2.0	\$1,000.00	\$2,000.00
2018.02.08	Bell & Howell	JDA	Prepare for hearing	1.7	\$750.00	\$1,275.00
2018.02.08	Bell & Howell	YZK	Prep for tomorrow's hearing	5.3	\$575.00	\$3,047.50
2018.02.08	Bell & Howell	EMW	Premotion conf. prep (3.4)	3.4	\$300.00	\$1,020.00
2018.02.08	Bell & Howell	RSR	Assisted with 2/9 hearing books (1)	1.0	\$300.00	\$300.00
2018.02.09	Bell & Howell	LTF	Discussed MSJ and hearing with Yitz Kopel.	0.1	\$1,000.00	\$100.00
2018.02.09	Bell & Howell	SAB	Debrief w/ Y. Kopel after pretrial hearing	0.8	\$1,000.00	\$800.00
2018.02.09	Bell & Howell	JDA	Attend hearing and related travel	2.5	\$750.00	\$1,875.00

DATE	MATTER	ATTY	DESCRIPTION	TIME	RATE	AMOUNT
2018.02.09	Bell & Howell	YZK	Draft Borth & Whitford daubert motion	2.1	\$575.00	\$1,207.50
2018.02.09	Bell & Howell	YZK	Prep for and attend pre-motion conference (3); conf w/ SAB re same (.8)	3.8	\$575.00	\$2,185.00
2018.02.12	Bell & Howell	SAB	Conf. w/ J. Marchese & Y. Kopel re settlement strategy	0.6	\$1,000.00	\$600.00
2018.02.12	Bell & Howell	JIM	Confer with Y. Kopel and S. Bursor about settlement strategy	0.6	\$850.00	\$510.00
2018.02.12	Bell & Howell	YZK	Draft Borth & Whitford Daubert motion	7.4	\$575.00	\$4,255.00
2018.02.12	Bell & Howell	YZK	Review and calendar new deadlines	0.3	\$575.00	\$172.50
2018.02.12	Bell & Howell	YZK	Team meeting re settlement	0.6	\$575.00	\$345.00
2018.02.12	Bell & Howell	AML	Conduct research for Whitford Daubert motion	2.5	\$450.00	\$1,125.00
2018.02.13	Bell & Howell	YZK	Draft Borth & Whitford Daubert motion	3.1	\$575.00	\$1,782.50
2018.02.14	Bell & Howell	JDA	Draft Boedeker Daubert brief	5.8	\$750.00	\$4,350.00
2018.02.14	Bell & Howell	YZK	Draft Borth & Whitford Daubert motion	1.9	\$575.00	\$1,092.50
2018.02.14	Bell & Howell	YZK	Look into issue with Potter invoice	0.4	\$575.00	\$230.00
2018.02.16	Bell & Howell	JDA	Draft Boedeker Daubert brief	2.7	\$750.00	\$2,025.00
2018.02.16	Bell & Howell	YZK	Conf w/ team re Potter errata	0.2	\$575.00	\$115.00
2018.02.16	Bell & Howell	YZK	Draft Borth & Whitford daubert motion	4.6	\$575.00	\$2,645.00
2018.02.16	Bell & Howell	RSR	Prepared Potter errata (.4)	0.4	\$300.00	\$120.00
2018.02.20	Bell & Howell	JDA	Draft Boedeker Daubert brief	2.9	\$750.00	\$2,175.00
2018.02.20	Bell & Howell	YZK	Draft Borth & Whitford daubert motion	7.2	\$575.00	\$4,140.00
2018.02.20	Bell & Howell	YZK	Finalize and serve Potter Errata	0.5	\$575.00	\$287.50
2018.02.20	Bell & Howell	AML	Conduct research for Borth Daubert	4.1	\$450.00	\$1,845.00
2018.02.21	Bell & Howell	SAB	Conf. w/ Y. Kopel re Daubert motions	0.2	\$1,000.00	\$200.00
2018.02.21	Bell & Howell	YZK	Draft Borth & Whitford daubert motion	2.3	\$575.00	\$1,322.50
2018.02.22	Bell & Howell	YZK	Draft Borth & Whitford daubert motion	5.4	\$575.00	\$3,105.00
2018.02.22	Bell & Howell	AML	Conduct research for Daubert	2.5	\$450.00	\$1,125.00
2018.02.23	Bell & Howell	SAB	Revised draft Daubert motions	3.4	\$1,000.00	\$3,400.00
2018.02.23	Bell & Howell	YZK	Draft Borth & Whitford daubert motion	6.1	\$575.00	\$3,507.50
2018.02.23	Bell & Howell	AML	Assist with edits to Daubert motions	7.2	\$450.00	\$3,240.00
2018.02.23	Bell & Howell	RSR	Reviewed SDNY daubert filing procedures and created checklist (1)	1.0	\$300.00	\$300.00
2018.02.24	Bell & Howell	SAB	Revised draft Daubert motions	3.0	\$1,000.00	\$3,000.00
2018.02.25	Bell & Howell	SAB	Revised draft Daubert motions	3.1	\$1,000.00	\$3,100.00
2018.02.25	Bell & Howell	YZK	Draft Borth & Whitford daubert motion	3.9	\$575.00	\$2,242.50
2018.02.26	Bell & Howell	SAB	Revised draft Daubert motions	2.5	\$1,000.00	\$2,500.00
2018.02.26	Bell & Howell	JDA	Review Daubert brief	1.5	\$750.00	\$1,125.00
2018.02.26	Bell & Howell	YZK	Work on Borth & Whitford daubert brief	2.2	\$575.00	\$1,265.00

DATE	MATTER	ATTY	DESCRIPTION	TIME	RATE	AMOUNT
2018.02.26	Bell & Howell	RSR	Conf. w/ YZK re daubert filing checklist and began drafting Notice of Motions and declarations (2)	2.0	\$300.00	\$600.00
2018.02.27	Bell & Howell	SAB	Revised draft Daubert motions	2.9	\$1,000.00	\$2,900.00
2018.02.27	Bell & Howell	JDA	Draft Boedeker Daubert brief	5.7	\$750.00	\$4,275.00
2018.02.27	Bell & Howell	JDA	Review Weir declaration	0.8	\$750.00	\$600.00
2018.02.27	Bell & Howell	YZK	Review colleague comments to Daubert brief	0.4	\$575.00	\$230.00
2018.02.28	Bell & Howell	SAB	Revised draft Daubert motions	3.2	\$1,000.00	\$3,200.00
2018.02.28	Bell & Howell	JDA	Discuss declaration with C. Weir	0.3	\$750.00	\$225.00
2018.02.28	Bell & Howell	JDA	Draft Boedeker Daubert brief	3.5	\$750.00	\$2,625.00
2018.02.28	Bell & Howell	YZK	Revise Borth & Whitford Daubert brief	5.1	\$575.00	\$2,932.50
2018.03.01	Bell & Howell	SAB	Revised draft Daubert briefs	2.4	\$1,000.00	\$2,400.00
2018.03.01	Bell & Howell	JDA	Draft Boedeker Daubert brief and confer with C. Weir re same	4.9	\$750.00	\$3,675.00
2018.03.01	Bell & Howell	YZK	Revise Borth & Whitford Daubert brief	0.4	\$575.00	\$230.00
2018.03.02	Bell & Howell	SAB	Revised draft Daubert briefs	2.1	\$1,000.00	\$2,100.00
2018.03.02	Bell & Howell	JDA	Draft Boedeker Daubert brief and confer with C. Weir re same	7.8	\$750.00	\$5,850.00
2018.03.02	Bell & Howell	RSR	Prepared tables for Boedeker daubert (.4)	0.4	\$300.00	\$120.00
2018.03.03	Bell & Howell	SAB	Revised draft Daubert briefs	2.2	\$1,000.00	\$2,200.00
2018.03.04	Bell & Howell	SAB	Revised draft Daubert briefs	2.5	\$1,000.00	\$2,500.00
2018.03.04	Bell & Howell	YZK	Revise Boedeker Daubert motion	0.8	\$575.00	\$460.00
2018.03.05	Bell & Howell	SAB	Revised draft Daubert briefs	1.3	\$1,000.00	\$1,300.00
2018.03.05	Bell & Howell	RSR	Began drafting YZK declaration and organizing exhibits (3)	3.0	\$300.00	\$900.00
2018.03.06	Bell & Howell	SAB	Revised draft Daubert briefs	1.4	\$1,000.00	\$1,400.00
2018.03.06	Bell & Howell	JDA	Edit Boedeker Daubert motion	1.5	\$750.00	\$1,125.00
2018.03.06	Bell & Howell	YZK	Finish marking up Boedeker brief	0.6	\$575.00	\$345.00
2018.03.06	Bell & Howell	RSR	Continued working on YZK decl. and organizing exhibits (1.9)	1.9	\$300.00	\$570.00
2018.03.07	Bell & Howell	SAB	Revised draft Daubert briefs	1.3	\$1,000.00	\$1,300.00
2018.03.07	Bell & Howell	EMW	Made TOA for a daubert brief (.5)	0.5	\$300.00	\$150.00
2018.03.07	Bell & Howell	RSR	Finalized draft kopel decl. and updated daubert motions with cross-cites and sent all materials for YZK for review (.7)	0.7	\$300.00	\$210.00
2018.03.08	Bell & Howell	YZK	Finalize tomorrow's filings	2.5	\$575.00	\$1,437.50
2018.03.08	Bell & Howell	RSR	Continued working on daubert motions and kopel decl. (.6)	0.6	\$300.00	\$180.00
2018.03.09	Bell & Howell	YZK	Finalize and file daubert filings	4.5	\$575.00	\$2,587.50
2018.03.09	Bell & Howell	RSR	Assisted with daubert motions due today (3.5)	3.5	\$300.00	\$1,050.00
2018.03.11	Bell & Howell	YZK	Work on 56.1 Statement	4.9	\$575.00	\$2,817.50
2018.03.12	Bell & Howell	SAB	Conf. w/ Y. Kopel re trial preparation	0.4	\$1,000.00	\$400.00
2018.03.12	Bell & Howell	YZK	Work on 56.1 Statement	10.7	\$575.00	\$6,152.50

DATE	MATTER	ATTY	DESCRIPTION	TIME	RATE	AMOUNT
2018.03.12	Bell + Howell	YZK	Conf w/ SAB re trial MSJ & next steps	0.4	\$575.00	\$230.00
2018.03.12	Bell & Howell	EMW	Prepared and sent courtesy copies of 03/09 filings to judge (4)	4.0	\$300.00	\$1,200.00
2018.03.13	Bell & Howell	YZK	Work on 56.1 Statement	4.4	\$575.00	\$2,530.00
2018.03.13	Bell & Howell	EMW	Saved def's MSJ filings to box (.5)	0.5	\$300.00	\$150.00
2018.03.14	Bell & Howell	LTF	Call with Yitz Kopel regarding oppositions to Daubert motions.	0.4	\$1,000.00	\$400.00
2018.03.14	Bell & Howell	YZK	Draft 56.1 statement	4.5	\$575.00	\$2,587.50
2018.03.14	Bell & Howell	YZK	Draft Daubert opp	2.3	\$575.00	\$1,322.50
2018.03.14	Bell & Howell	EMW	Created properly formatted 56.1 doc (2.1)	2.1	\$300.00	\$630.00
2018.03.15	Bell & Howell	SAB	Revised draft 56.1 statement	4.7	\$1,000.00	\$4,700.00
2018.03.15	Bell & Howell	YZK	Work on daubert opp	2.9	\$575.00	\$1,667.50
2018.03.16	Bell & Howell	SAB	Revised draft Rule 56.1 statement	5.5	\$1,000.00	\$5,500.00
2018.03.16	Bell & Howell	JDA	Research Statute Of Limitations issues	1.0	\$750.00	\$750.00
2018.03.16	Bell & Howell	YZK	Draft Potter daubert opp	1.5	\$575.00	\$862.50
2018.03.16	Bell & Howell	FJK	Conf w/ J. Arisohn re choice of law & Statute of limitations issues (.4)	0.4	\$550.00	\$220.00
2018.03.17	Bell & Howell	LTF	Email exchange with Yitz Kopel regarding Daubert oppositions.	0.2	\$1,000.00	\$200.00
2018.03.17	Bell & Howell	SAB	Research for Potter Daubert oppn	5.2	\$1,000.00	\$5,200.00
2018.03.17	Bell & Howell	YZK	Draft daubert opp	5.7	\$575.00	\$3,277.50
2018.03.18	Bell & Howell	SAB	Revised draft Daubert oppn	4.5	\$1,000.00	\$4,500.00
2018.03.18	Bell & Howell	YZK	Draft Potter daubert opp	5.5	\$575.00	\$3,162.50
2018.03.19	Bell & Howell	JDA	Draft MSJ opp'n on SOL issues	1.4	\$750.00	\$1,050.00
2018.03.19	Bell & Howell	JDA	Draft MSJ opp'n on express warranty	6.7	\$750.00	\$5,025.00
2018.03.19	Bell & Howell	YZK	Conf w/ team re issues on MSJ	0.5	\$575.00	\$287.50
2018.03.19	Bell & Howell	FJK	Conf w/ J. Arisohn re borrowing statute (.2);	0.2	\$550.00	\$110.00
2018.03.20	Bell & Howell	JDA	Discuss damages issues with C. Weir	0.5	\$750.00	\$375.00
2018.03.20	Bell & Howell	JDA	Draft MSJ opp'n	6.8	\$750.00	\$5,100.00
2018.03.20	Bell & Howell	YZK	Draft 56.1	6.2	\$575.00	\$3,565.00
2018.03.20	Bell & Howell	RSR	Conf. w/ YZK re SJ and 56.1 motions and Kopel Decl. (.4)	0.4	\$300.00	\$120.00
2018.03.21	Bell & Howell	JDA	Draft MSJ opp'n	4.4	\$750.00	\$3,300.00
2018.03.21	Bell & Howell	YZK	Draft Potter Daubert opp and 56.1	6.1	\$575.00	\$3,507.50
2018.03.22	Bell & Howell	JDA	Draft MSJ opp'n	4.9	\$750.00	\$3,675.00
2018.03.22	Bell & Howell	YZK	Draft daubert opp	5.7	\$575.00	\$3,277.50
2018.03.24	Bell & Howell	YZK	Draft MSJ Opp	2.7	\$575.00	\$1,552.50
2018.03.25	Bell & Howell	YZK	Work on MSJ opp and 56.1	2.9	\$575.00	\$1,667.50
2018.03.26	Bell & Howell	JDA	Draft opposition to MSJ and discuss with Y. Kopel	6.7	\$750.00	\$5,025.00
2018.03.26	Bell & Howell	YZK	Draft MSJ Opp and Daubert opp	9.8	\$575.00	\$5,635.00

DATE	MATTER	ATTY	DESCRIPTION	TIME	RATE	AMOUNT
2018.03.26	Bell & Howell	RSR	Began reviewing draft 56.1 exhibits (2)	2.0	\$300.00	\$600.00
2018.03.27	Bell & Howell	SAB	Revised draft 56.1 statement and Daubert oppn briefs	3.0	\$1,000.00	\$3,000.00
2018.03.27	Bell & Howell	YZK	Work on MSJ and Daubert opp	9.4	\$575.00	\$5,405.00
2018.03.27	Bell & Howell	YZK	Call defense counsel and draft extension request	0.5	\$575.00	\$287.50
2018.03.27	Bell & Howell	RSR	Continued reviewing 56.1 statement (1.8)	1.8	\$300.00	\$540.00
2018.03.28	Bell & Howell	SAB	Revised draft 56.1 statement and Daubert oppn briefs	2.8	\$1,000.00	\$2,800.00
2018.03.28	Bell & Howell	YZK	Revise and file extension request	0.3	\$575.00	\$172.50
2018.03.28	Bell & Howell	YZK	Work on 56.1	1.8	\$575.00	\$1,035.00
2018.03.28	Bell & Howell	YZK	Draft MSJ Opp	6.8	\$575.00	\$3,910.00
2018.03.28	Bell & Howell	EMW	Saved to box, Prepared and sent courtesy copy of extension to judge (.2)	0.2	\$300.00	\$60.00
2018.03.28	Bell & Howell	RSR	Drafted proposed order re filing extension (.6), conf. w/ YZK re 56.1, SJ oppn and daubert oppn briefing and continued working on same (2.3)	2.9	\$300.00	\$870.00
2018.03.29	Bell & Howell	SAB	Revised draft daubert, 56.1, and MSJ briefs	5.2	\$1,000.00	\$5,200.00
2018.03.29	Bell & Howell	YZK	Work on MSJ Opp, daubert opp, and 56.1	4.7	\$575.00	\$2,702.50
2018.03.29	Bell & Howell	EMW	Daubert brief prep (.5)	0.5	\$300.00	\$150.00
2018.03.29	Bell & Howell	RSR	Assisted with 56.1, daubert oppn, 56.1, and kopel decl. (3.5)	3.5	\$300.00	\$1,050.00
2018.03.30	Bell & Howell	SAB	Revised draft daubert, 56.1, and MSJ briefs	3.9	\$1,000.00	\$3,900.00
2018.03.30	Bell & Howell	YZK	Revise MSJ opp, daubert opp, 56.1	5.5	\$575.00	\$3,162.50
2018.03.30	Bell & Howell	YZK	Call w/ M Potter re daubert	0.7	\$575.00	\$402.50
2018.03.30	Bell & Howell	RSR	Assisted with 56.1, sj oppn, daubert oppn, and kopel decl. due Monday (3.8)	3.8	\$300.00	\$1,140.00
2018.03.31	Bell & Howell	YZK	Revise 56.1	3.1	\$575.00	\$1,782.50
2018.04.01	Bell & Howell	YZK	Revise tomorrow's filings	3.8	\$575.00	\$2,185.00
2018.04.02	Bell & Howell	SAB	Revised daubert, 56.1 and MSJ briefs	4.4	\$1,000.00	\$4,400.00
2018.04.02	Bell & Howell	YZK	Finalize and file opps, 56.1, decl and exhibits	12.5	\$575.00	\$7,187.50
2018.04.02	Bell & Howell	EMW	Assisted w. MSJ Oppn due today (2)	2.0	\$300.00	\$600.00
2018.04.02	Bell & Howell	RSR	Assisted with 56.1, sj oppn, daubert oppn, kopel decl. due today (8.3)	8.3	\$300.00	\$2,490.00
2018.04.03	Bell & Howell	YZK	Review Defs' filings and draft borth and whitford reply	3.8	\$575.00	\$2,185.00
2018.04.03	Bell & Howell	EMW	Began preparing courtesy copies of MSJ oppn (3)	3.0	\$300.00	\$900.00
2018.04.03	Bell & Howell	RSR	Assisted with courtesy copies of 4/2 filings (.7)	0.7	\$300.00	\$210.00
2018.04.04	Bell & Howell	EMW	Finished preparing courtesy copies and ordered courier to deliver (1)	1.0	\$300.00	\$300.00
2018.04.06	Bell & Howell	YZK	Conf w/ opposing counsel re extension request	0.2	\$575.00	\$115.00
2018.04.09	Bell & Howell	YZK	Review extension request letter and email back to opposing counsel	0.4	\$575.00	\$230.00
2018.04.10	Bell & Howell	YZK	Draft daubert reply	7.5	\$575.00	\$4,312.50
2018.04.11	Bell & Howell	LTF	Discussed Daubert issue with Yitz Kopel.	0.1	\$1,000.00	\$100.00
2018.04.11	Bell & Howell	YZK	Draft daubert reply	5.7	\$575.00	\$3,277.50
2018.04.12	Bell & Howell	YZK	Revise reply brief	0.8	\$575.00	\$460.00

DATE	MATTER	ATTY	DESCRIPTION	TIME	RATE	AMOUNT
2018.04.13	Bell & Howell	YZK	Finalize reply brief	1.0	\$575.00	\$575.00
2018.04.17	Bell & Howell	YZK	Revise daubert reply	1.6	\$575.00	\$920.00
2018.04.17	Bell & Howell	RSR	Began drafting Kopel decl. for Daubert reply and added cross cites to brief (1.4), prepared tables for Borth & Whitford daubert reply (.4)	1.8	\$300.00	\$540.00
2018.04.18	Bell & Howell	RSR	Continued working on Kopel decl. (1)	1.0	\$300.00	\$300.00
2018.04.19	Bell & Howell	YZK	Review and comment on draft Boedeker reply	0.8	\$575.00	\$460.00
2018.04.20	Bell & Howell	YZK	Review reply briefs	0.5	\$575.00	\$287.50
2018.04.21	Bell & Howell	SAB	Revised draft Daubert reply briefs	2.8	\$1,000.00	\$2,800.00
2018.04.22	Bell & Howell	SAB	Revised draft Daubert reply briefs	2.5	\$1,000.00	\$2,500.00
2018.04.23	Bell & Howell	SAB	Revised draft Daubert reply briefs	1.1	\$1,000.00	\$1,100.00
2018.04.23	Bell & Howell	YZK	Finalize reply briefs	1.9	\$575.00	\$1,092.50
2018.04.23	Bell & Howell	RSR	Continued working on Kopel decl. and daubert replies due today (2)	2.0	\$300.00	\$600.00
2018.04.24	Bell & Howell	YZK	Email opposing counsel re Boedeker Decl	0.2	\$575.00	\$115.00
2018.04.25	Bell & Howell	EMW	Saved 04/23 filings to box (.3) Prepared and sent out courtesy copies of 04/23 filings (.2) Attended firm meeting (.8)	1.3	\$300.00	\$390.00
2018.04.25	Bell & Howell	RSR	Prepared courtesy copies of daubert replies for judge pauley (.8)	0.8	\$300.00	\$240.00
2018.04.30	Bell & Howell	YZK	Briefly review Ds' filings	0.5	\$575.00	\$287.50
2018.05.01	Bell & Howell	YZK	Review new filings and determine next steps	1.7	\$575.00	\$977.50
2018.05.02	Bell & Howell	YZK	Finalize and file letter motion	2.1	\$575.00	\$1,207.50
2018.05.02	Bell & Howell	AML	Reviewed letter to court re: 56.1	0.8	\$450.00	\$360.00
2018.05.03	Bell & Howell	EMW	Send out courtesy copy of 05/02 letter (.2)	0.2	\$300.00	\$60.00
2018.05.07	Bell & Howell	YZK	Email to client	0.2	\$575.00	\$115.00
2018.05.14	Bell & Howell	YZK	Email S Bueno	0.2	\$575.00	\$115.00
2018.06.05	Bell & Howell	YZK	Email to M Potter	0.2	\$575.00	\$115.00
2018.07.19	Bell & Howell	YZK	Review Daubert opinion and conf w/ team re same	1.3	\$575.00	\$747.50
2018.07.22	Bell & Howell	YZK	Email Potter re daubert ruling	0.2	\$575.00	\$115.00
2018.07.22	Bell & Howell	YZK	Email client re daubert ruling	0.3	\$575.00	\$172.50
2018.08.13	Bell & Howell	YZK	Review Ds' Rule 37 letter, and conduct research re same	1.9	\$575.00	\$1,092.50
2018.08.15	Bell & Howell	YZK	Draft response letter	6.7	\$575.00	\$3,852.50
2018.08.16	Bell & Howell	YZK	Continue work on Rule 37 response letter	2.3	\$575.00	\$1,322.50
2018.09.05	Bell & Howell	LTF	Reviewed MSJ order and discussed it with Yitz Kopel.	0.3	\$1,000.00	\$300.00
2018.09.05	Bell & Howell	SAB	Read MSJ order	0.9	\$1,000.00	\$900.00
2018.09.05	Bell & Howell	JDA	Review MSJ Order	0.8	\$750.00	\$600.00
2018.09.05	Bell & Howell	YZK	Conf w/ C Weir re MSJ order	0.4	\$575.00	\$230.00
2018.09.05	Bell & Howell	YZK	Emails to plaintiffs and M Potter re order	0.4	\$575.00	\$230.00
2018.09.05	Bell & Howell	YZK	Call w/ Sierra research lab re order	0.3	\$575.00	\$172.50

DATE	MATTER	ATTY	DESCRIPTION	TIME	RATE	AMOUNT
2018.09.05	Bell & Howell	YZK	Communications w/ press re MSJ order	1.5	\$575.00	\$862.50
2018.09.05	Bell & Howell	YZK	Review MSJ order	0.4	\$575.00	\$230.00
2018.09.06	Bell & Howell	SAB	Teleconf. w/ Y. Kopel re MSJ order and next steps	0.2	\$1,000.00	\$200.00
2018.09.06	Bell & Howell	YZK	Supervise support staff in gathering media mentions	0.4	\$575.00	\$230.00
2018.09.06	Bell & Howell	YZK	Call w/ SAB re order and next steps	0.2	\$575.00	\$115.00
2018.09.06	Bell & Howell	YZK	Search for firm work product re express warranty SOL by state	0.5	\$575.00	\$287.50
2018.09.06	Bell & Howell	EMW	Researched news links re MSJ order and sent them to SAB (.7)	0.7	\$300.00	\$210.00
2018.09.07	Bell & Howell	YZK	Call from class member	0.6	\$575.00	\$345.00
2018.09.07	Bell & Howell	YZK	Call w. M Potter re MSJ decision	0.7	\$575.00	\$402.50
2018.09.07	Bell & Howell	YZK	Calls w/ both Ps	1.1	\$575.00	\$632.50
2018.09.13	Bell & Howell	SAB	Videoconf. w/ Y. Kopel re subclasses for statutes of limitations	0.3	\$1,000.00	\$300.00
2018.09.13	Bell & Howell	YZK	SOL research	1.8	\$575.00	\$1,035.00
2018.09.14	Bell & Howell	SAB	Analyzed SOL issues (1.3); videoconf. w/ Y. Kopel re same (.3)	1.6	\$1,000.00	\$1,600.00
2018.09.14	Bell & Howell	YZK	Research re subclasses SOLs	2.2	\$575.00	\$1,265.00
2018.09.14	Bell & Howell	MCS	OCR Summary Judgment Motion PDF for YZK	0.3	\$275.00	\$82.50
2018.09.17	Bell & Howell	YZK	Draft and send email to opposing counsel re subclasses	1.9	\$575.00	\$1,092.50
2018.09.20	Bell & Howell	YZK	Research for MFR opp	1.8	\$575.00	\$1,035.00
2018.09.20	Bell & Howell	FJK	Conf w/ Y. Kopel re Resh briefing (.2)	0.2	\$550.00	\$110.00
2018.09.21	Bell & Howell	SAB	Videoconf. w/ Y. Kopel re analysis of D's motion for reconsideration based on China Agritech	0.3	\$1,000.00	\$300.00
2018.09.21	Bell & Howell	SAB	Conf. w/ Y. Kopel re settlement strategy	0.3	\$1,000.00	\$300.00
2018.09.21	Bell & Howell	YZK	Discuss possibility of settlement letter with SAB	0.3	\$575.00	\$172.50
2018.09.21	Bell & Howell	YZK	Research for MFR opp	3.1	\$575.00	\$1,782.50
2018.09.21	Bell & Howell	CBS	Research re: motion for reconsideration.	3.4	\$315.00	\$1,071.00
2018.09.24	Bell & Howell	SAB	Read Scott Wing's revised draft letter re subclasses and teleconf. w/ Y. Kopel re same	0.5	\$1,000.00	\$500.00
2018.09.26	Bell & Howell	YZK	Research for MFR opp	2.7	\$575.00	\$1,552.50
2018.09.26	Bell & Howell	YZK	Review Ds' updated subclass letter and draft ours	2.5	\$575.00	\$1,437.50
2018.09.26	Bell & Howell	CBS	Research re: relation back doctrine.	1.5	\$315.00	\$472.50
2018.09.27	Bell & Howell	YZK	Begin work on MFR opp	1.2	\$575.00	\$690.00
2018.09.27	Bell & Howell	YZK	Save Ds' subclasses letter to box	0.1	\$575.00	\$57.50
2018.09.27	Bell & Howell	EMW	Saved to box plf's and defs' letter re submission of proposed subclasses (.2) Prepared and sent courtesy copy of plf's letter re submission of proposed subclasses (.2)	0.4	\$300.00	\$120.00
2018.09.28	Bell & Howell	YZK	Review order and recalendar deadline	0.1	\$575.00	\$57.50
2018.09.28	Bell & Howell	YZK	Research for and drafting MFR opp	6.0	\$575.00	\$3,450.00

DATE	MATTER	ATTY	DESCRIPTION	TIME	RATE	AMOUNT
2018.09.28	Bell & Howell	YZK	Draft ltr to court requesting extension	0.3	\$575.00	\$172.50
2018.09.28	Bell & Howell	YZK	Email opposing counsel to request extension	0.2	\$575.00	\$115.00
2018.09.28	Bell & Howell	CBS	Reviewed defendants memo in support of reconsideration.	0.6	\$315.00	\$189.00
2018.09.28	Bell & Howell	EMW	Prepared and sent 2018.09.28 letter to judge (.2)	0.2	\$300.00	\$60.00
2018.10.02	Bell & Howell	JIM	Confer with Y. Kopel about statute of limitations and relation back issues for opposition to motion for reconsideration	0.6	\$850.00	\$510.00
2018.10.02	Bell & Howell	YZK	Research and drafting MFR Opp	5.8	\$575.00	\$3,335.00
2018.10.02	Bell & Howell	AFS	Research case law relating to relation back under NY/Fed. Law.	3.6	\$350.00	\$1,260.00
2018.10.03	Bell & Howell	YZK	Conduct research for MFR Opp	1.7	\$575.00	\$977.50
2018.10.03	Bell & Howell	AFS	Research case law relating to relation back under NY/Fed. Law (.8), confer with Y. Kopel regarding motion for reconsideration opp (.2); and begin drafting section of same (6.1)	7.1	\$350.00	\$2,485.00
2018.10.04	Bell & Howell	YZK	Work on MFR opp	1.7	\$575.00	\$977.50
2018.10.04	Bell & Howell	AFS	Research and draft relation back section of motion for reconsideration opp.	10	\$350.00	\$3,500.00
2018.10.05	Bell & Howell	YZK	Work on MFR opp	2.6	\$575.00	\$1,495.00
2018.10.05	Bell & Howell	YZK	Call w/ opposing counsel re settlement	0.2	\$575.00	\$115.00
2018.10.05	Bell & Howell	AFS	Draft relation back section of motion for reconsideration opp (3.5), confer with Y. Kopel regarding draft (.8), and conduct additional research re same (2.2)	6.5	\$350.00	\$2,275.00
2018.10.07	Bell & Howell	YZK	Work on MFR opp	2.5	\$575.00	\$1,437.50
2018.10.08	Bell & Howell	YZK	Revise MFR oppn	6.6	\$575.00	\$3,795.00
2018.10.08	Bell & Howell	YZK	Two calls w/ opposing counsel re settlement meetings	0.3	\$575.00	\$172.50
2018.10.09	Bell & Howell	YZK	Work on MFR opp	2.2	\$575.00	\$1,265.00
2018.10.09	Bell & Howell	AFS	Proofread and edit motion for reconsideration opposition.	0.5	\$350.00	\$175.00
2018.10.10	Bell & Howell	YZK	Finalize and file MFR	4.2	\$575.00	\$2,415.00
2018.10.10	Bell & Howell	YZK	Conf w/ opposing counsel re settlement meeting	0.2	\$575.00	\$115.00
2018.10.10	Bell & Howell	RSR	Prepared tables for opposition to recon motion (.6)	0.6	\$300.00	\$180.00
2018.10.11	Bell & Howell	YZK	Draft cover letter for courtesy copies	0.1	\$575.00	\$57.50
2018.10.11	Bell & Howell	EMW	Sent courtesy copy of MFR oppn to judge (.3)	0.3	\$300.00	\$90.00
2018.10.12	Bell & Howell	YZK	Conduct new doc review	1.7	\$575.00	\$977.50
2018.10.15	Bell & Howell	YZK	Schedule settlement call	0.2	\$575.00	\$115.00
2018.10.18	Bell & Howell	SAB	Teleconf. w/ Steig Olson and Bob Raskett of Quinn Emanuel re settlement negotiations, w/ Y. Kopel	0.5	\$1,000.00	\$500.00
2018.10.18	Bell & Howell	YZK	Prep for and attend settlement call w/ new counsel	1.6	\$575.00	\$920.00
2018.10.18	Bell & Howell	AFS	Read and analyze defendants' motion for reconsideration reply brief.	0.5	\$350.00	\$175.00
2018.10.23	Bell & Howell	YZK	Research for internal B+H veil piercing memo	2.6	\$575.00	\$1,495.00
2018.10.24	Bell & Howell	YZK	Draft veil piercing memo	1.9	\$575.00	\$1,092.50
2018.10.24	Bell & Howell	YZK	Review and redline draft confidentiality agreement	0.3	\$575.00	\$172.50

DATE	MATTER	ATTY	DESCRIPTION	TIME	RATE	AMOUNT
2018.10.25	Bell & Howell	SAB	Analyzed potential veil piercing issues and redlines to FRE 408 agreement	1.5	\$1,000.00	\$1,500.00
2018.10.25	Bell & Howell	YZK	Conf w/ SAB re settlement discussions	0.2	\$575.00	\$115.00
2018.10.25	Bell & Howell	DLS	Added signature to document	0.4	\$300.00	\$120.00
2018.10.26	Bell & Howell	YZK	Get confidentiality agreement signed and sent	0.3	\$575.00	\$172.50
2018.11.02	Bell & Howell	YZK	Review MFR order (.2); email to SAB (.1); call w/ and email to C Weir re supplemental declaration (.3)	0.6	\$575.00	\$345.00
2018.11.04	Bell & Howell	YZK	Call w/ SAB re new court order	0.2	\$575.00	\$115.00
2018.11.05	Bell & Howell	YZK	Call w/ opposing counsel re rescheduling teleconf.	0.2	\$575.00	\$115.00
2018.11.05	Bell & Howell	YZK	Analyze Ds' tax returns and call w/ accountant re same	1.9	\$575.00	\$1,092.50
2018.11.08	Bell & Howell	SAB	Reviewed draft letter to court re status conf (.2); analyzed D's tax returns and conf. w/ Y. Kopel re litigation strategy and settlement strategy (1.3)	1.5	\$1,000.00	\$1,500.00
2018.11.08	Bell & Howell	YZK	Meeting w/ SAB re settlement negotiations	0.4	\$575.00	\$230.00
2018.11.08	Bell & Howell	RSR	Reviewed order re class cert and Weir report and provided edits to Weir report (2)	2.0	\$300.00	\$600.00
2018.11.14	Bell & Howell	YZK	Conf w/ RSR re subclasses issue	0.2	\$575.00	\$115.00
2018.11.14	Bell & Howell	RSR	Conf. w/ YZK re weir report re class break down and emailed edits to Weir (.4)	0.4	\$300.00	\$120.00
2018.11.15	Bell & Howell	YZK	Conf w/ C Weir re supplemental decl	0.3	\$575.00	\$172.50
2018.11.16	Bell & Howell	SAB	Videoconf w/ Y. Kopel re prep for pretrial conf (.3); prep for pretrial conf. (.6); telephonic court appearance (.4); teleconf. w/ C. Weir & Y. Kopel re supplemental expert report (.3)	1.6	\$1,000.00	\$1,600.00
2018.11.16	Bell & Howell	YZK	Prep for teleconference (.5); argue teleconference (.4); work on arrangements re continuing mediation discussions, Weir report and depo scheduling, etc (1.3)	2.2	\$575.00	\$1,265.00
2018.11.16	Bell & Howell	EMW	Requested and saved to box 11/16 teleconference transcript (.4)	0.4	\$300.00	\$120.00
2018.11.20	Bell & Howell	YZK	Conf w/ SAB re Weir report, depo and settlement call	0.5	\$575.00	\$287.50
2018.11.20	Bell & Howell	EMW	Updated Box with expert reports (.4)	0.4	\$300.00	\$120.00
2018.11.23	Bell & Howell	YZK	Calls w/ C Weir and SAB re scheduling conf call	0.2	\$575.00	\$115.00
2018.11.25	Bell & Howell	SAB	Teleconf. w/ Y. Kopel & C. Weir re supplemental expert report (.5); prep for same (.8)	1.3	\$1,000.00	\$1,300.00
2018.11.25	Bell & Howell	YZK	Work w/ SAB and C Weir on damages calculations (.4); conf w/ SAB separately re same (.8)	1.2	\$575.00	\$690.00
2018.11.27	Bell & Howell	YZK	Work w/ C Weir to finalize report and file and serve same	1.6	\$575.00	\$920.00
2018.11.28	Bell & Howell	SAB	Drafted letter to T. Anten re limiting the Weir deposition (.6); conf. w/ Y. Kopel re litigation & settlement strategy (.8); email to R. Raskopf re settlement discussions (.3)	1.7	\$1,000.00	\$1,700.00
2018.11.28	Bell & Howell	YZK	Work w/ SAB on letter re Weir dep, scheduling mediation call and pre-trial exchange schedule	1.1	\$575.00	\$632.50

DATE	MATTER	ATTY	DESCRIPTION	TIME	RATE	AMOUNT
2018.11.30	Bell & Howell	YZK	Review Pauley pre-trial rules and assemble previous pre-trial materials for circulation	0.8	\$575.00	\$460.00
2018.11.30	Bell & Howell	CBS	Reviewed complaint and weir depo.	1.5	\$315.00	\$472.50
2018.12.03	Bell & Howell	SAB	Prep for settlement negotiations (1.0); teleconf. w/ R. Raskopf, S. Olson, Y. Kopel re settlement negotiations (.8); videoconf. w/ Y. Kopel to debrief after the call (.3); revised draft term sheet (.6); videoconf. w/ Yitz Kopel re draft term sheet (.3); email to defense counsel re draft term sheet and settlement demand (.2)	3.2	\$1,000.00	\$3,200.00
2018.12.03	Bell & Howell	YZK	Conf w/ SAB to prep for settlement call (.1); attend settlement call (.8); conf w/ SAB after call (.1); conf w/ team re same (.1)	1.1	\$575.00	\$632.50
2018.12.03	Bell & Howell	YZK	Prepare draft term sheet	1.7	\$575.00	\$977.50
2018.12.04	Bell & Howell	YZK	Work on pretrial materials and send to SAB	2.4	\$575.00	\$1,380.00
2018.12.04	Bell & Howell	RSR	Conf. w/ YZK and sent all pre-trial materials to SAB (.5)	0.5	\$300.00	\$150.00
2018.12.11	Bell & Howell	YZK	Conf w/ RSR re weir dep	0.1	\$575.00	\$57.50
2018.12.17	Bell & Howell	SAB	Travel MIA to NYC, prep for Weir deposition en route (4.0)	4.0	\$1,000.00	\$4,000.00
2018.12.17	Bell & Howell	YZK	Conf w/ team re pre-trial procedures	0.3	\$575.00	\$172.50
2018.12.17	Bell & Howell	YZK	Weir depo prep	0.8	\$575.00	\$460.00
2018.12.17	Bell & Howell	RSR	Worked with YZK re Weir dep prep book (.8)	0.8	\$300.00	\$240.00
2018.12.18	Bell & Howell	SAB	Prep for Weir deposition	3.8	\$1,000.00	\$3,800.00
2018.12.18	Bell & Howell	RSR	Updated Weir dep prep book (.2)	0.2	\$300.00	\$60.00
2018.12.19	Bell & Howell	SAB	Prep for C. Weir deposition tomorrow	5.3	\$1,000.00	\$5,300.00
2018.12.20	Bell & Howell	SAB	Prep for and defend Weir deposition (3.2); debrief with Weir after deposition (.9)	4.1	\$1,000.00	\$4,100.00
2018.12.20	Bell & Howell	YZK	Participate in Weir depo prep	1.2	\$575.00	\$690.00
2018.12.21	Bell & Howell	YZK	Review Weir transcript	0.5	\$575.00	\$287.50
2019.01.02	Bell & Howell	YZK	Work on Weir letter to Court	4.9	\$575.00	\$2,817.50
2019.01.02	Bell & Howell	YZK	Revisions to pre-trial materials	1.9	\$575.00	\$1,092.50
2019.01.03	Bell & Howell	YZK	Revisions to Weir letter	2.2	\$575.00	\$1,265.00
2019.01.04	Bell & Howell	YZK	Conf w/ SAB re date for exchange of exhibits etc	0.4	\$575.00	\$230.00
2019.01.07	Bell & Howell	YZK	Conf w/ opposing counsel re exchange of designations	0.2	\$575.00	\$115.00
2019.01.07	Bell & Howell	YZK	Finalize and file Weir response ltr	2.8	\$575.00	\$1,610.00
2019.01.10	Bell & Howell	SAB	Conf. call w/ defense counsel re exchange of materials for joint pretrial order (.4); teleconf. w/ Y. Kopel re prep for same (.2); teleconf w/ Y. Kopel re next steps (.3)	0.9	\$1,000.00	\$900.00
2019.01.10	Bell & Howell	YZK	Call w/ C Weir re depo errata	0.3	\$575.00	\$172.50
2019.01.10	Bell & Howell	YZK	Prep for and attend call re pre-trial order	1.7	\$575.00	\$977.50
2019.01.14	Bell & Howell	YZK	Work on pretrial disclosures	4.6	\$575.00	\$2,645.00

DATE	MATTER	ATTY	DESCRIPTION	TIME	RATE	AMOUNT
2019.01.15	Bell & Howell	SAB	Teleconf. w/ Y. Kopel re trial prep (.3); revised draft joint pretrial order (.9)	1.2	\$1,000.00	\$1,200.00
2019.01.15	Bell & Howell	YZK	Prepare pretrial order	2.4	\$575.00	\$1,380.00
2019.01.16	Bell & Howell	SAB	Reviewed joint pretrial order materials	3.5	\$1,000.00	\$3,500.00
2019.01.16	Bell & Howell	JDA	Discuss exhibit objections with Y. Kopel	1.5	\$750.00	\$1,125.00
2019.01.16	Bell & Howell	YZK	Work on pre-trial exchanges	5.2	\$575.00	\$2,990.00
2019.01.17	Bell & Howell	LTF	Discussed trial issues with Yitz Kopel.	0.5	\$1,000.00	\$500.00
2019.01.17	Bell & Howell	SAB	Videoconf. w/ Y. Kopel re trial prep and reviewed trial exhibits and objections	1.7	\$1,000.00	\$1,700.00
2019.01.17	Bell & Howell	JDA	Discuss exhibit objections with Y. Kopel and S. Bursor	1.5	\$750.00	\$1,125.00
2019.01.17	Bell & Howell	YZK	Finalize objections and work on depo designations	5.5	\$575.00	\$3,162.50
2019.01.17	Bell & Howell	RSR	Conf. w/ SAB re pre-trial material prep (.2), conf. w/ YZK re PTO due tomorrow and assisted with same (.8)	1.0	\$300.00	\$300.00
2019.01.17	Bell & Howell	SER	Fielded inquiry about claim status	0.1	\$250.00	\$25.00
2019.01.17	Bell & Howell	SER	Prepare folders of exhibits	4.2	\$250.00	\$1,050.00
2019.01.18	Bell & Howell	YZK	Finalize and file PTO with ancillary docs	8.6	\$575.00	\$4,945.00
2019.01.18	Bell & Howell	RSR	Assisted with PTO due today (4.7)	4.7	\$300.00	\$1,410.00
2019.01.18	Bell & Howell	SER	Fielded inquiry about claim status	0.5	\$250.00	\$125.00
2019.01.18	Bell & Howell	SER	Make SAB BHH Briefing books	3.5	\$250.00	\$875.00
2019.01.22	Bell & Howell	YZK	Call w/ chambers re courtesy copy	0.2	\$575.00	\$115.00
2019.01.22	Bell & Howell	YZK	Email to follow up re in-person M&C	0.1	\$575.00	\$57.50
2019.01.22	Bell & Howell	SER	Create SAB book of BHH Def Exh	1.5	\$250.00	\$375.00
2019.01.23	Bell & Howell	JIM	Confer with Y. Kopel about Daubert issues, trial strategy, and upcoming pretrial conference	0.8	\$850.00	\$680.00
2019.01.23	Bell & Howell	YZK	Conf w/ JIM re case management	0.7	\$575.00	\$402.50
2019.01.23	Bell & Howell	YZK	Draft MIL ltr and conf w/ team re same	2.2	\$575.00	\$1,265.00
2019.01.23	Bell & Howell	YZK	Oversee courtesy copies	0.2	\$575.00	\$115.00
2019.01.23	Bell & Howell	YZK	Conf w/ C Weir re trial availability	0.3	\$575.00	\$172.50
2019.01.23	Bell & Howell	YZK	Conf w/ J Hart re trial availability	0.5	\$575.00	\$287.50
2019.01.24	Bell & Howell	YZK	Conf w/ M Potter & S Bueno re trial availability	1.3	\$575.00	\$747.50
2019.01.24	Bell & Howell	YZK	Call w/ opposing counsel re scheduling etc	0.2	\$575.00	\$115.00
2019.01.25	Bell & Howell	YZK	Follow up w/ SAB re M&C scheduling	0.2	\$575.00	\$115.00
2019.01.25	Bell & Howell	YZK	Conf w/ opposing counsel and team re request to continue PMC date	0.2	\$575.00	\$115.00
2019.01.25	Bell & Howell	YZK	Revise and update MIL list (and research re same)	0.7	\$575.00	\$402.50
2019.01.25	Bell & Howell	YZK	Work on scheduling for PTC	0.5	\$575.00	\$287.50
2019.01.28	Bell & Howell	SAB	Videoconf. w/ Y. Kopel re preparation for pretrial conference	0.3	\$1,000.00	\$300.00

DATE	MATTER	ATTY	DESCRIPTION	TIME	RATE	AMOUNT
2019.01.28	Bell & Howell	YZK	Conf w/ SAB re scheduling (.2); call to chambers re same (.1); call to opposing counsel re same (.1); email to counsel re same (.1); double check records for date of video production (.2); draft letter re continuance (.2); circulate same (.1); listen to vm from chambers (.1)	1.1	\$575.00	\$632.50
2019.01.29	Bell & Howell	SAB	Trial prep	6.5	\$1,000.00	\$6,500.00
2019.01.29	Bell & Howell	YZK	Call w/ opposing counsel re scheduling etc (.1); finalize and exchange MIL letter (.3); call to chambers re scheduling (.1); review scheduling order, save to box, and calendar (.1); research re ds' MILS (.1); format joint MIL letter and circulate to SAB (.1); email S Bueno re scheduling (.1);	0.9	\$575.00	\$517.50
2019.01.29	Bell & Howell	YZK	Finalize and file MIL letter	2.1	\$575.00	\$1,207.50
2019.01.30	Bell & Howell	SAB	Trial prep	6.3	\$1,000.00	\$6,300.00
2019.01.30	Bell & Howell	YZK	Trial preparation	1.2	\$575.00	\$690.00
2019.01.30	Bell & Howell	SER	Fedex courtesy copy	0.1	\$250.00	\$25.00
2019.01.30	Bell & Howell	SER	Download and organize docs for YZK	1.5	\$250.00	\$375.00
2019.01.31	Bell & Howell	SAB	Trial prep	8.1	\$1,000.00	\$8,100.00
2019.01.31	Bell & Howell	YZK	Trial preparation	3.6	\$575.00	\$2,070.00
2019.01.31	Bell & Howell	EMW	Trial prep w. SAB (2)	2.0	\$300.00	\$600.00
2019.02.01	Bell & Howell	SAB	Trial prep	3.6	\$1,000.00	\$3,600.00
2019.02.01	Bell & Howell	YZK	Trial prep - work on pretrial issues and exhibit authentication	2.6	\$575.00	\$1,495.00
2019.02.04	Bell & Howell	YZK	Work on corrected Donahue Declaration	0.3	\$575.00	\$172.50
2019.02.04	Bell & Howell	YZK	Email to counsel re physical exhibit	0.2	\$575.00	\$115.00
2019.02.05	Bell & Howell	YZK	Follow up email re exhibit "n"	0.1	\$575.00	\$57.50
2019.02.06	Bell & Howell	LTF	Discussed jury instructions, verdict form and voir dire with Yitz Kopel and Allyson Shea and sent models to Mr. Kopel.	0.5	\$1,000.00	\$500.00
2019.02.06	Bell & Howell	YZK	Finalize and serve cert of authenticity	0.2	\$575.00	\$115.00
2019.02.06	Bell & Howell	YZK	Research and prep for voire dire, instructions and jury questions	2.9	\$575.00	\$1,667.50
2019.02.06	Bell & Howell	YZK	Research re MILs	0.7	\$575.00	\$402.50
2019.02.06	Bell & Howell	AFS	Conduct research related to Defendants' proposed MILs and draft memo re same.	6.7	\$350.00	\$2,345.00
2019.02.07	Bell & Howell	LTF	Discussed CLRA issue with Yitz Kopel and asked Molly Sasseen to send some model instructions to Mr. Kopel.	0.3	\$1,000.00	\$300.00
2019.02.07	Bell & Howell	SAB	Drafted email to D's counsel re meeting of lead trial counsel in advance of pretrial conference (.5); teleconf. w/ Y. Kopel re trial prep (.3)	0.8	\$1,000.00	\$800.00
2019.02.07	Bell & Howell	YZK	Draft jury instructions and voir dire questions	7.9	\$575.00	\$4,542.50
2019.02.07	Bell & Howell	AFS	Research re MILs (4.8); draft verdict form (2.3).	7.1	\$350.00	\$2,485.00
2019.02.07	Bell & Howell	MCS	Scan pages with info from Avacor re CLRA jury instructions, send to YZK	0.4	\$275.00	\$110.00
2019.02.08	Bell & Howell	YZK	Review evidence and draft plaintiff trial books	3.1	\$575.00	\$1,782.50
2019.02.08	Bell & Howell	YZK	Go to Quinn to review physical exhibits	1.6	\$575.00	\$920.00

DATE	MATTER	ATTY	DESCRIPTION	TIME	RATE	AMOUNT
2019.02.08	Bell & Howell	YZK	Trial prep	4.2	\$575.00	\$2,415.00
2019.02.08	Bell & Howell	AFS	Conduct research re MILs and draft memo regarding same.	4.6	\$350.00	\$1,610.00
2019.02.08	Bell & Howell	EMW	Prepped for M&C @ Quinn Emmanuel (1.3)	1.3	\$300.00	\$390.00
2019.02.08	Bell & Howell	SER	Upload files	1.0	\$250.00	\$250.00
2019.02.09	Bell & Howell	SAB	Travel MIA to NYC, prep for pretrial conference en route	4.0	\$1,000.00	\$4,000.00
2019.02.10	Bell & Howell	YZK	Review and revise voir dire, instructions, and verdict form	2.1	\$575.00	\$1,207.50
2019.02.11	Bell & Howell	SAB	Conf. w/ Y. Kopel & A. Shea re prep for pretrial conference (.4); revised draft verdict form (.6); prep for pretrial conference (6.3); meeting of lead trial counsel (3.0)	10.3	\$1,000.00	\$10,300.00
2019.02.11	Bell & Howell	JDA	Attend meet and confer and related travel	3.3	\$750.00	\$2,475.00
2019.02.11	Bell & Howell	JDA	Meet with team to discuss trial strategy and prepare for pre-trial hearing	2.9	\$750.00	\$2,175.00
2019.02.11	Bell & Howell	YZK	Prepare for M&C	4.7	\$575.00	\$2,702.50
2019.02.11	Bell & Howell	YZK	Travel to Quinn and attend M&C	3.3	\$575.00	\$1,897.50
2019.02.11	Bell & Howell	YZK	Prep for tomorrow's court conference	2.9	\$575.00	\$1,667.50
2019.02.11	Bell & Howell	AFS	Prepare for M&C (4.7); travel to Quinn and attend M&C (3.3); prepare for 2/13 pretrial conference (2.9); review and analyze defense exhibits K-1, K-2 (1.6).	12.5	\$350.00	\$4,375.00
2019.02.11	Bell & Howell	EMW	M&C prep (.7)	0.7	\$300.00	\$210.00
2019.02.11	Bell & Howell	SER	Upload rat test video files	1.0	\$250.00	\$250.00
2019.02.12	Bell & Howell	SAB	Prep for and attend pretrial conference (8.5); team debrief after pretrial conference (1.1)	9.6	\$1,000.00	\$9,600.00
2019.02.12	Bell & Howell	JIM	Attend initial pretrial conference	2.0	\$850.00	\$1,700.00
2019.02.12	Bell & Howell	JDA	Travel to/from and attend pre-trial conference	3.5	\$750.00	\$2,625.00
2019.02.12	Bell & Howell	YZK	Prep for pretrial conference	4.9	\$575.00	\$2,817.50
2019.02.12	Bell & Howell	YZK	Go to pretrial conference	2.9	\$575.00	\$1,667.50
2019.02.12	Bell & Howell	YZK	Prep for tomorrow's M&C	2.7	\$575.00	\$1,552.50
2019.02.12	Bell & Howell	AFS	Prepare for pretrial conference (4.5); travel to and attend same (3.4); prepare for 2/13 M&C (3.8).	11.7	\$350.00	\$4,095.00
2019.02.12	Bell & Howell	RSR	Conf. w/ SER re video playback and assist with viewing issues (.3)	0.3	\$300.00	\$90.00
2019.02.12	Bell & Howell	SER	Research and consult Anitoliy Kats on .264 media player	2.5	\$250.00	\$625.00
2019.02.13	Bell & Howell	SAB	Prep for and attend meeting of trial counsel (7.4); trial team debrief on next steps (.6); multiple confs. w/ Y. Kopel re recently produced video recordings of Defendants' efficacy testing (1.2); revised draft trial stipulations (.9); analyzed transcript of yesterday's pretrial conf (.8)	10.9	\$1,000.00	\$10,900.00
2019.02.13	Bell & Howell	JDA	Travel to/from and attend meet and confer conference on exhibits	5.0	\$750.00	\$3,750.00

DATE	MATTER	ATTY	DESCRIPTION	TIME	RATE	AMOUNT
2019.02.13	Bell & Howell	JDA	Team meeting about trial preparation	0.3	\$750.00	\$225.00
2019.02.13	Bell & Howell	YZK	Travel and attend M&C at Quinn	5.0	\$575.00	\$2,875.00
2019.02.13	Bell & Howell	YZK	Draft stips, send cut video clips and other trial prep	4.6	\$575.00	\$2,645.00
2019.02.13	Bell & Howell	AFS	Prepare for M&C (1.8); travel to Quinn and attend M&C (5.1); confer with S. Bursor, Y. Kopel, J. Arisohn, and S. Riley re same (.3); edit, review and organize photographs of defense exhibits N-1-21 (2.6); update Plaintiffs' exhibit list (.6).	10.4	\$350.00	\$3,640.00
2019.02.13	Bell & Howell	SER	Review video doc production, confer with SAB, YZK, AFS, JDA	9.5	\$250.00	\$2,375.00
2019.02.14	Bell & Howell	AFS	Edit, review and organize photographs of defense exhibits N-1-21 (4.8); correspond with opposing counsel re exhibit list (.1).	4.9	\$350.00	\$1,715.00
2019.02.14	Bell & Howell	SER	Review Potter and testing reports, and review/record video doc production	14.7	\$250.00	\$3,675.00
2019.02.15	Bell & Howell	YZK	Work on MILs and trial books	1.7	\$575.00	\$977.50
2019.02.15	Bell & Howell	SER	Reviewed/recorded video doc production	10.3	\$250.00	\$2,575.00
2019.02.16	Bell & Howell	SER	Reviewed/recorded video doc production	3.1	\$250.00	\$775.00
2019.02.19	Bell & Howell	SER	Reviewed/recorded video doc production, confer with SAB, YZK, AFS, JDA	4.8	\$250.00	\$1,200.00
2019.02.20	Bell & Howell	SAB	Teleconf. w/ Y. Kopel re trial prep (.3); videoconf. w/ Y. Kopel and trial team to review and discuss recently produced videos of Defendants' testing, and also to discuss drafting of MILs (1.1)	1.4	\$1,000.00	\$1,400.00
2019.02.20	Bell & Howell	YZK	Review evidence and trial prep	3.8	\$575.00	\$2,185.00
2019.02.20	Bell & Howell	YZK	Conf w/ SAB re case management	0.4	\$575.00	\$230.00
2019.02.20	Bell & Howell	YZK	Finalize and circulate drafts of instructions, verdict form, voir dire	0.5	\$575.00	\$287.50
2019.02.20	Bell & Howell	YZK	Draft memo re admissibility of efficacy studies	2.5	\$575.00	\$1,437.50
2019.02.20	Bell & Howell	AFS	Confer with Y. Kopel re MILs (.2), draft memo re same (1.2), and begin drafting same (2.9); draft memo re defendants' study exhibits (1.1).	5.4	\$350.00	\$1,890.00
2019.02.21	Bell & Howell	LTF	Call with Yitz Kopel regarding motions in limine.	0.1	\$1,000.00	\$100.00
2019.02.21	Bell & Howell	SAB	Revised draft MIL briefs	3.8	\$1,000.00	\$3,800.00
2019.02.21	Bell & Howell	YZK	Research re use of Neilsen data in litigation	0.7	\$575.00	\$402.50
2019.02.21	Bell & Howell	YZK	Brief call w/ Potter re testing videos	0.2	\$575.00	\$115.00
2019.02.21	Bell & Howell	YZK	Work on MILs	7.9	\$575.00	\$4,542.50
2019.02.21	Bell & Howell	YZK	Work with Defendant's testing vids and create list for exhibit clips	2.2	\$575.00	\$1,265.00
2019.02.21	Bell & Howell	AFS	Research and draft MILs.	4.6	\$350.00	\$1,610.00
2019.02.21	Bell & Howell	SER	Reviewed/cut video doc for exhibits	3.2	\$250.00	\$800.00
2019.02.22	Bell & Howell	SAB	Revised draft MIL briefs	3.5	\$1,000.00	\$3,500.00
2019.02.22	Bell & Howell	YZK	Draft email re mediation and MILs to opposing counsel	0.1	\$575.00	\$57.50
2019.02.22	Bell & Howell	YZK	Call w/ SAB re mediation and MILs	0.2	\$575.00	\$115.00
2019.02.22	Bell & Howell	YZK	Work on MILs	5.8	\$575.00	\$3,335.00
2019.02.22	Bell & Howell	YZK	Call w/ Potter	1.9	\$575.00	\$1,092.50

DATE	MATTER	ATTY	DESCRIPTION	TIME	RATE	AMOUNT
2019.02.22	Bell & Howell	AFS	Research and draft MILs.	9.7	\$350.00	\$3,395.00
2019.02.22	Bell & Howell	MSR	Research re: corporate witnesses	1.7	\$325.00	\$552.50
2019.02.22	Bell & Howell	MSR	Research re: third party docs	0.7	\$325.00	\$227.50
2019.02.22	Bell & Howell	SER	Reviewed/cut video doc for exhibits/Confer with YZK and Dr. Potter	7.7	\$250.00	\$1,925.00
2019.02.23	Bell & Howell	SAB	Revised draft MIL briefs	4.9	\$1,000.00	\$4,900.00
2019.02.24	Bell & Howell	SAB	Revised draft MIL briefs	6.5	\$1,000.00	\$6,500.00
2019.02.24	Bell & Howell	YZK	Work on MILs	5.2	\$575.00	\$2,990.00
2019.02.24	Bell & Howell	AFS	Research related to late disclosure of recently discovered documents.	1.3	\$350.00	\$455.00
2019.02.25	Bell & Howell	SAB	Revised draft motions in limine (3.0); teleconf. w/ Y. Kopel re trial preparations (.3); email to R. Raskopf re trial stipulations (.2)	3.5	\$1,000.00	\$3,500.00
2019.02.25	Bell & Howell	YZK	Review clips for circulation	0.5	\$575.00	\$287.50
2019.02.25	Bell & Howell	YZK	Conf w/ SAB re MILs, rat videos, stips, and other related matters	0.3	\$575.00	\$172.50
2019.02.25	Bell & Howell	SER	Prepared exhibits for SAB, YZK	2.3	\$250.00	\$575.00
2019.02.26	Bell & Howell	YZK	More review of videos	2.3	\$575.00	\$1,322.50
2019.02.26	Bell & Howell	RSR	Conf. w/ YZK re MIL status, due Friday (.1)	0.1	\$300.00	\$30.00
2019.02.27	Bell & Howell	YZK	Search through HSN docs (1.5); call w/ SAB re stips, etc. (.2)	1.7	\$575.00	\$977.50
2019.02.27	Bell & Howell	YZK	Mark up studies for use at trial	3.1	\$575.00	\$1,782.50
2019.02.27	Bell & Howell	AFS	Research mediator availability.	1.4	\$350.00	\$490.00
2019.02.28	Bell & Howell	SAB	Revised draft motions in limine (2.5); teleconf. w/ Y. Kopel re same (.4); analyzed D's redlines to trial stipulations (.4); analyzed Defendants' 2016 study videos and developed strategy w/ Y. Kopel, A. Shea & S. Riley (2.0)	5.3	\$1,000.00	\$5,300.00
2019.02.28	Bell & Howell	YZK	Emails w/ opposing counsel (.3); meeting re videos (.5); work on MILs (2.7); finalize trial stipulations (.3)	3.8	\$575.00	\$2,185.00
2019.02.28	Bell & Howell	AFS	Research and draft MILs (5.1); research mediator availability (.7); confer with Y. Kopel, S. Bursor, and S. Riley re videos, mediators, and MILs (.3)	6.1	\$350.00	\$2,135.00
2019.02.28	Bell & Howell	RSR	Assisted with MILs due tomorrow (2.2)	2.2	\$300.00	\$660.00
2019.02.28	Bell & Howell	SER	Conferred with SAB, YZK, and AFS regarding exhibits	1.0	\$250.00	\$250.00
2019.03.01	Bell & Howell	LTF	Assisted with filing trial stipulations and motions in limine.	0.2	\$1,000.00	\$200.00
2019.03.01	Bell & Howell	YZK	Finalize and file MILs	6.1	\$575.00	\$3,507.50
2019.03.01	Bell & Howell	AFS	Finalize MILs and prepare for filing (2.8), review Defs' MIL No. 4 (.4).	3.2	\$350.00	\$1,120.00
2019.03.01	Bell & Howell	DLS	Calls with Y. Kopel re filing; finalized and filed MILs	0.9	\$300.00	\$270.00
2019.03.01	Bell & Howell	RSR	Assisted with MILs due today (1.3)	1.3	\$300.00	\$390.00
2019.03.01	Bell & Howell	MCS	Assist Debbie with filing MILs	0.7	\$275.00	\$192.50
2019.03.01	Bell & Howell	SER	Repackaged and edited video/still exhibits	5.8	\$250.00	\$1,450.00
2019.03.02	Bell & Howell	SAB	Read MIL briefs	4.8	\$1,000.00	\$4,800.00
2019.03.02	Bell & Howell	YZK	Review Ds' MIL filings	1.7	\$575.00	\$977.50
2019.03.03	Bell & Howell	YZK	Draft potter MIL opp	6.1	\$575.00	\$3,507.50

DATE	MATTER	ATTY	DESCRIPTION	TIME	RATE	AMOUNT
2019.03.04	Bell & Howell	YZK	Conf. w/ JDA re new discovery demands	0.3	\$575.00	\$172.50
2019.03.04	Bell & Howell	YZK	Work on potter mil opp	9.9	\$575.00	\$5,692.50
2019.03.04	Bell & Howell	AFS	Review Defs' MILs 1-3, 5.	1.5	\$350.00	\$525.00
2019.03.04	Bell & Howell	EMW	Saved MIL filings to box (.7) Sent courtesy copies to judge (1)	1.7	\$300.00	\$510.00
2019.03.04	Bell & Howell	SER	Repackaged and edited video/still exhibits	2.0	\$250.00	\$500.00
2019.03.05	Bell & Howell	YZK	Work on potter MIL opp	10.4	\$575.00	\$5,980.00
2019.03.05	Bell & Howell	AFS	Research and draft MIL opps (8.4), research mediator rates (.2).	8.6	\$350.00	\$3,010.00
2019.03.06	Bell & Howell	JDA	Review motion to preclude Weir	2.9	\$750.00	\$2,175.00
2019.03.06	Bell & Howell	JDA	Draft opposition to motion to preclude Weir	3.9	\$750.00	\$2,925.00
2019.03.06	Bell & Howell	YZK	Work on Potter MIL opp	11.1	\$575.00	\$6,382.50
2019.03.06	Bell & Howell	AFS	Research and draft MIL opps.	7.7	\$350.00	\$2,695.00
2019.03.06	Bell & Howell	SER	Compile Defendant's Study Exhibits Spreadsheet	0.9	\$250.00	\$225.00
2019.03.07	Bell & Howell	JDA	Draft opposition to motion to preclude Weir	7.4	\$750.00	\$5,550.00
2019.03.07	Bell & Howell	YZK	Draft mouse MIL opp	9.9	\$575.00	\$5,692.50
2019.03.07	Bell & Howell	AFS	Research and draft MIL opps.	6.1	\$350.00	\$2,135.00
2019.03.08	Bell & Howell	SAB	Revised draft MIL oppositions	4.7	\$1,000.00	\$4,700.00
2019.03.08	Bell & Howell	JDA	Draft opposition to motion to preclude Weir	2.5	\$750.00	\$1,875.00
2019.03.08	Bell & Howell	YZK	Draft mouse MIL opp	6.9	\$575.00	\$3,967.50
2019.03.08	Bell & Howell	AFS	Research and draft MIL opps (6.8) and confer with M. Roberts re research related to same (.3).	7.1	\$350.00	\$2,485.00
2019.03.08	Bell & Howell	MSR	Research re: representations for warranty and CLRA claims	2.4	\$325.00	\$780.00
2019.03.09	Bell & Howell	SAB	Revised draft MIL oppositions	5.5	\$1,000.00	\$5,500.00
2019.03.10	Bell & Howell	SAB	Revised draft MIL oppositions	4.3	\$1,000.00	\$4,300.00
2019.03.10	Bell & Howell	YZK	Draft mouse MIL opp	5.2	\$575.00	\$2,990.00
2019.03.11	Bell & Howell	SAB	Videoconf. w/ Y. Kopel re MIL drafting, potential mediators, and litigation strategy	1.0	\$1,000.00	\$1,000.00
2019.03.11	Bell & Howell	JDA	Draft opposition to motion to preclude Weir	7.0	\$750.00	\$5,250.00
2019.03.11	Bell & Howell	YZK	Conf w/ SAB re mediation scheduling and MILs (1); emails w/ opposing counsel re scheduling (.1)	1.1	\$575.00	\$632.50
2019.03.11	Bell & Howell	YZK	Continue work on mouse MIL opp	10.5	\$575.00	\$6,037.50
2019.03.11	Bell & Howell	AFS	Research mediator availability (Maas).	0.2	\$350.00	\$70.00
2019.03.11	Bell & Howell	SER	Fielded claim inquiries	0.1	\$250.00	\$25.00
2019.03.11	Bell & Howell	SER	Trial Exhibit B Donahue review	0.6	\$250.00	\$150.00
2019.03.12	Bell & Howell	SAB	Teleconf. w/ Y. Kopel, B. Raskopf, K. Cassidy, S. Olson re setting up mediation (.7)	0.7	\$1,000.00	\$700.00
2019.03.12	Bell & Howell	JDA	Draft opposition to motion to preclude Weir	2.5	\$750.00	\$1,875.00

DATE	MATTER	ATTY	DESCRIPTION	TIME	RATE	AMOUNT
2019.03.12	Bell & Howell	YZK	Work on mouse MIL opp	9.7	\$575.00	\$5,577.50
2019.03.12	Bell & Howell	YZK	Prep for and attend conf call re mediators (.4); conf w/ team re same (.2); follow-ups on scheduling etc. (.2)	0.8	\$575.00	\$460.00
2019.03.12	Bell & Howell	AFS	Finalize MIL Nos. 4-5 and circulate same (1.4), review MIL No. 2 (3.2), attend teleconference re mediation (.3).	4.9	\$350.00	\$1,715.00
2019.03.12	Bell & Howell	RSR	Prepared tables for MIL Oppn (.6)	0.6	\$300.00	\$180.00
2019.03.13	Bell & Howell	SAB	Revised draft MIL oppositions (4.5)	4.5	\$1,000.00	\$4,500.00
2019.03.13	Bell & Howell	YZK	Complete first draft of mouse MIL opp	13.9	\$575.00	\$7,992.50
2019.03.13	Bell & Howell	AFS	Conduct research re Defs' MIL No. 3	7.6	\$350.00	\$2,660.00
2019.03.14	Bell & Howell	SAB	Revised draft MIL oppositions (4.8)	4.8	\$1,000.00	\$4,800.00
2019.03.14	Bell & Howell	YZK	Work on MIL opps	9.3	\$575.00	\$5,347.50
2019.03.14	Bell & Howell	YZK	Work on mediation scheduling	0.4	\$575.00	\$230.00
2019.03.14	Bell & Howell	YZK	Resend HSN production	0.5	\$575.00	\$287.50
2019.03.14	Bell & Howell	AFS	Review and edit MILs 3-5 and circulate revised drafts.	5.6	\$350.00	\$1,960.00
2019.03.14	Bell & Howell	SER	Review Potter CV Publications	0.6	\$250.00	\$150.00
2019.03.15	Bell & Howell	YZK	Finalize and file MIL opps	10.1	\$575.00	\$5,807.50
2019.03.15	Bell & Howell	AFS	Review and edit MILs and prepare for filing (4.2); review Defs' MIL opps (.5).	4.7	\$350.00	\$1,645.00
2019.03.15	Bell & Howell	EMW	Assisted w. MIL opps filing (4.7)	4.7	\$300.00	\$1,410.00
2019.03.15	Bell & Howell	RSR	Assisted with MIL oppns due today (5)	5.0	\$300.00	\$1,500.00
2019.03.15	Bell & Howell	SER	Review Potter CV Publications	0.4	\$250.00	\$100.00
2019.03.18	Bell & Howell	YZK	Draft MIL replies	8.7	\$575.00	\$5,002.50
2019.03.18	Bell & Howell	AFS	Confer with Y. Kopel re MIL replies (.2); research and draft same (5.9).	6.1	\$350.00	\$2,135.00
2019.03.18	Bell & Howell	EMW	Prepared courtesy copy of MIL oppns to judge (2)	2.0	\$300.00	\$600.00
2019.03.18	Bell & Howell	SER	Create P Opp to D MIL books	1.6	\$250.00	\$400.00
2019.03.19	Bell & Howell	SAB	Teleconf. w/ mediator Hon. John Martin (.6); teleconf. w/ Y. Kopel & A. Shea re drafting MIL reply brief (.4)	1.0	\$1,000.00	\$1,000.00
2019.03.19	Bell & Howell	YZK	Work on MIL replies	4.8	\$575.00	\$2,760.00
2019.03.19	Bell & Howell	YZK	Prep for and attend call w/ mediator	1.4	\$575.00	\$805.00
2019.03.19	Bell & Howell	AFS	Research and draft replies (6.3), confer with S. Bursor and Y. Kopel re same (.2).	6.5	\$350.00	\$2,275.00
2019.03.19	Bell & Howell	EMW	Redacted Oppn to MIL No. 1. (.2)	0.2	\$300.00	\$60.00
2019.03.20	Bell & Howell	YZK	Work on MIL replies	5.9	\$575.00	\$3,392.50
2019.03.20	Bell & Howell	YZK	Send docs to mediator	0.2	\$575.00	\$115.00
2019.03.20	Bell & Howell	AFS	Research and draft replies (4.6) and edit same (1.2)	5.8	\$350.00	\$2,030.00
2019.03.21	Bell & Howell	SAB	Revised draft MIL reply brief	1.5	\$1,000.00	\$1,500.00
2019.03.21	Bell & Howell	YZK	Work on MIL reply and related docs	4.2	\$575.00	\$2,415.00

DATE	MATTER	ATTY	DESCRIPTION	TIME	RATE	AMOUNT
2019.03.21	Bell & Howell	AFS	Edit MIL replies.	2.4	\$350.00	\$840.00
2019.03.21	Bell & Howell	RSR	Conf. w/ YZK re Mediation invoice and emailed defense counsel re same (.1)	0.1	\$300.00	\$30.00
2019.03.22	Bell & Howell	YZK	Finalize and file MIL reply and related docs	7.7	\$575.00	\$4,427.50
2019.03.22	Bell & Howell	AFS	Review and edit final MIL replies.	3.7	\$350.00	\$1,295.00
2019.03.22	Bell & Howell	EMW	Sent class member opt-out letters to KCC (.5)	0.5	\$300.00	\$150.00
2019.03.22	Bell & Howell	RSR	Prepared tables for MILs replies due today (.6)	0.6	\$300.00	\$180.00
2019.03.25	Bell & Howell	JDA	Review Weir reply	0.8	\$750.00	\$600.00
2019.03.25	Bell & Howell	YZK	Conf w/ RSR re mediator retention	0.2	\$575.00	\$115.00
2019.03.25	Bell & Howell	YZK	Review and analyze Ds' reply briefs, begin organizing books and conducting research for hearing	3.9	\$575.00	\$2,242.50
2019.03.25	Bell & Howell	AFS	Review Defs' MIL replies (1.2), draft and file letter re Plaintiffs' MILS (1.4).	2.6	\$350.00	\$910.00
2019.03.25	Bell & Howell	EMW	Assisted in prep for upcoming MIL hearing (1.3)	1.3	\$300.00	\$390.00
2019.03.25	Bell & Howell	SER	Assist with Letter to court	0.8	\$250.00	\$200.00
2019.03.26	Bell & Howell	AFS	Research and draft MIL hearing outline re Defs' MILS 4 and 5.	4.2	\$350.00	\$1,470.00
2019.03.27	Bell & Howell	YZK	Deal w/ sealing letter and filings	0.8	\$575.00	\$460.00
2019.03.27	Bell & Howell	AFS	Research and draft MIL hearing outline re Defs' MILS 4 and 5, Plfs' MILs 1,3,4.	5.9	\$350.00	\$2,065.00
2019.03.27	Bell & Howell	EMW	Prepared and sent letter re sealing request to judge (.9)	0.9	\$300.00	\$270.00
2019.03.27	Bell & Howell	RSR	Assisted with MIL hearing books (.2)	0.2	\$300.00	\$60.00
2019.03.27	Bell & Howell	SER	Prepare MIL books	1.6	\$250.00	\$400.00
2019.03.28	Bell & Howell	YZK	Hearing prep	3.1	\$575.00	\$1,782.50
2019.03.28	Bell & Howell	AFS	Research and draft MIL hearing outline re Defs' MILS 4 and 5, Plfs' MILs 1,3,4.	5.8	\$350.00	\$2,030.00
2019.03.29	Bell & Howell	YZK	Hearing prep	8.2	\$575.00	\$4,715.00
2019.03.29	Bell & Howell	AFS	Research and draft MIL hearing outline re Defs' MIL 1 (8.6); confer with Y. Kope re hearing (.3).	8.9	\$350.00	\$3,115.00
2019.03.30	Bell & Howell	SAB	Travel SF to NYC, prep for MIL hearing en route (7.0); more prep for MIL hearing at NY office (2.3)	9.3	\$1,000.00	\$9,300.00
2019.03.31	Bell & Howell	SAB	Prep for MIL hearing	5.5	\$1,000.00	\$5,500.00
2019.03.31	Bell & Howell	JDA	Prepare for pretrial hearing	3.1	\$750.00	\$2,325.00
2019.03.31	Bell & Howell	YZK	Prep for hearing	4.5	\$575.00	\$2,587.50
2019.04.01	Bell & Howell	SAB	Analyzed & produced new trial exhibits 199-273 from previously withheld videos of Defendants' testing (2.8); prep for and attended MIL hearing (7.8); debrief with trial team after MIL hearing (1.5)	12.1	\$1,000.00	\$12,100.00
2019.04.01	Bell & Howell	JDA	Prepare for pretrial hearing	4.5	\$750.00	\$3,375.00
2019.04.01	Bell & Howell	JDA	Attend pretrial hearing	3.5	\$750.00	\$2,625.00

DATE	MATTER	ATTY	DESCRIPTION	TIME	RATE	AMOUNT
2019.04.01	Bell & Howell	YZK	Prep for hearing (3.8); travel to court (.6); attend hearing (3.9); dinner meeting and recap with team following hearing (1.7); travel back to office (.3)	10.3	\$575.00	\$5,922.50
2019.04.01	Bell & Howell	AFS	Prepare for MIL hearing (3.9); travel to and attend same (4.2); confer with S. Bursor, Y. Kopel, and J. Arisohn re same (2.2); travel back from same (.3).	10.6	\$350.00	\$3,710.00
2019.04.02	Bell & Howell	SAB	Reviewed yesterday's hearing transcript and analyzed rulings on MILs (1.3)	1.3	\$1,000.00	\$1,300.00
2019.04.02	Bell & Howell	YZK	Work on mediation statement	2.2	\$575.00	\$1,265.00
2019.04.02	Bell & Howell	YZK	Make sure we're getting transcript	0.1	\$575.00	\$57.50
2019.04.02	Bell & Howell	AFS	Review press coverage of 4/1 MIL hearing .	0.2	\$350.00	\$70.00
2019.04.02	Bell & Howell	EMW	Requested SDNY court reporter transcript from 04/01 MIL hearing (.1)	0.1	\$300.00	\$30.00
2019.04.03	Bell & Howell	SAB	Teleconf. w/ K. Cassidy et al to meet & confer re new trial exhibits (.5) prep for same (.5); teleconf. w/ Y. Kopel re mediation strategy (.8); revised draft mediation statement (3.5); teleconfs. w/ J. Arisohn & Y. Kopel re Weir citations (.7)	6.0	\$1,000.00	\$6,000.00
2019.04.03	Bell & Howell	YZK	Prep for and attend call re new trial exhibits	0.3	\$575.00	\$172.50
2019.04.03	Bell & Howell	YZK	Finalize draft of mediation statement	1.9	\$575.00	\$1,092.50
2019.04.03	Bell & Howell	YZK	Research re Weir opinion on wholesale figures (.9); conf w/ C Weir re same (.8)	1.7	\$575.00	\$977.50
2019.04.03	Bell & Howell	YZK	Attend team meetings re mediation prep	1.5	\$575.00	\$862.50
2019.04.03	Bell & Howell	AFS	Edit mediation statement.	0.3	\$350.00	\$105.00
2019.04.03	Bell & Howell	SER	Mediation Prep	1.2	\$250.00	\$300.00
2019.04.04	Bell & Howell	SAB	Revised draft mediation statement (5.3); teleconfs. w/ Y. Kopel re same (.4)	5.7	\$1,000.00	\$5,700.00
2019.04.04	Bell & Howell	YZK	Finalize and submit mediation statement	0.3	\$575.00	\$172.50
2019.04.04	Bell & Howell	YZK	Finalize and serve RFP	0.3	\$575.00	\$172.50
2019.04.04	Bell & Howell	YZK	Email SAB re depo scheduling	0.2	\$575.00	\$115.00
2019.04.04	Bell & Howell	YZK	Review court's order and conf w/ team re same	0.9	\$575.00	\$517.50
2019.04.04	Bell & Howell	YZK	Work on mediation presentation	4.8	\$575.00	\$2,760.00
2019.04.04	Bell & Howell	YZK	Draft joint letter	3.1	\$575.00	\$1,782.50
2019.04.04	Bell & Howell	AFS	Draft letter re new photos/videos	8.7	\$350.00	\$3,045.00
2019.04.04	Bell & Howell	MSR	Confer with Allyson about research assignment (.1); research re: discovery (.7)	1.8	\$325.00	\$585.00
2019.04.04	Bell & Howell	EMW	Mediation prep (1.3)	1.3	\$300.00	\$390.00
2019.04.04	Bell & Howell	RSR	Began working with EMW on Mediation presentation (.6)	0.6	\$300.00	\$180.00
2019.04.04	Bell & Howell	SER	Mediation Prep	0.3	\$250.00	\$75.00
2019.04.05	Bell & Howell	SAB	Teleconf. w/ mediator Hon. John S. Martin (Ret.) (.5); prep for same (1.3); teleconf. w/ Y. Kopel re same (.4)	2.2	\$1,000.00	\$2,200.00
2019.04.05	Bell & Howell	YZK	Finish draft mediation presentation	7.2	\$575.00	\$4,140.00
2019.04.05	Bell & Howell	YZK	Finalize portion of joint letter	0.3	\$575.00	\$172.50

DATE	MATTER	ATTY	DESCRIPTION	TIME	RATE	AMOUNT
2019.04.05	Bell & Howell	AFS	Review mediation presentation and fix video issues re same (1.3), research benefit of the bargain issue and conduct other preparations for 4/8 mediation (4.1), draft joint letter re new videos and circulate to Def. counsel (2.2)	6.3	\$350.00	\$2,205.00
2019.04.05	Bell & Howell	MSR	Review expert deposition videos	0.5	\$325.00	\$162.50
2019.04.05	Bell & Howell	RSR	Assist with Mediation presentation (4)	4.0	\$300.00	\$1,200.00
2019.04.05	Bell & Howell	SER	Mediation Prep	0.3	\$250.00	\$75.00
2019.04.06	Bell & Howell	SAB	Drafted mediation slides and teleconf. w/ Y. Kopel re same	0.9	\$1,000.00	\$900.00
2019.04.07	Bell & Howell	SAB	Travel MIA to NYC, prep for mediation en route (4.0); additional mediation prep at NY office (3.3)	7.3	\$1,000.00	\$7,300.00
2019.04.07	Bell & Howell	RSR	Work with EMW on Mediation presentation (1)	1.0	\$300.00	\$300.00
2019.04.08	Bell & Howell	SAB	Mediation w/ Hon. John S. Martin (Ret.) (7.9); team debrief afterwards (.8); travel NYC to MIA, trial prep en route (4.0)	12.7	\$1,000.00	\$12,700.00
2019.04.08	Bell & Howell	YZK	Attend mediation and travel back to office	6.8	\$575.00	\$3,910.00
2019.04.08	Bell & Howell	YZK	Recap mediation and work on next steps	0.4	\$575.00	\$230.00
2019.04.08	Bell & Howell	AFS	Travel to and attend mediation (6.8) and travel back from same (.3).	7.1	\$350.00	\$2,485.00
2019.04.08	Bell & Howell	EMW	Prepared for and attended mediation (6)	6.0	\$300.00	\$1,800.00
2019.04.08	Bell & Howell	RSR	Attend Medation (6)	6.0	\$300.00	\$1,800.00
2019.04.09	Bell & Howell	AFS	Rec. Def. counsel's additions to joint letter and draft responses to same (5.1), confer with Y. Kopel and S. Bursor re same (.4).	5.5	\$350.00	\$1,925.00
2019.04.10	Bell & Howell	SAB	Revised draft joint letter re Trial Exhibits 199-273	3.0	\$1,000.00	\$3,000.00
2019.04.10	Bell & Howell	YZK	Review joint letter	0.2	\$575.00	\$115.00
2019.04.10	Bell & Howell	YZK	Call w/ Bueno	0.3	\$575.00	\$172.50
2019.04.10	Bell & Howell	AFS	Confer with S. Bursor and Y. Kopel re joint letter re new trial exhibits (.3), finalize same and circulate to Def. counsel (4.1), and file same (.3).	4.7	\$350.00	\$1,645.00
2019.04.11	Bell & Howell	SAB	Read joint letter to court re new trial exhibits (.3); analyzed mediator's proposal (.3)	0.6	\$1,000.00	\$600.00
2019.04.15	Bell & Howell	SAB	Multiple videoconfs. w/ Y. Kopel & A. Shea re prep for depositions to authenticate exhibits	1.1	\$1,000.00	\$1,100.00
2019.04.15	Bell & Howell	YZK	Conf w/ team re trial prep	1.1	\$575.00	\$632.50
2019.04.15	Bell & Howell	AFS	Prepare authentication exhibit list (3.2) and teleconference with Y. Kopel and S. Bursor re exhibit list and depo scheduling (1.1).	4.3	\$350.00	\$1,505.00
2019.04.16	Bell & Howell	SAB	Settlement negotiations	0.5	\$1,000.00	\$500.00
2019.04.16	Bell & Howell	YZK	Log doc productions	0.4	\$575.00	\$230.00
2019.04.16	Bell & Howell	AFS	Review J. Guindi supplemental production and prepare chronology related to same.	7.4	\$350.00	\$2,590.00
2019.04.17	Bell & Howell	SAB	Teleconf. w/ mediator Hon. John Martin re Ds' counteroffer of [REDACTED] (.2); email corresp. w/ Y. Kopel re same (.2)	0.4	\$1,000.00	\$400.00

DATE	MATTER	ATTY	DESCRIPTION	TIME	RATE	AMOUNT
2019.04.17	Bell & Howell	AFS	Review J. Guindi supplemental production and prepare chronology related to same.	8.8	\$350.00	\$3,080.00
2019.04.18	Bell & Howell	YZK	Conf w/ SAB re settlement, next steps, and case management	0.5	\$575.00	\$287.50
2019.04.18	Bell & Howell	YZK	Review summary of new docs and conf w/ ALS re same	0.5	\$575.00	\$287.50
2019.04.18	Bell & Howell	AFS	Review J. Guindi supplemental production and prepare chronology related to same.	6.2	\$350.00	\$2,170.00
2019.04.23	Bell & Howell	AFS	Research and draft Potter supp report (3.4), circulate list of documents to be authenticated to defense counsel (.2)	3.6	\$350.00	\$1,260.00
2019.04.24	Bell & Howell	AFS	Research and draft Potter supp report.	0.8	\$350.00	\$280.00
2019.04.25	Bell & Howell	YZK	Conf w/ ALS re Potter report	0.3	\$575.00	\$172.50
2019.04.25	Bell & Howell	AFS	Research and draft Potter supp report (7.1), correspond with def counsel re depo scheduling (.1).	7.2	\$350.00	\$2,520.00
2019.04.28	Bell & Howell	SAB	Drafted Potter supplemental expert report	2.8	\$1,000.00	\$2,800.00
2019.04.29	Bell & Howell	SAB	Teleconf. w/ Y. Kopel re settlement negotiations	0.3	\$1,000.00	\$300.00
2019.04.29	Bell & Howell	YZK	Conf w/ SAB re settlement negotiations	0.3	\$575.00	\$172.50
2019.04.29	Bell & Howell	AFS	Revise Potter supp report.	3.9	\$350.00	\$1,365.00
2019.05.01	Bell & Howell	SAB	Revised Potter supplemental report (.3); videoconf. w/ Y. Kopel re same (.2)	0.5	\$1,000.00	\$500.00
2019.05.01	Bell & Howell	YZK	Email mediator re counter-demand	0.2	\$575.00	\$115.00
2019.05.01	Bell & Howell	AFS	Teleconf. with Y. Kopel and M. Potter re supplemental report (.3); revise and circulate same (1.1)	1.4	\$350.00	\$490.00
2019.05.02	Bell & Howell	YZK	Revisions to Potter Decl	1.1	\$575.00	\$632.50
2019.05.02	Bell & Howell	AFS	Teleconf. with M. Potter re supplemental report (.2); revise and circulate same (1.3).	1.5	\$350.00	\$525.00
2019.05.02	Bell & Howell	SER	Doc prep and mail to Dr. Potter	1.0	\$250.00	\$250.00
2019.05.03	Bell & Howell	YZK	Call w/ opposing counsel re scheduling etc	0.4	\$575.00	\$230.00
2019.05.03	Bell & Howell	YZK	Finalize and serve Potter report	1.6	\$575.00	\$920.00
2019.05.03	Bell & Howell	AFS	Teleconf. With Y. Kopel, K. Cassidy re deposition scope dispute (.4) and conf. with Y. Kopel re same (.2); draft J. Guindi depo notice (.3); finalize and circulate supplemental Potter report (1.3).	2.2	\$350.00	\$770.00
2019.05.03	Bell & Howell	RSR	Scheduled 5/22 depo with Veritext (.2)	0.2	\$300.00	\$60.00
2019.05.05	Bell & Howell	SAB	Teleconf. w/ Y. Kopel re deposition strategy	0.2	\$1,000.00	\$200.00
2019.05.05	Bell & Howell	YZK	Call w/ SAB re plans for upcoming depo	0.2	\$575.00	\$115.00
2019.05.06	Bell & Howell	JDA	Discuss case with Y. Kopel	0.5	\$750.00	\$375.00
2019.05.06	Bell & Howell	JDA	Attend call with opposing counsel	0.3	\$750.00	\$225.00
2019.05.06	Bell & Howell	YZK	Meeting re depo scheduling and plans for de ben esse deps & discovery dispute	0.5	\$575.00	\$287.50
2019.05.06	Bell & Howell	YZK	Depo prep	1.1	\$575.00	\$632.50
2019.05.06	Bell & Howell	YZK	Work on discovery dispute	3.1	\$575.00	\$1,782.50

DATE	MATTER	ATTY	DESCRIPTION	TIME	RATE	AMOUNT
2019.05.06	Bell & Howell	AFS	Teleconf. With Y. Kopel, defense counsel re deposition scope dispute (.6); draft letter motion re same (4.2).	4.8	\$350.00	\$1,680.00
2019.05.06	Bell & Howell	RSR	Schedule 5/9 depo (.3)	0.3	\$300.00	\$90.00
2019.05.07	Bell & Howell	JDA	Discuss case with Y. Kopel	0.4	\$750.00	\$300.00
2019.05.07	Bell & Howell	JDA	Revise letter to court re deposition dispute	0.4	\$750.00	\$300.00
2019.05.07	Bell & Howell	YZK	Work on finalizing discovery dispute	3.9	\$575.00	\$2,242.50
2019.05.07	Bell & Howell	YZK	Depo prep	4.5	\$575.00	\$2,587.50
2019.05.07	Bell & Howell	YZK	Travel to Baltimore	3.3	\$575.00	\$1,897.50
2019.05.07	Bell & Howell	AFS	Prepare for T. Foard depo and travel to Baltimore for same (6.6); draft letter motion re deposition dispute (5.3); draft T. Foard trial deposition notice (.8) .	12.7	\$350.00	\$4,445.00
2019.05.07	Bell & Howell	RSR	Followed up with Veritext re 5/9 depo location (.1)	0.1	\$300.00	\$30.00
2019.05.08	Bell & Howell	SAB	Teleconf. w/ Y. Kopel re preparation for deposition of Timothy Foard	0.7	\$1,000.00	\$700.00
2019.05.08	Bell & Howell	YZK	Depo prep (5.2); conf w/ SAB re same (.7)	5.9	\$575.00	\$3,392.50
2019.05.08	Bell & Howell	AFS	Prepare T. Foard for 5/9 deposition (5.5); review 5/8 order re deposition (.8).	6.3	\$350.00	\$2,205.00
2019.05.09	Bell & Howell	YZK	Travel back to NJ	4.2	\$575.00	\$2,415.00
2019.05.09	Bell & Howell	YZK	Defend Foard dep	5.0	\$575.00	\$2,875.00
2019.05.09	Bell & Howell	YZK	Travel from B-more to DC	2.6	\$575.00	\$1,495.00
2019.05.09	Bell & Howell	AFS	Travel to and attend T. Foard deposition (7.6); return travel from same (4.6).	11.2	\$350.00	\$3,920.00
2019.05.10	Bell & Howell	AFS	Follow up with court reporter and i2L re spelling.	0.4	\$350.00	\$140.00
2019.05.13	Bell & Howell	LTF	Call with Yitz Kopel regarding S.F. deposition and trial date.	0.3	\$1,000.00	\$300.00
2019.05.13	Bell & Howell	SAB	Analyzed Timothy Foard deposition transcript (1.8); teleconf. w/ Y. Kopel re same (.6)	2.4	\$1,000.00	\$2,400.00
2019.05.13	Bell & Howell	JDA	Attend call with court	0.2	\$750.00	\$150.00
2019.05.13	Bell & Howell	YZK	Conf w/ team re scheduling	0.5	\$575.00	\$287.50
2019.05.13	Bell & Howell	YZK	Prep for and attend teleconference and conf w/ team re same afterwards	0.9	\$575.00	\$517.50
2019.05.13	Bell & Howell	AFS	Teleconf. re trial schedule and follow up re same.	1.1	\$350.00	\$385.00
2019.05.14	Bell & Howell	SAB	Videoconf. w/ Y. Kopel & A. Shea re trial strategy and prep for Guindi deposition	0.6	\$1,000.00	\$600.00
2019.05.14	Bell & Howell	YZK	Calls to plaintiffs and experts re trial delay	2.2	\$575.00	\$1,265.00
2019.05.14	Bell & Howell	YZK	Conf w/ team re Guindi dep	0.6	\$575.00	\$345.00
2019.05.14	Bell & Howell	AFS	Videoconf. With S. Bursor and Y. Kopel re J. Guindi deposition and trial materials (.6); prep Gundi depo materials for S. Bursor (6.4).	7	\$350.00	\$2,450.00
2019.05.15	Bell & Howell	YZK	Depo prep	2.7	\$575.00	\$1,552.50
2019.05.15	Bell & Howell	YZK	Depo scheduling	0.6	\$575.00	\$345.00

DATE	MATTER	ATTY	DESCRIPTION	TIME	RATE	AMOUNT
2019.05.15	Bell & Howell	AFS	Prep Gundi depo materials for S. Bursor (6.9) and send same (.2)	7.1	\$350.00	\$2,485.00
2019.05.15	Bell & Howell	SER	Compile documentation for AFS	0.8	\$250.00	\$200.00
2019.05.17	Bell & Howell	LTF	Discussed Donahue deposition with Yitz Kopel.	0.1	\$1,000.00	\$100.00
2019.05.19	Bell & Howell	SAB	Prep for Jack Giundi deposition	1.0	\$1,000.00	\$1,000.00
2019.05.19	Bell & Howell	AFS	Prepare documents for 5/22 J. Guindi deposition (1.4).	1.4	\$350.00	\$490.00
2019.05.20	Bell & Howell	SAB	Travel MIA to NYC, prep for Giundi deposition en route (3.5); prep for Giundi deposition (1.8)	5.3	\$1,000.00	\$5,300.00
2019.05.20	Bell & Howell	YZK	Work on getting depo dates	0.4	\$575.00	\$230.00
2019.05.20	Bell & Howell	AFS	Prepare documents for 5/22 J. Guindi deposition (4.3)	4.3	\$350.00	\$1,505.00
2019.05.21	Bell & Howell	SAB	Conf w/ Y. Kopel re litigation strategy (.3); prep for Jack Guindi deposition (9.9)	10.2	\$1,000.00	\$10,200.00
2019.05.21	Bell & Howell	YZK	Depo prep	7.8	\$575.00	\$4,485.00
2019.05.21	Bell & Howell	YZK	Briefly review new expert declarations	0.3	\$575.00	\$172.50
2019.05.21	Bell & Howell	AFS	Prepare for 5/22 J. Guindi deposition.	4.2	\$350.00	\$1,470.00
2019.05.21	Bell & Howell	SER	Rebuttal expert disclosure books	2.4	\$250.00	\$600.00
2019.05.22	Bell & Howell	SAB	Prep for and attend Jack Guindi deposition	12.0	\$1,000.00	\$12,000.00
2019.05.22	Bell & Howell	YZK	Prep for depo (.9); attend depo (10.6)	11.5	\$575.00	\$6,612.50
2019.05.22	Bell & Howell	AFS	Prepare for and attend J. Guindi deposition.	11.8	\$350.00	\$4,130.00
2019.05.22	Bell & Howell	EMW	Depo prep (.2)	0.2	\$300.00	\$60.00
2019.05.22	Bell & Howell	RSR	Set up for Guindi depo (.5)	0.5	\$300.00	\$150.00
2019.05.22	Bell & Howell	SER	Assist with depositions	2.1	\$250.00	\$525.00
2019.05.23	Bell & Howell	SAB	Multiple confs. w/ team members re efforts to identify fake amazon reviews posted by Emson employees (1.2); drafted outline of assignments for Jack Guindi followup (.7); team meeting re Guindi followup and trial strategy (.6); trial prep (3.7)	6.2	\$1,000.00	\$6,200.00
2019.05.23	Bell & Howell	YZK	Process i2l invoice	0.2	\$575.00	\$115.00
2019.05.23	Bell & Howell	YZK	Review and analyze new expert declarations	0.8	\$575.00	\$460.00
2019.05.23	Bell & Howell	YZK	Conf w/ team and calendar and circulate deadlines	1.4	\$575.00	\$805.00
2019.05.23	Bell & Howell	AFS	Conf. with S. Bursor, E. Wald, and S. Riley re Amazon reviews and create plan re same (1.4); conf. with S. Bursor and Y. Kopel re J. Guindi deposition follow up (.6), and execute same (1.2).	3.2	\$350.00	\$1,120.00
2019.05.23	Bell & Howell	EMW	Meeting w. SAB re amazon reviews (.3) Began reviewing amazon reviews of BHH products (3.7)	4.0	\$300.00	\$1,200.00
2019.05.23	Bell & Howell	SER	Scans for Court Reporter and Amazon review research	3.3	\$250.00	\$825.00
2019.05.28	Bell & Howell	YZK	Collaborate on exhibit objections	0.3	\$575.00	\$172.50
2019.05.28	Bell & Howell	AFS	Update exhibit list with S. Riley (.3); save Guindi depo transcript and review same (1.2).	1.5	\$350.00	\$525.00

DATE	MATTER	ATTY	DESCRIPTION	TIME	RATE	AMOUNT
2019.05.28	Bell & Howell	EMW	Continued reviewing amazon reviews of BHH products (4.5)	4.5	\$300.00	\$1,350.00
2019.05.28	Bell & Howell	SER	Update D's exhibit list	0.6	\$250.00	\$150.00
2019.05.29	Bell & Howell	PPA	Look for fake Amazon reviews	1.5	\$315.00	\$472.50
2019.05.29	Bell & Howell	EMW	Continued reviewing amazon reviews of BHH products (3) Meeting w. interns re reviewing amazon reviews of BHH products (.3)	3.3	\$300.00	\$990.00
2019.05.30	Bell & Howell	YZK	Finalize and circulate draft objections	1.6	\$575.00	\$920.00
2019.05.30	Bell & Howell	JCD	Review Analysis	0.5	\$315.00	\$157.50
2019.05.30	Bell & Howell	JCD	Review Analysis	2.0	\$315.00	\$630.00
2019.05.30	Bell & Howell	PPA	Look for fake Amazon reviews	2.0	\$315.00	\$630.00
2019.05.31	Bell & Howell	SAB	Team meeting re trial prep (1.0)	1.0	\$1,000.00	\$1,000.00
2019.05.31	Bell & Howell	YZK	Conf w/ team re next steps and make calls re scheduling	0.9	\$575.00	\$517.50
2019.05.31	Bell & Howell	YZK	Call w/ i2L re compensation of Mankin	0.6	\$575.00	\$345.00
2019.05.31	Bell & Howell	YZK	Complete and serve objections to new exhibits	1.3	\$575.00	\$747.50
2019.05.31	Bell & Howell	AFS	Conf. with trial team re outstanding deadlines/trial prep (.9), draft revised exhibit objections (.2)	1.1	\$350.00	\$385.00
2019.06.02	Bell & Howell	SAB	Analyzed Guindi deposition transcript	1.8	\$1,000.00	\$1,800.00
2019.06.03	Bell & Howell	YZK	Call w/ C Weir re trial calendar	0.2	\$575.00	\$115.00
2019.06.03	Bell & Howell	YZK	Review, markup and analyze Guindi transcript	2.2	\$575.00	\$1,265.00
2019.06.04	Bell & Howell	SAB	Teleconf. w/ R. Raskopf re trial date conflict (.2); Guindi depo designations (1.3); videoconf. w/ Y. Kopel re litigation strategy (.5)	2.0	\$1,000.00	\$2,000.00
2019.06.04	Bell & Howell	YZK	Case management meeting with SAB	0.5	\$575.00	\$287.50
2019.06.05	Bell & Howell	SAB	Guindi deposition designations	1.5	\$1,000.00	\$1,500.00
2019.06.05	Bell & Howell	YZK	Call w/ Mankin re depo scheduling	0.3	\$575.00	\$172.50
2019.06.05	Bell & Howell	AFS	Review 2016 confidentiality agreement.	0.9	\$350.00	\$315.00
2019.06.06	Bell & Howell	YZK	Send out emails re depo scheduling	0.2	\$575.00	\$115.00
2019.06.06	Bell & Howell	YZK	Draft long email re M&C issues	0.5	\$575.00	\$287.50
2019.06.06	Bell & Howell	YZK	Draft email re exchange of jury instructions	0.2	\$575.00	\$115.00
2019.06.07	Bell & Howell	AFS	Research depo/confidentiality issue.	1.9	\$350.00	\$665.00
2019.06.10	Bell & Howell	EMW	Guindi depo designations (.5)	0.5	\$300.00	\$150.00
2019.06.11	Bell & Howell	EMW	Guindi Depo designations (.1)	0.1	\$300.00	\$30.00
2019.06.11	Bell & Howell	SER	Organize file exhibits	1.7	\$250.00	\$425.00
2019.06.12	Bell & Howell	SAB	Teleconf. w/ Y. Kopel re draft jury instructions & verdict form	0.6	\$1,000.00	\$600.00
2019.06.12	Bell & Howell	YZK	Work on jury instructions	2.5	\$575.00	\$1,437.50
2019.06.12	Bell & Howell	YZK	Prep for and attend M&C call	1.4	\$575.00	\$805.00
2019.06.12	Bell & Howell	AFS	Meet and Confer with Y. Kopel and K. Cassidy re discovery demands and Guindi transcript confidentiality. (.4)	0.4	\$350.00	\$140.00

DATE	MATTER	ATTY	DESCRIPTION	TIME	RATE	AMOUNT
2019.06.13	Bell & Howell	SAB	Multiple videoconfs. w/ Y. Kopel re settlement negotiations, trial scheduling, and draft jury instructions (.8); teleconf. w/ R. Raskopf & T. Anten re trial scheduling and settlement negotiations (.4)	1.2	\$1,000.00	\$1,200.00
2019.06.13	Bell & Howell	YZK	Work on request to charge and voir dire questions and conf. w/ SAB re same	1.9	\$575.00	\$1,092.50
2019.06.13	Bell & Howell	AFS	Research and review Pauley jury instructions.	3.2	\$350.00	\$1,120.00
2019.06.14	Bell & Howell	YZK	Finalize and serve draft of request to charge and voir dire	2.2	\$575.00	\$1,265.00
2019.06.18	Bell & Howell	SAB	Developed settlement strategy	0.7	\$1,000.00	\$700.00
2019.06.18	Bell & Howell	YZK	Work to advance disputes re confidentiality, add'l docs, and more	2.1	\$575.00	\$1,207.50
2019.06.19	Bell & Howell	SAB	Videoconf. w/ Y. Kopel re litigation and settlement strategy	0.5	\$1,000.00	\$500.00
2019.06.20	Bell & Howell	SAB	Settlement negotiations including multiple calls w/ [REDACTED] & Y. Kopel	4.2	\$1,000.00	\$4,200.00
2019.06.20	Bell & Howell	YZK	Assist w/ settlement negotiations	1.4	\$575.00	\$805.00
2019.06.21	Bell & Howell	SAB	Settlement negotiations including multiple calls w/ [REDACTED] & Y. Kopel, and drafted term sheet	6.0	\$1,000.00	\$6,000.00
2019.06.21	Bell & Howell	YZK	Follow up re discovery disputes	0.5	\$575.00	\$287.50
2019.06.21	Bell & Howell	YZK	Conf w/ team re settlement negotiations and conduct research re same	1.3	\$575.00	\$747.50
2019.06.21	Bell & Howell	AFS	Videoconf. with Y. Kopel re premotion letter (.3) and draft same (4.9).	5.2	\$350.00	\$1,820.00
2019.06.21	Bell & Howell	PPA	Research confidentiality	1.5	\$315.00	\$472.50
2019.06.21	Bell & Howell	SER	Guindi Depo Transcript	2.6	\$250.00	\$650.00
2019.06.24	Bell & Howell	SAB	Settlement negotiations	4.8	\$1,000.00	\$4,800.00
2019.06.24	Bell & Howell	YZK	Multiple calls re jury instructions, law re Guindi confidentiality	1.4	\$575.00	\$805.00
2019.06.24	Bell & Howell	YZK	Add'l settlement legal research	1.9	\$575.00	\$1,092.50
2019.06.24	Bell & Howell	AFS	Conf. with Y. Kopel re next steps, premotion letter, and upcoming deadlines.	0.3	\$350.00	\$105.00
2019.06.24	Bell & Howell	AFS	Teleconf. with Y. Kopel and defense counsel re jury instructions and Guindi depo confidentiality (.6); conf. with Y. Kopel re same (.3), and research issues related to same (3.2).	4.1	\$350.00	\$1,435.00
2019.06.24	Bell & Howell	MAG	Legal research on class action settlements	4.8	\$315.00	\$1,512.00
2019.06.24	Bell & Howell	PPA	Research on settlements	4.8	\$315.00	\$1,512.00
2019.06.24	Bell & Howell	RSR	Updated lodestar (.8)	0.8	\$300.00	\$240.00
2019.06.25	Bell & Howell	SAB	Settlement negotiations	4.3	\$1,000.00	\$4,300.00
2019.06.25	Bell & Howell	YZK	Research re settlement structures	2.5	\$575.00	\$1,437.50
2019.06.26	Bell & Howell	SAB	Settlement negotiations	5.5	\$1,000.00	\$5,500.00
2019.06.26	Bell & Howell	AFS	Draft joint letter to extend jury instruction deadline (.8), circulate same (.1), and file same (.3).	2.2	\$350.00	\$770.00
2019.06.27	Bell & Howell	SAB	Settlement negotiations	5.1	\$1,000.00	\$5,100.00
2019.06.27	Bell & Howell	YZK	Research for and revision of dispute letter	5.5	\$575.00	\$3,162.50
2019.06.27	Bell & Howell	YZK	Review and analyze errata sheet	0.3	\$575.00	\$172.50
2019.06.27	Bell & Howell	AFS	Draft letter motion re Guindi, exhibits, and rebuttal reports.	5.2	\$350.00	\$1,820.00

DATE	MATTER	ATTY	DESCRIPTION	TIME	RATE	AMOUNT
2019.06.27	Bell & Howell	JCD	Research presumption against privilege	1.0	\$315.00	\$315.00
2019.06.27	Bell & Howell	MAG	Researching caselaw on confidentiality	0.9	\$315.00	\$283.50
2019.06.28	Bell & Howell	SAB	Settlement negotiations	3.9	\$1,000.00	\$3,900.00
2019.06.28	Bell & Howell	YZK	Finalize and serve dispute letter	1.4	\$575.00	\$805.00
2019.06.28	Bell & Howell	AFS	Finalize letter motion and arrange service of same.	2.4	\$350.00	\$840.00
2019.07.01	Bell & Howell	SAB	Settlement negotiations	3.8	\$1,000.00	\$3,800.00
2019.07.01	Bell & Howell	AFS	Rec. and review Defendant's proposed jury instructions (1.2); continue researching same (7.1)	8.3	\$350.00	\$2,905.00
2019.07.02	Bell & Howell	SAB	Settlement negotiations	5.5	\$1,000.00	\$5,500.00
2019.07.02	Bell & Howell	YZK	Review Ds' draft jury instructions and conduct research re same	3.4	\$575.00	\$1,955.00
2019.07.02	Bell & Howell	YZK	Assist w/ settlement negotiations	0.7	\$575.00	\$402.50
2019.07.02	Bell & Howell	AFS	Research and draft jury instructions.	6.9	\$350.00	\$2,415.00
2019.07.02	Bell & Howell	EMW	Prepared redacted version of 2019.06.29 letter (.2) Began preparing sealing department materials for 2019.06.29 letter (.2)	0.4	\$300.00	\$120.00
2019.07.03	Bell & Howell	SAB	Settlement negotiations	5.2	\$1,000.00	\$5,200.00
2019.07.03	Bell & Howell	YZK	Research re verdict form and jury instructions	3.4	\$575.00	\$1,955.00
2019.07.03	Bell & Howell	AFS	Research and draft jury instructions (2.1); research and draft state-by-state survey of fraud jury instructions (3.3); review Defendants proposed redactions to 6/28 letter to court (.3)	5.7	\$350.00	\$1,995.00
2019.07.03	Bell & Howell	JCD	Jury Instructions by State- Knowledge	3.0	\$315.00	\$945.00
2019.07.03	Bell & Howell	EMW	Prepared documents for sealing department (.6)	0.6	\$300.00	\$180.00
2019.07.08	Bell & Howell	SAB	Settlement negotiations	2.7	\$1,000.00	\$2,700.00
2019.07.08	Bell & Howell	YZK	Revise jury instructions	3.3	\$575.00	\$1,897.50
2019.07.08	Bell & Howell	AFS	Research and draft jury instructions.	3.1	\$350.00	\$1,085.00
2019.07.08	Bell & Howell	EMW	Coordinated courier for sealed letter (.2)	0.2	\$300.00	\$60.00
2019.07.09	Bell & Howell	SAB	Settlement negotiations	2.5	\$1,000.00	\$2,500.00
2019.07.09	Bell & Howell	YZK	Research re settlement structure and make redlines to term sheet	0.9	\$575.00	\$517.50
2019.07.09	Bell & Howell	YZK	Review Ds' letter	0.2	\$575.00	\$115.00
2019.07.09	Bell & Howell	YZK	Prep for and attend M&C re jury instructions, etc.	2.1	\$575.00	\$1,207.50
2019.07.09	Bell & Howell	AFS	Research and draft objections to Defendants' proposed jury instructions (6.4); teleconf. with Y. Kopel and K. Cassidy re same (.8)	7.2	\$350.00	\$2,520.00
2019.07.09	Bell & Howell	MAG	Researching class action settlements for Maas	5.2	\$315.00	\$1,638.00
2019.07.10	Bell & Howell	SAB	Settlement negotiations	3.5	\$1,000.00	\$3,500.00
2019.07.10	Bell & Howell	YZK	Review and compare new i2L doc	0.3	\$575.00	\$172.50
2019.07.10	Bell & Howell	YZK	Work on jury instructions	0.3	\$575.00	\$172.50
2019.07.10	Bell & Howell	YZK	Assist SAB w/ settlement negotiations	0.9	\$575.00	\$517.50
2019.07.10	Bell & Howell	YZK	Conduct research on use of MJ Maas for arbitration	1.1	\$575.00	\$632.50

DATE	MATTER	ATTY	DESCRIPTION	TIME	RATE	AMOUNT
2019.07.10	Bell & Howell	AFS	Research defendants' proposed jury instruction no. 30C and confer with Y. Kopel re objection to same (8.3); review draft term sheet (.3).	8.6	\$350.00	\$3,010.00
2019.07.10	Bell & Howell	MAG	Researching re structure for claims made deals	1.3	\$315.00	\$409.50
2019.07.11	Bell & Howell	SAB	Settlement negotiations	4.4	\$1,000.00	\$4,400.00
2019.07.11	Bell & Howell	YZK	Review counsel's email re exchange of objections and respond	0.1	\$575.00	\$57.50
2019.07.11	Bell & Howell	YZK	Review new hearing date, calendar, email SAB re same	0.2	\$575.00	\$115.00
2019.07.11	Bell & Howell	YZK	Call w/ B Donahue re next week's deposition	0.3	\$575.00	\$172.50
2019.07.11	Bell & Howell	YZK	Conf w/ SAB re term sheet and status of negotiations	0.2	\$575.00	\$115.00
2019.07.11	Bell & Howell	YZK	Revise objections to Ds' jury instructions	1.7	\$575.00	\$977.50
2019.07.11	Bell & Howell	YZK	Review and redline arbitration addendum	0.6	\$575.00	\$345.00
2019.07.11	Bell & Howell	EMW	Save def letter w. exhibits to box (.2)	0.2	\$300.00	\$60.00
2019.07.12	Bell & Howell	SAB	Settlement negotiations	4.1	\$1,000.00	\$4,100.00
2019.07.12	Bell & Howell	YZK	Work on settlement negotiations and revisions to term sheet and addendum	3.8	\$575.00	\$2,185.00
2019.07.12	Bell & Howell	YZK	Finalize objections to instructions, new witness list, exhibit list, and depo designations	1.2	\$575.00	\$690.00
2019.07.12	Bell & Howell	YZK	Prep for Donahue depo	1.8	\$575.00	\$1,035.00
2019.07.12	Bell & Howell	AFS	Revise Plaintiffs' amended witness and exhibit lists and pull related exhibit files (.8); finalize Plaintiffs' jury instruction objections (3.2); rec. and review Defendants' objections and confer with Y. Kopel re same (3.4).	7.4	\$350.00	\$2,590.00
2019.07.13	Bell & Howell	AFS	Research Defendants' jury instruction objections and draft responses to same.	7.2	\$350.00	\$2,520.00
2019.07.14	Bell & Howell	JIM	Telephone call with Y. Kopel regarding proposed changes to term sheet	0.3	\$850.00	\$255.00
2019.07.14	Bell & Howell	YZK	Go through objections with AFS (1.3); conf. w/ JIM re term sheet (.3)	1.6	\$575.00	\$920.00
2019.07.14	Bell & Howell	AFS	Teleconf. with Y. Kopel re Defendants' jury instruction objections (1.3) and continue researching same (3.4).	4.7	\$350.00	\$1,645.00
2019.07.15	Bell & Howell	SAB	Settlement negotiations, finalized & signed term sheet	5.6	\$1,000.00	\$5,600.00
2019.07.15	Bell & Howell	YZK	Work on getting agreement finalized and signed	1.9	\$575.00	\$1,092.50
2019.07.15	Bell & Howell	AFS	Rec. and review executed term sheet.	0.3	\$350.00	\$105.00
2019.07.16	Bell & Howell	SAB	Drafted letter to court re settlement & conf. w/ Y. Kopel re next steps	1.9	\$1,000.00	\$1,900.00
2019.07.16	Bell & Howell	YZK	Call w/ J Hart re settlement	0.6	\$575.00	\$345.00
2019.07.16	Bell & Howell	AFS	Review and edit draft joint letter re settlement.	0.3	\$350.00	\$105.00
2019.07.16	Bell & Howell	RSR	Formatted Joint Letter re Settlement and filed same (.5)	0.5	\$300.00	\$150.00
2019.07.16	Bell & Howell	SER	Fielded claim inquiries	0.2	\$250.00	\$50.00
2019.07.17	Bell & Howell	SAB	Settlement negotiations and drafted settlement documents	3.3	\$1,000.00	\$3,300.00
2019.07.17	Bell & Howell	YZK	Begin drafting settlement agreement	3.3	\$575.00	\$1,897.50
2019.07.18	Bell & Howell	SAB	Settlement negotiations and drafted settlement documents	2.5	\$1,000.00	\$2,500.00

DATE	MATTER	ATTY	DESCRIPTION	TIME	RATE	AMOUNT
2019.07.18	Bell & Howell	YZK	Work on settlement paper drafts	2.5	\$575.00	\$1,437.50
2019.07.19	Bell & Howell	SAB	Settlement negotiations and drafted settlement documents	3.8	\$1,000.00	\$3,800.00
2019.07.19	Bell & Howell	YZK	Draft settlement docs	5.2	\$575.00	\$2,990.00
2019.07.19	Bell & Howell	SER	Compile Settlement Class Period List	1.1	\$250.00	\$275.00
2019.07.22	Bell & Howell	SAB	Settlement negotiations and drafted settlement documents	3.5	\$1,000.00	\$3,500.00
2019.07.22	Bell & Howell	YZK	Complete draft of settlement docs for circulation to SAB	4.5	\$575.00	\$2,587.50
2019.07.22	Bell & Howell	AFS	Research images for claims form and revise same accordingly.	0.4	\$350.00	\$140.00
2019.07.23	Bell & Howell	SAB	Reviewed draft settlement documents	4.8	\$1,000.00	\$4,800.00
2019.07.24	Bell & Howell	YZK	Email SAB re settlement papers	0.1	\$575.00	\$57.50
2019.07.25	Bell & Howell	SAB	Reviewed draft settlement documents and conf. w/ Y. Kopel re same	2.3	\$1,000.00	\$2,300.00
2019.07.25	Bell & Howell	YZK	Finalize edits to settlement papers and circulate to counsel	2.6	\$575.00	\$1,495.00
2019.07.30	Bell & Howell	YZK	Call to counsel re settlement agreement	0.1	\$575.00	\$57.50
2019.07.31	Bell & Howell	SAB	Settlement negotiations including teleconf. w/ [REDACTED]	0.7	\$1,000.00	\$700.00
2019.08.05	Bell & Howell	SAB	Teleconf. w/ [REDACTED] re settlement negotiations (.3); videoconf. w/ Y. Kopel re same (.3)	0.6	\$1,000.00	\$600.00
2019.08.05	Bell & Howell	YZK	Conf w/ SAB re status of settlement	0.3	\$575.00	\$172.50
2019.08.06	Bell & Howell	YZK	Work on preliminary approval	3.1	\$575.00	\$1,782.50
2019.08.06	Bell & Howell	AFS	Conf. with Y. Kopel re preliminary approval (.3), review Ayyad preliminary approval brief (1.2), begin researching and drafting preliminary approval brief (1.3).	2.8	\$350.00	\$980.00
2019.08.07	Bell & Howell	AFS	Research and draft preliminary approval motion and attendant documents.	4.2	\$350.00	\$1,470.00
2019.08.09	Bell & Howell	YZK	Calls w/ G Haber and D Kaufman re notice admin	0.6	\$575.00	\$345.00
2019.08.12	Bell & Howell	AFS	Research and draft preliminary approval motion and attendant documents.	9.1	\$350.00	\$3,185.00
2019.08.13	Bell & Howell	SAB	Settlement negotiations and revised draft settlement documents	4.3	\$1,000.00	\$4,300.00
2019.08.13	Bell & Howell	YZK	Review Ds' redlines to settlement and conf w/ SAB re same	0.7	\$575.00	\$402.50
2019.08.13	Bell & Howell	AFS	Research and draft preliminary approval motion and attendant documents.	7.2	\$350.00	\$2,520.00
2019.08.14	Bell & Howell	SAB	Settlement negotiations and revised draft settlement documents	4.5	\$1,000.00	\$4,500.00
2019.08.14	Bell & Howell	YZK	Finalize and execute settlement agreement	4.8	\$575.00	\$2,760.00
2019.08.14	Bell & Howell	AFS	Research and draft preliminary approval motion and attendant documents (5.8); review final settlement agreement and attendant documents and finalize for signing (6.4)	12.2	\$350.00	\$4,270.00
2019.08.15	Bell & Howell	SAB	Settlement negotiations and revised draft settlement documents	2.3	\$1,000.00	\$2,300.00
2019.08.15	Bell & Howell	YZK	Work on preliminary approval motion	5.4	\$575.00	\$3,105.00
2019.08.15	Bell & Howell	AFS	Research and draft preliminary approval motion and attendant documents; confer with Y. Kopel re same.	6.2	\$350.00	\$2,170.00
2019.08.15	Bell & Howell	SER	Assemble Damages table for preliminary approval motion	1.7	\$250.00	\$425.00

DATE	MATTER	ATTY	DESCRIPTION	TIME	RATE	AMOUNT
2019.08.16	Bell & Howell	SAB	Teleconf. w/ [REDACTED] re settlement negotiations (.4); teleconf. w/ Y. Kopel re same (1.0); revised draft preliminary approval brief (3.4); teleconf. w/ Judge Maas re conflicts check and scheduling fee arbitration (.2)	5.0	\$1,000.00	\$5,000.00
2019.08.16	Bell & Howell	YZK	Call w/ Michael potter	0.3	\$575.00	\$172.50
2019.08.16	Bell & Howell	YZK	Call w/ S Bueno re settlement agreement	0.5	\$575.00	\$287.50
2019.08.16	Bell & Howell	YZK	Call w/ J Hart re agreement	0.4	\$575.00	\$230.00
2019.08.16	Bell & Howell	YZK	Conf w/ opposing counsel re finalization of agreement	0.4	\$575.00	\$230.00
2019.08.16	Bell & Howell	YZK	Work on revisions to PA briefing	1.9	\$575.00	\$1,092.50
2019.08.16	Bell & Howell	AFS	Confer with Y. Kopel re preliminary approval motion (.3); revise preliminary approval motion (4.2).	4.5	\$350.00	\$1,575.00
2019.08.16	Bell & Howell	RSR	Prepared lodestar for Prelim Approval motion (.5)	0.5	\$300.00	\$150.00
2019.08.18	Bell & Howell	YZK	Further revisions to PA briefing	2.2	\$575.00	\$1,265.00
2019.08.19	Bell & Howell	SAB	Settlement negotiations	3.5	\$1,000.00	\$3,500.00
2019.08.19	Bell & Howell	YZK	Work with team to assess situation and submit extension request	0.7	\$575.00	\$402.50
2019.08.19	Bell & Howell	AML	Drafted letter re preliminary approval extension (0.5); filed letter (0.2)	0.7	\$450.00	\$315.00
2019.08.19	Bell & Howell	AFS	Review letter motion re extension of preliminary approval deadline.	0.3	\$350.00	\$105.00
2019.08.20	Bell & Howell	SAB	Settlement negotiations and revised draft preliminary approval brief	4.2	\$1,000.00	\$4,200.00
2019.08.20	Bell & Howell	AFS	Rec. and review order re letter motion.	0.1	\$350.00	\$35.00
2019.08.21	Bell & Howell	SAB	Revised draft preliminary approval brief and related documents	4.0	\$1,000.00	\$4,000.00
2019.08.22	Bell & Howell	SAB	Revised draft preliminary approval brief and related documents	3.4	\$1,000.00	\$3,400.00
2019.08.22	Bell & Howell	YZK	Assemble final agreement and circulate	0.2	\$575.00	\$115.00
2019.08.22	Bell & Howell	EMW	Organized signatures in settlement agreement (.2)	0.2	\$300.00	\$60.00
2019.08.23	Bell & Howell	SAB	Revised draft preliminary approval brief and related documents	3.2	\$1,000.00	\$3,200.00
2019.08.26	Bell & Howell	SAB	Teleconf. w/ Y. Kopel re prelim approval motion (.2); revised draft prelim approval documents (1.9)	2.1	\$1,000.00	\$2,100.00
2019.08.26	Bell & Howell	YZK	Conf w/ SAB re draft preliminary approval papers	0.2	\$575.00	\$115.00
2019.08.26	Bell & Howell	YZK	Collect and send KCC docs to defense counsel	0.4	\$575.00	\$230.00
2019.08.27	Bell & Howell	SAB	Revised draft preliminary approval brief and related documents	1.4	\$1,000.00	\$1,400.00
2019.08.27	Bell & Howell	YZK	Finalize drafts of preliminary approval papers	1.6	\$575.00	\$920.00
2019.08.27	Bell & Howell	YZK	Call J Maas's clerk	0.3	\$575.00	\$172.50
2019.08.28	Bell & Howell	SAB	Revised draft preliminary approval brief and related documents	3.5	\$1,000.00	\$3,500.00
2019.08.28	Bell & Howell	YZK	Review redlines to PA brief and conf w/ /SAB re same	0.9	\$575.00	\$517.50
2019.08.28	Bell & Howell	AFS	Review S. Bursor preliminary approval redlines and proofread motion.	2.1	\$350.00	\$735.00
2019.08.29	Bell & Howell	AFS	Proofread motion and declaration.	1.8	\$350.00	\$630.00
2019.08.30	Bell & Howell	YZK	Revisions to PA papers	1.5	\$575.00	\$862.50
2019.08.30	Bell & Howell	AFS	Finalize and circulate preliminary approval motion and declaration edits (.9); teleconf. with Y. Kopel re same (.2).	1.1	\$350.00	\$385.00

DATE	MATTER	ATTY	DESCRIPTION	TIME	RATE	AMOUNT
2019.08.30	Bell & Howell	RSR	Updated Iodestar for prelim approval motion (.3)	0.3	\$300.00	\$90.00
2019.09.02	Bell & Howell	RSR	Prepared tables for Prelim Approval brief (.5)	0.5	\$300.00	\$150.00
2019.09.03	Bell & Howell	YZK	Finalize and file PA papers	4.5	\$575.00	\$2,587.50
2019.09.03	Bell & Howell	AFS	Finalize and assist with filing of preliminary approval motion.	3.7	\$350.00	\$1,295.00
2019.09.03	Bell & Howell	EMW	Saved and sent courtesy copy of prelim approval papers (.8)	0.8	\$300.00	\$240.00
2019.09.04	Bell & Howell	YZK	Call Law360 to correct mistake re deal in this case	0.3	\$575.00	\$172.50
2019.09.10	Bell & Howell	YZK	VM to J Maas office	0.1	\$575.00	\$57.50
2019.09.11	Bell & Howell	YZK	Emails with SD Ohio local counsel re fee arbitration	0.2	\$575.00	\$115.00
2019.09.12	Bell & Howell	YZK	VMs to Maas's office	0.2	\$575.00	\$115.00
2019.09.13	Bell & Howell	YZK	Brief call and emails w/ J Maas's office	0.2	\$575.00	\$115.00
2019.09.17	Bell & Howell	YZK	Call Maas's office to confirm dates	0.3	\$575.00	\$172.50
2019.10.04	Bell & Howell	SAB	Conf. w/ Y. Kopel re prep for preliminary approval telephonic hearing	0.2	\$1,000.00	\$200.00
2019.10.04	Bell & Howell	YZK	Call w/ SAB to discuss hearing	0.2	\$575.00	\$115.00
2019.10.04	Bell & Howell	EMW	Prelim approval teleconf. Prep (1)	1.0	\$300.00	\$300.00
2019.10.07	Bell & Howell	SAB	Prep for and attend teleconf. w/ Judge Pauley re preliminary approval (1.7); teleconf. w/ [REDACTED] re same (.2); multiple videoconfs. w/ Y. Kopel re same (.4)	2.3	\$1,000.00	\$2,300.00
2019.10.07	Bell & Howell	YZK	Prep for and attend teleconference (1.1); work on revised portions of claims form and long form (.5); look into revisions for PO (.8)	2.4	\$575.00	\$1,380.00
2019.10.07	Bell & Howell	RSR	Ordered transcript from teleconf. (.1)	0.1	\$300.00	\$30.00
2019.10.08	Bell & Howell	YZK	Conduct research re availability of proof of purchase info	1.7	\$575.00	\$977.50
2019.10.10	Bell & Howell	SAB	Multiple videoconfs. w/ Y. Kopel re revising proposed prelim approval order and revising claim form, etc. (1.2); revised draft claim form, draft notice, and draft prelim approval order (3.1)	4.3	\$1,000.00	\$4,300.00
2019.10.10	Bell & Howell	YZK	Work on new submissions to court (1.3); work on coordinating cafa notice (1.4)	2.7	\$575.00	\$1,552.50
2019.10.10	Bell & Howell	MSR	Confer w/ YZK re: research assignment (0.2); research re: quick pay (3.1); confer re: letter (0.5)	3.8	\$325.00	\$1,235.00
2019.10.11	Bell & Howell	SAB	Revised draft preliminary approval order and related matters	1.8	\$1,000.00	\$1,800.00
2019.10.11	Bell & Howell	YZK	Work w/ Ds to get their CAFA notice completed	1.1	\$575.00	\$632.50
2019.10.11	Bell & Howell	YZK	Research for quick pay letter	1.8	\$575.00	\$1,035.00
2019.10.13	Bell & Howell	YZK	Work on quick pay letter	1.4	\$575.00	\$805.00
2019.10.14	Bell & Howell	SAB	Attend to communications re CAFA compliance and communications with claims administrator	1.4	\$1,000.00	\$1,400.00
2019.10.16	Bell & Howell	YZK	Draft quick pay letter	2.6	\$575.00	\$1,495.00
2019.10.16	Bell & Howell	YZK	Finalize CAFA work w/ opposing counsel	0.7	\$575.00	\$402.50
2019.10.17	Bell & Howell	YZK	Review and revise materials to be submitted and conf w/ SAB re same	0.6	\$575.00	\$345.00

DATE	MATTER	ATTY	DESCRIPTION	TIME	RATE	AMOUNT
2019.10.18	Bell & Howell	SAB	Videoconf. w/ Y. Kopel re revised preliminary approval order	0.2	\$1,000.00	\$200.00
2019.10.18	Bell & Howell	YZK	Prep for and attend meeting w/ SAB re new materials	0.3	\$575.00	\$172.50
2019.10.21	Bell & Howell	SAB	Revised draft letter to Judge Pauley re revisions to proposed preliminary approval order (1.3); revised draft preliminary approval order (.4); multiple teleconfs. w/ Y. Kopel re same (.4)	2.1	\$1,000.00	\$2,100.00
2019.10.21	Bell & Howell	YZK	Finalize and file letter with updated materials	2.7	\$575.00	\$1,552.50
2019.10.21	Bell & Howell	SER	Courtesy Copy for Judge Pauley	0.4	\$250.00	\$100.00
2019.10.24	Bell & Howell	SAB	Teleconf. w/ [REDACTED] re settlement administration	0.2	\$1,000.00	\$200.00
2019.11.05	Bell & Howell	YZK	Draft emails to both plaintiffs	0.6	\$575.00	\$345.00
2019.11.06	Bell & Howell	YZK	Email response to S Bueno	0.3	\$575.00	\$172.50
2019.11.15	Bell & Howell	YZK	Review arbitration forms and call SAB to ask about same	0.4	\$575.00	\$230.00
2019.11.18	Bell & Howell	YZK	Call w/ F Maas's clerk re arbitration scheduling	0.2	\$575.00	\$115.00
2019.12.13	Bell & Howell	YZK	Email SAB re case status	0.1	\$575.00	\$57.50
2020.01.03	Bell & Howell	YZK	Left VM at Maas's office	0.1	\$575.00	\$57.50
2020.01.06	Bell & Howell	YZK	Call w/ Maas's office	0.3	\$575.00	\$172.50
2020.01.17	Bell & Howell	YZK	Review court decisionn and conf w/ colleagues re same	0.5	\$575.00	\$287.50
2020.01.17	Bell & Howell	AFS	Review Court's order re preliminary approval.	0.6	\$350.00	\$210.00
2020.01.17	Bell & Howell	MSR	Review preliminary approval order	0.2	\$325.00	\$65.00
2020.01.21	Bell & Howell	SAB	Analyzed order denying preliminary approval and multiple teleconfs. w/ defense counsel re settlement negotiations	2.4	\$1,000.00	\$2,400.00
2020.01.23	Bell & Howell	YZK	Made initial redlines to settlement and circulate	1.2	\$575.00	\$690.00
2020.01.23	Bell & Howell	RSR	Updated lodestar (.7)	0.7	\$300.00	\$210.00
2020.01.24	Bell & Howell	SAB	Settlement negotiations	3.3	\$1,000.00	\$3,300.00
2020.01.25	Bell & Howell	SAB	Settlement negotiations and revised settlement documents	3.8	\$1,000.00	\$3,800.00
2020.01.26	Bell & Howell	SAB	Settlement negotiations and revised settlement documents	3.1	\$1,000.00	\$3,100.00
2020.01.27	Bell & Howell	SAB	Settlement negotiations and revised settlement documents	2.8	\$1,000.00	\$2,800.00
2020.01.27	Bell & Howell	YZK	Call J Maas's office to inform re court's decision	0.2	\$575.00	\$115.00
2020.01.27	Bell & Howell	YZK	Work on new settlement agreement & negotiations	3.4	\$575.00	\$1,955.00
2020.01.27	Bell & Howell	YZK	Prep for and conf w/ SAB re next steps	0.5	\$575.00	\$287.50
2020.01.28	Bell & Howell	SAB	Settlement negotiations	2.8	\$1,000.00	\$2,800.00
2020.01.29	Bell & Howell	SAB	Settlement negotiations	4.1	\$1,000.00	\$4,100.00
2020.01.29	Bell & Howell	YZK	Work on revisions to settlement agreement	3.6	\$575.00	\$2,070.00
2020.01.30	Bell & Howell	YZK	Calls w/ Plaintiffs re settlement agreement	1.4	\$575.00	\$805.00
2020.01.30	Bell & Howell	YZK	Finalize and circulate settlement agreement	2.9	\$575.00	\$1,667.50
2020.01.31	Bell & Howell	SAB	Drafted letter re renewed prelim approval motion (.5); videoconf. w/ Y. Kopel re draft prelim approval order (.5)	1.0	\$1,000.00	\$1,000.00

DATE	MATTER	ATTY	DESCRIPTION	TIME	RATE	AMOUNT
2020.01.31	Bell & Howell	YZK	Conf w/ J Hart re settlement	0.4	\$575.00	\$230.00
2020.01.31	Bell & Howell	YZK	Work on PA letter (.7); call w SAB re same (.5)	1.2	\$575.00	\$690.00
2020.02.03	Bell & Howell	YZK	Inquire re status of signatures	0.2	\$575.00	\$115.00
2020.02.04	Bell & Howell	SAB	Settlement negotiations and revised draft settlement documents	3.0	\$1,000.00	\$3,000.00
2020.02.05	Bell & Howell	SAB	Revised draft letter to Judge Pauley re renewed motion for preliminary approval (1.4); email to Y. Kopel re same (.2); teleconf. w/ D's counsel re next steps (.8)	2.4	\$1,000.00	\$2,400.00
2020.02.05	Bell & Howell	YZK	Review court's order, save to box and calendar date	0.1	\$575.00	\$57.50
2020.02.05	Bell & Howell	YZK	Review draft CAFA notice and applicable laws	0.8	\$575.00	\$460.00
2020.02.05	Bell & Howell	YZK	Finalize and file PA letter	0.5	\$575.00	\$287.50
2020.02.05	Bell & Howell	YZK	Work on finalizing argreement and circulate	0.6	\$575.00	\$345.00
2020.02.05	Bell & Howell	EMW	Sent out courtesy copy of letter re renewal of prelim approval (.3)	0.3	\$300.00	\$90.00
2020.02.06	Bell & Howell	YZK	Conf w/ SAB to confirm availability for PA call	0.2	\$575.00	\$115.00
2020.02.07	Bell & Howell	SAB	Prep for call w/ J. Pauley re preliminary approval	1.4	\$1,000.00	\$1,400.00
2020.02.10	Bell & Howell	SAB	Prep for Feb 11 teleconf	1.9	\$1,000.00	\$1,900.00
2020.02.10	Bell & Howell	YZK	Draft letter with dial-in info and file on ecf	0.3	\$575.00	\$172.50
2020.02.11	Bell & Howell	SAB	Prep for and attend Feb 11 teleconf. (1.6); revised draft preliminary approval order (1.3); multiple videoconfs. w/ Y. Kopel re same (.7)	3.6	\$1,000.00	\$3,600.00
2020.02.11	Bell & Howell	YZK	Work on updated proposed order	2.1	\$575.00	\$1,207.50
2020.02.11	Bell & Howell	YZK	Prep for and attend teleconference	0.6	\$575.00	\$345.00
2020.02.12	Bell & Howell	YZK	Review preliminary approval order	0.3	\$575.00	\$172.50
2020.02.12	Bell & Howell	SER	Calendar final approval dates	0.5	\$250.00	\$125.00
2020.02.13	Bell & Howell	SAB	Analyzed preliminary approval order (1.1); conf. w/ Y. Kopel re settlement administration (.5)	1.6	\$1,000.00	\$1,600.00
2020.02.13	Bell & Howell	YZK	Conf w/ SAB re notice and claims process	0.4	\$575.00	\$230.00
2020.02.17	Bell & Howell	YZK	Prep for and attend call w/ claims administrator (.7); take further action gathering necessary docs for notice (.5)	1.2	\$575.00	\$690.00
2020.02.18	Bell & Howell	YZK	Email to KCC enumerating docs needed for notice	0.2	\$575.00	\$115.00
2020.02.18	Bell & Howell	SER	Take calls from class members	0.1	\$250.00	\$25.00
2020.02.19	Bell & Howell	YZK	Call w/ KCC re class member info	0.3	\$575.00	\$172.50
2020.02.21	Bell & Howell	NJD	Confer with YZK about notice website issues	0.4	\$600.00	\$240.00
2020.02.21	Bell & Howell	YZK	Follow up w/ KCC re notice docs (.1); email DGS re forms of notice and banner ads (.1); download materials from KCC and transfer same to DGS (.3)	0.5	\$575.00	\$287.50
2020.02.24	Bell & Howell	SAB	Multiple teleconfs. w/ Y. Kopel & DSG re settlement administration	1.3	\$1,000.00	\$1,300.00
2020.02.25	Bell & Howell	SER	Answer calls from affected class members	0.2	\$250.00	\$50.00
2020.02.26	Bell & Howell	YZK	Work on settlement administration and assisting claims admin	0.6	\$575.00	\$345.00
2020.02.27	Bell & Howell	NJD	Updated notice website with nameservers of claims admin	0.4	\$600.00	\$240.00

DATE	MATTER	ATTY	DESCRIPTION	TIME	RATE	AMOUNT
2020.02.27	Bell & Howell	YZK	Gather materials for claims admin and conf internally re setting up website	0.8	\$575.00	\$460.00
2020.02.28	Bell & Howell	YZK	Updates to claims form (1.3); research and email settlement admin re varieties of repellers (.6); deal with setting up settlement website (.2)	2.1	\$575.00	\$1,207.50
2020.02.28	Bell & Howell	AFS	Conf. with Y. Kopel re notice form.	0.3	\$350.00	\$105.00
2020.02.28	Bell & Howell	SER	Attend to calls from class members	0.4	\$250.00	\$100.00
2020.03.02	Bell & Howell	SER	Answer calls from affected class members	2.1	\$250.00	\$525.00
2020.03.03	Bell & Howell	YZK	Review drafts of ads from admin and review ads used from other firm settlements	1.2	\$575.00	\$690.00
2020.03.04	Bell & Howell	YZK	Work on revisions to banner ads	2.6	\$575.00	\$1,495.00
2020.03.04	Bell & Howell	SER	Draft DSG notice materials	3.6	\$250.00	\$900.00
2020.03.05	Bell & Howell	YZK	Work with admin on case website	0.4	\$575.00	\$230.00
2020.03.10	Bell & Howell	YZK	Review website and notice materials/ test claim mechanism (1.1); research re same (.4); conf w/ admin re same (.3)	1.8	\$575.00	\$1,035.00
2020.03.13	Bell & Howell	YZK	Final review of website and notice docs and email admin re same	1.1	\$575.00	\$632.50
2020.03.16	Bell & Howell	YZK	Briefly review notice website and materials now that campaign has begun	0.2	\$575.00	\$115.00
2020.03.16	Bell & Howell	AEL	Emailed Constance Hard re Bell & Howell (.1)	0.1	\$250.00	\$25.00
2020.03.18	Bell & Howell	YZK	Calls w/ NJD, LTF and SAB re methods of reminding consumers to file claims	1.3	\$575.00	\$747.50
2020.03.18	Bell & Howell	YZK	Training meeting with support staff for fielding calls from class members	0.3	\$575.00	\$172.50
2020.03.18	Bell & Howell	EMW	Meeting w. YZK SER and AEL re how to deal with callers re settlement (.6)	0.6	\$300.00	\$180.00
2020.03.18	Bell & Howell	AEL	Attended video call with Yitz, Steven and Erin re BHH updates and follow up emails (.2)	0.2	\$250.00	\$50.00
2020.03.18	Bell & Howell	AEL	Spoke with Carl Pille and sent follow up email about how to file a online claim for B&H (.3)	0.3	\$250.00	\$75.00
2020.03.18	Bell & Howell	SER	Confer with YZK (.4), confer with team (.2), email notice to class members (.3)	0.9	\$250.00	\$225.00
2020.03.24	Bell & Howell	YZK	Emails with settlement admin re update	0.2	\$575.00	\$115.00
2020.03.25	Bell & Howell	SAB	Multiple teleconfs. re settlement administration	3.2	\$1,000.00	\$3,200.00
2020.03.25	Bell & Howell	YZK	Review new report (.3); emails w/ admin re report (.3); internal calls re next steps (.5); call w/ defense counsel re same (.4); research re next steps and ways to ensure good claims rate (.9); call w/ TCA re same (.3); review email and TCA and forward (.1)	2.8	\$575.00	\$1,610.00
2020.03.26	Bell & Howell	SAB	Work on settlement administration and claims process, including multiple teleconfs. Re same	2.5	\$1,000.00	\$2,500.00
2020.03.26	Bell & Howell	YZK	Email correspondence w/ plaintiff (.5); update call w/ SAB (.4)	0.9	\$575.00	\$517.50
2020.03.27	Bell & Howell	SAB	Continue work on settlement administration and claims process, including multiple teleconfs. Re same	2.9	\$1,000.00	\$2,900.00
2020.03.31	Bell & Howell	YZK	Review and analyze admin report	0.2	\$575.00	\$115.00
2020.04.01	Bell & Howell	SAB	Attend to settlement administration	2.2	\$1,000.00	\$2,200.00

DATE	MATTER	ATTY	DESCRIPTION	TIME	RATE	AMOUNT
2020.04.02	Bell & Howell	SAB	Attend to settlement administration and multiple teleconfs. w/ DSG concerning class notice	1.8	\$1,000.00	\$1,800.00
2020.04.03	Bell & Howell	YZK	Touchbase with SAB re administrative progress	0.3	\$575.00	\$172.50
2020.04.07	Bell & Howell	YZK	Review newest reports and conf w/ SAB re same	0.7	\$575.00	\$402.50
2020.04.07	Bell & Howell	AEL	Spoke to class member re Bell and Howell (.2)	0.2	\$250.00	\$50.00
2020.04.10	Bell & Howell	YZK	Prep for and attend call w/ claims admin re postcards and top class actions	0.5	\$575.00	\$287.50
2020.04.15	Bell & Howell	SAB	Videoconf. w/ Y. Kopel re settlement administration	0.5	\$1,000.00	\$500.00
2020.04.15	Bell & Howell	YZK	Review new admin report (.2); prep for and attend conference call re same (.3); conf w/ SAB re same (.3)	0.8	\$575.00	\$460.00
2020.04.15	Bell & Howell	AEL	Corresponded via email w/ two bell and howell class members (.1)	0.1	\$250.00	\$25.00
2020.04.20	Bell & Howell	AEL	Corresponded to BHH class member via email (.1)	0.1	\$250.00	\$25.00
2020.04.23	Bell & Howell	YZK	Review new numbers and emails w/ admin re same	0.4	\$575.00	\$230.00
2020.04.29	Bell & Howell	YZK	Review and analyze new admin report	0.2	\$575.00	\$115.00
2020.04.30	Bell & Howell	AEL	Forward BHH inquiry about claims form to Amy (.1)	0.1	\$250.00	\$25.00
2020.05.09	Bell & Howell	SAB	Teleconf. w/ [REDACTED] re settlement administration and related matters	1.2	\$1,000.00	\$1,200.00
2020.05.13	Bell & Howell	SAB	Review report from claims administrator & corresp w/ Y. Kopel re same	1.1	\$1,000.00	\$1,100.00
2020.05.13	Bell & Howell	YZK	Review admin report and conf w/ SAB re same	0.9	\$575.00	\$517.50
2020.05.15	Bell & Howell	JIM	Confer with Y. Kopel about status of settlement administration and next steps regarding same	0.5	\$850.00	\$425.00
2020.05.21	Bell & Howell	YZK	Review and analyze new admin report	0.2	\$575.00	\$115.00